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County 
Revenue 
To Rise 

By BOB EICHENLAUB 
Greene County Editor 

WAYNESBURG - Greene 
County's allocation of federal 
revenue sharing funds wlll be 
Increased by $26,125 during 
the 198Hl2 fiscal year which 
begins Nov. L 

The Increase to $392,125 ls 
primarily the result of new 
population figures injected 
into the allocation formula 
with completion of the 1980 
census count. The county is 
now credited with a population 
of 40,355 as compared with the 
1970 census count of 36,090 
which had been used in calcu­
lating previous allocations. 

Other factors used In the 
formula are county per capita 
income ($4 ,340) , adjusted 
county tax revenues 
( $1 ,461,924) and in ­
tergovernmental transfers 
($2,860,279). 

Chief Clerk Herbert Cox, 
who reported on the Increase 
at Thursday's meeting of the 
Greene County com· 
missioners, said the additional 
revenue will not be realized 
until January 1982, when the 
first quarterly payment of the 
198Hl2 allocation is received. 
The 1980-81 allocation totaled 
$366,000. 

In action at their meeting, 
the commissioners agreed to 
employ Maxine Hewitt of 
Graysville as groundskeeper 
for the small roadside county 
park at Graysville. She will 
receive ~ a month. 

Allen Hughes, director of 
the Department of Parks and 
Recreation, said the park is 
less than a half acre in size 
and has a picnic table and 
grill . 

?.t-.; r>.:nny Morrl Orndoll' 
of Waynesburg R.D.4 was ap• 
pointed to the advisory board 
of Greene County Children 
and Youth Services to fill a 
vacancy on the 14-member 
board. Her appointment was 
recommended by Rupert 
Eder, executive director. 

On recommendation of 
Hughes, Carol McVay of 
Holbrook, Erschel Yoders of 
Rices Landing and Gary Cole 
of Bobtown were re-appointed 
to the advisory board of the 
Department of Parks and Rec­
reation. 

A resolution was adopted 
proclaiming June as " United 
Way Thanks for Giving 
Month." During the month, 
United Way of Southwestern 
Pennsylvania, which encom­
passes Allegheny, Greene and 
Washington Counties, will con· 
duct programs to express Its 
appreciation to the thousands 
of individuals and companies 
who contributed to the $27 mil­
lion the agency raised last 
year to help finance 100 agen­
cies which provide nearly 200 
varied human services. 

County Commissioner Rich­
ard Cowan, who is a member 
of the board of United Way of 
Greene County, noted that 
Greene County residents and 
companies have contributed 
$150,000 since the local agency 
was founded two years ago, 
with the money being dis­
tributed to 18 social service 
agencies which operate in the 
county. 

Just Joking Observer-Reporter Photo 

Glenn A. Arnold (seated) , veteran Waynesburg realtor, auc­
tioneer and cattleman, was the subject of a lot of kidding, 
including some from master of ceremonies Stephen McCahn, 
during the "Great Glenn Arnold Roast" Sunday evening at the 
Waynesburg Moose Lodge. More than 300 persons attended to 
affair to have fun with their friend and at the same time benefit 
the Try-Again Homes program for children. 

Franklin Twp. Sewer Authority 
Approves 5-Year Agreement 

WAYNESBURG - The 
Franklin Township Sewer Au­
thority Tuesday night re­
considered a proposed long­
term sewage agreement with 
Waynesburg Borough, Frank­
lin Township and Mountain­
view Gardens and, instead of a 
40-year agreement, voted to 
offer all three parties a 5-year 
contract with options to renew 
on a year-to-year basis afler 
five years. 

The complicated issue 
came about when the borough 
was ordered by the Depart• 
ment of Envirnomental Re­
sourses (DER l not to accept 
any further sewer taps be­
cause the borough facility was 
over capacity. 

Mountalnview, a $4 million 
housing project , appeared to 
be stalled because of the or­
der . 

However, a plan was ad• 

vanced whereby the housing 
developer would be permitted 
to construct a cross-over valve 
between the borough sewer 
line and the township sewer 
line and a volume of sewage 
comparable to the Mountain• 
view output would be diverted 
into the township line for 
treatment at the township 
plant. 

Although the Franklin 
Township supervisors ap­
proved the proposed 40-year 
agreement la s t month , 
Waynesburg Borough and 
Mountainview refused to sign 
saying the term was too long. 

Also, after reviewing the 
proposed agreement, the DER 
suggested a shorter term, pos­
sibly one of live years . The 
DER, under terms of the new 
agreement, would have the 
right to approve the discon­
nection of the cross-over ar• 

rangcment in the future. 
In other action, the author­

ity voted to pay W.L. Stewart 
$4 ,448.93 to settle a long-stand­
ing dispute over alleged dam­
ages caused during sewer con­
struction near his car agency 
in Morrisville. 

A d1scuss1on was held about 
a damage claim from another 
Mo r ri sv ille res ident who 
maintains he should be paid 
$6,000 for the alleged destruc­
tion of three maple trees on his 
property. The authority's con• 
struction committee and man­
ager were directed lo inspect 
the properl y and report at the 
next meeting. 

The authority sohc1tor was 
directed to begin legal action 
against seven property own­
ers who have failed to tap mto 
the new sewer_ Charges of 
viola ting a township or ­
dinance will be brought before 
a magistrate. 

Carmichaels Retains Police 
CARMICHAELS - Carmi­

chaels Borough Council met in 
a lengthy session Monday 
night including two executive 
sessions to discuss the police 
force and borough building 
plans. 

The first executive session 

Votes To Be Recounted 
In Jefferson Township 

was held prior to the police 
committee report. Aller dis­
cussion on a suggestion that a 
full-time police officer be laid 
off, and a meter person be 
employed Instead to conserve 
funds, council agreed to retain 
Its full-lime police force . The 
police committee is to meet 
and make cuts in police de­
partment expenses where pos­
sible to meet the budget and 
still retain the entire force. 

Chief Robert Arameish re­
ported after the meeting that 
the accident rate in the 
borough has decreased signifi­
cantly with the implementa­
tion of the Excessive Speed 
Prevention Device. He said 
the device wlll be used more 
extensively during the sum­
mer months. Youths are also 
reminded that the to p.m. 
curfew for those under 18 is 
being enforced. 

plan for a new borough build­
Ing which would cost approx­
imately $60,000. The proposed 
plan is for a building 54 by 36 
feet and would use gas hot 
water heat. Restrictions on 
the deed to the old borough 
building property were dis• 
cussed in executive session 
and then council authorized its 
solicitor Robert Berryman to 
proceed with action lo acquire 
a "quiet" title to the property. 

Anniversary 
Celebration 

WAYNESBURG - Ballot 
boxes in three of the four 
precincts in Jefferson Town­
ship will be opened for a re­
count of votes cast for the 
office of township tax collec­
tor. 

Reg is te red voters in 
precincts 1, 2 and 3 filed a 
petition for the recount in 
Greene County Court Tuesday 
on behalf of John R. Mosier, 
who lost the Democratic nomi­
nation to William D. Virgin by 
one vote, 322-321. 

The court set Monday, June 
22, as the date for opening the 
boxes and appointed Henry A. 
Young and George Albert of 
Way nes burg to a&-si s l 
Prothonotary Charles Hogue 

in making the new count. 
The petitions were filed by 

Thomas A. O'Brochta, Betty 
O'Brochta and Earl King in 
Precinct No. I , where Virgin 
won 139 to 83 ; by Frances B. 
Szallay, John J _ Blublleo and 
Irene P _ Rollison in Precinct 
No. 2, where Mosler won 65-25. 
and by Linda J . Mosier, Ann 
E. Latta and Erma Mosier in 
Precinct No. 3, where Mosier 
won 147 to 106. 

The request did not Include 
Precinct No. 4, where Virgin 
won 53-26. 

The petitioners posted $50 
for each of the three ballot 
boxes to be opened, with the 
bond being subject to for­
feiture if substantial error is 
not found . 

- - r ------

At the May meeting council 
had voted to remove the police 
portable radio unit from the 
home of Mayor Paul Connor. 
It was noted that the county 
police communications board 
has that power and it will 
discuss the situation at Its 
meeting June 11 in Waynes­
burg. 

Building committee chair• 
man Chris Watson displayed a 

GRAYSVILLE - This com­
munity will observe the 50th 
anniversary of the founding of 
the volunteer fire company 
with several activities includ­
ing a parade on Saturday , 
June 27. 

The lire department was 
formed in 1931. Two charter 
members Frank Ealy and 
Oakle Staggers remain active 
with the department and will 
be recognized. 

Festivities will begin at 
noon and the parade will start 
al 2 p.m. Units are still wel­
come to parti cipate and 
should call 4284332 or 428--3628. 

A dance will be held In the 
lirehall Saturday evening. 

-···-,.--

Mail Theft Charges Made 
WAYNESBURG - A 13· 

year-old Waynesburg boy has 
been charged with stealing 
mall from the' loading dock at 
the Waynesburg post office. 

Postal Inspector G. C. 
Smith said approximately 400 
pieces of first class mail were 
taken between May 20 and 
May 23. As far as can be 
determined most of the mail 
has been recovered and either 
has been or will be delivered 
to addressees. 

A petition charging the 
youth with mail then was filed 
Wednesday with Greene 
County juvenile authorities, 
Smith said. 

The suspect was appre­
hended at 5:25 a.m. Saturday, 
May 23, by Waynesburg 
Borough Patrolmen Terry 
Livingston and James 
Gregan, who staked out the 
postal dock at the request of 
officials at the post office. 

They said they saw the youth, 
who had a newspaper delivery 
route , rummage through one 
of the mail bags and then run 
toward the south side. When 
they picked him up he had 55 
pieces of mail in his news­
paper bag, 

The balance of the stolen 
mail, which had been taken 
the previous two mornings, 
was subsequently found hid­
den in the entrance to the 
vacant South Ward school 
building. 

Waynesburg Postmaster 
Robert Renko said virtually 
all of the mail was for destina­
tions outside Waynesburg, 
with most of it addressed to 
people served through the 
Greensboro post office. He 
said approximately 75 or 80 of 
the letters had been opened. 

Renko said the mail came 
from sacks delivered to the 
post office about 4 a.m. which 

were Jen on the dock for trans­
fer to another truck which de­
livers the mail to other post 
offices. He said people were 
working in the post office and 
were on and off the dock dur­
ing the time the boy got into 
the bags. 

Livingston said borough po­
lice were asked to conduct the 
slake out by Howard Widdup, 
who is superintendent of pos• 
tal operations at the post of­
fice. 

" He had noticed the boy 
hanging around the dock early 
in the morning and had seen 
him checking mail boxes at 
homes where he did not de­
liver a newspaper , and 
suspected that mail have been 
taken from the bags on the 
dock," he said. 

Smith said he could give no 
motive for the boy's actions 
and said he is still checking 

into the report that the youth 
may have stolen mail from 
front porch mailboxes. "The 
investigation is continuing," 
he said . 

Tentative 
Budget Is 
Approved 
By THELMA CALLAGHAN 

Staff Writer 
CARMICHAELS - A ten• 

tative operating budget for the 
1981-82 school year in the 
amount of $3,301 ,532 was 
adopted by the Carmichaels 
Area School Board Thursday 
night by a vote of eight to one. 
The negative vole was cast by 
Joseph Baker. 

Sentences Guilty Pleaders 
The real estate tax millage 

will be set at the board 's June 
meeting when the budget is 
scheduled for final adoption. 

WAYNESBURG - Defen­
dants in two criminal cases 
who entered guilty pleas were 
sentenced in Greene County 
Court Monday. 

Charles Patrick Wright Jr., 
20, Canton, Ohio, was fined 
$100 and sentenced to serve 
from three months to 12 
months in the Greene County 
jail, with the jail sentence to 
run concurrently with a 
sentence imposed in Washing­
ton County. 

Storm Causes 
Power Outages 

w A YNESBURG - Resi­
dents of several sections of 
Greene County were without 
electrical power for varying 
periods of time as the result of 
a severe storm whi; .-h hit the 
county about 6 p. m. Sa\urday -

Frank Bogan, superinten­
dent of the Jefferson District, 
West Penn Power Co., said 
outages affected the Crucible , 
Ruff Creek, West Waynesburg 
and Deer Lick areas of the 
county. Approximately 915 
customers had no electricity 
at the height of the trouble. 

Almost all of the problems 
were the result of lightning 
hitting line insulators, he said. 
Repair crews had cleaned up 
the trouble by 9 p.m. and were 
starting to go home when an­
other storm caused additional 
problems which kept them on 
the job most of the night Only 
a few customers were affected 
the second time, however, as 
those problems primarily in­
volved 25 ,000-volt trans­
mission lines. 

Wright was one of three 
men charged with burglariz­
ing a house in Richhill Town­
ship on Feb. 19, 1981. 

Leroy Leonard, 36, Waynes­
burg R.O.6, who was charged 
with driving while intoxicated, 
was fined $400 and sentenced 
lo serve from four months to 
12 months in the county jail. 
He will serve the sentence on 
weekends. 

In other court action Mon­
day, Larry Paugh and Gary L. 
Roy were brought to trial on 
charges of aggravated as­
sault, with the charge stem­
ming from a fight at the Car­
michaels Moos11 Lodge on 
Nov_ 23, 1980. 

Paugh has been charged 
with assaulting Anthony 
Lingis and Clarence Rankin, 
while Roy is charged with at­
tacking Peter Devecka with a 

pool cue. 
WAYNESBURG - A 

Greene County Criminal Court 
jury Thursday found Daniel 
Mansberry, 27, Nemacolin , 
guilty of burglarizing the state 
liquor store in Carmichaels. 

Mansberry was arrested in 
Carmichaels an hour after the 
store was broken into on May 
8, 1980, because his clothing 
and build matched descrip­
tions given to police by wit· 
nesses wpo saw the burglar 
leaving the store. A case of 
whiskey and five loose fifths of 
whiskey were found in an alley 
near the store. 

Mansberry denied commit· 
ting the burglary, contending 
that his father had "dropped 
him ofl'in front of the bank" in 
Carmichaels just minutes 
before he was picked up by 
police. 

David Antonelli, chairman 
of the finance committee, re­
ported following the meeting 
that additional workshops are 
scheduled with the hope of 
making additional cuts prior 
to final adoption. 

The tentative budget is 
$393 ,454 higher than the cur­
rent budget. The budget 
breakdown by major catego­
ries is as follows : 

Former Resident's Son 
Killed Accidentally 

.,, .Administration , legal 
services and tax collection, 
$131 ,025; instruction, supplies 
and teachers ' salaries , 
$1 ,630,300 ; pupil personnel 
service, guidance and atten• 
dance ; $27,542 ; health ser­
vices, supplies and nurses 
salary, $22,150 ; pupil trans­
portation services, $233,000 ; 
operations , plan t main­
tenance, utilities, salaries, 
$430 ,890 , fixed charges , 
$350.050 ; student activities. 
coaches salaries, athletlc sup­
plies and equipment. $70,835, 
capital outlay, salaries and 
building equipment, $22,600 ; 
debt services, $113,640 ; in­
tersystem payments. $149,500; 

NEW WILMINGTON - The 
son of a former Waynesburg 
resident died of electrical 
shock last week when he 
jumped into a farm pond to 
rescue his dog, not realizing 
that the water had been 
charged by a faulty under­
water pump. 

Victim of the accident on 
Sunday, May 24, was James 
E. Morris , 19, New Wilm· 
ington, a self-employed black­
smith. 

He was a son of C. Arnold 
and Elizabeth Newton Morris 
of New Wilmington , and a 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. 

Eldred Morris of 225 ½ East a nd budgetary reserve, 
Greene Street, Waynesburg. $120,000. 

A member of the family Business manager Louis 
said Morris was throwing a Pascuzzo announced the ten­
frisbee into a neighbor's pond tative budget is available for 
so that his dog could swim out inspection in the senior high 
and retrieve it. On the last school office. 
throw he saw the dog was in In other action the board 
trouble and went in after it. He • approved the employment of 
was killed instantly_ four part lime janitors as 

Surviving in addition to his needed during the summer 
parents and grandparents are months at the NemacoUn 
a sister , Cindy ; four brothers, Elementary School and the 
Steven, William, Robert and junior-sen ior high school. • 
John Morris ; three uncles, Their pay will be $3.45 per 
and five aunts. hour. Those hired were Rob 

Services were held May 28 Cole, Mike Long, Stewart 
in New Castle. McCaw, and Jerry Sadlek. 

., ~ 
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From the left are: Dr. G. Wayne Smith and Marian Rush, program committee; Dr. Stewart · 
Johoaoo, his son Jonathan and his wife Sally, and Sherry WIiiison, program committee. 

Pastor's Farewell Dinner 
WAYNESBURG - A farewell dinner 

and program was held Wednesday night 
for Or. Stewart Johnson, pastor of the 
First Baptist Church in Waynesburg, 
who has accepted a position as director 
of the Pastoral Institute In LaGrange, 
Ga. 

Johnson, a native of Greene County, 

has been pastor of the First Baptist 
Church for the past three-and-one-half 
years. Program committee for the 
farewell dinner were Marian Rush, 
Sherry Willison and Dr. G. Wayne 
Smith. 

Following the dinner In the church 
social room, a musical program ar-

ranged by Garnet Throckmorto, was 
held in the church sanctuary . Partici­
pating In the program were Jan Harris, 
Floyd Patterson , Julia Young, Gerald 
Manolas, John Harding, G. Wayne 
Smith and Garnet Throckmorton. 

Johnson, his wife, Sherry, and son , 
Jonathan, were presented with a Ooor 
model globe. 

,-·-
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Sunday 
I John 50th Anniversary 

- 4:13-16 
Mr. and Mrs . Raymond L. Dukate of 161 South 
Porter Street, Waynesburg, will celebrate their 
50th wedding anniversary Thursday, June 4. 
They were married June 4, 1931, in Wellsburg, 
W.Va. Mr. Dukate is a son of the late John 
David and Eliza Caroline Dukate. His wife is the 
former Gertrude Staggers, daughter of the late 
George and Zella Staggers. The couple has two 
sons, George Loren Dukate of Waynesburg and 
Larry Dukate of Dayton, Ohio, and two 
daughters; Mrs. Joseph (Dolores) Headlee of 
Springfield, Va., and Mrs. Sherry Black of 
Waynesburg. There are 12 grandchildren and 
two great-grandchildren. 

Open House Will Follow 
Dedication Of New Hall 

CARMICHAELS - A ser• 
vice of dedication will be held 
in the Cannichaels First 
United Methodist Church for 
the new fellowship hall during 
the regular II a.m. worship 
service on Sunday, June 7 

Open house will follow in the 
new facility . 

The church purchased the 
former Abinader Building at 
the corner of South and 
Morgantown streets in Janu­
ary 1981 and has been re­
habilitating the structure 
since then. The first noor, 
which will be the fellowship 
center, has been painted and 
draperies have been bung and 
a new kitchen installed. 

Future plans for the build· 
ing include educational space 
and a recreational area in the 
downstairs area. 

The church also hopes to 
institute a youth program for 
the commumty when the work 
is completed. 

A program on singing will 
be presented at 7 p.m. by the 
United Community Singers 
Members represent Mt. 
Ararat, Cardale, Mt. Lebanon, 
Brownsville and Rising Star 
churches. Pianists are Gloria 
Momon and Fannie Jones. 

The program, which is open 
to the public, will be followed 
by a fellowship hour. 

Sunday School 
Attendance 

WIND RIDGE - M. B. 
McMillen , Greene County 
evangelism superintendent, 
has announced the attendance 
report for the fifth week of the 
Sunday School enlargement 
campaign with the Rogers­
ville Christian Church taking 
first place with a gain of 18 
persons. 

Pleasant Hill United Meth· 
odist Church placed second 
with a gain of nine persons 
representing an increase of 69 
percent and the Harmony 
United Presbyterian Church 
placed third with a nine per• 
sons gain representing a 20 
percent increase. Others in 
the order of their placing are 
as follows ; 

Beulah Baptist, Bates Fork 
Baptist, Wind Ridge Chris­
tian, Mapletown United Meth• 
odist, First United Methodist 
of Carmichaels, Oak View 
United Methodist and Crabap­
ple Community. 

MR. AND MRS. CHESTER TENNANT 

Visiting Couple 
Has Anniversary 

Mr. and Mrs. Chester Ten­
nant of 4425 Areca Palm 
Drive, Fort Pierce, Fla., will 
observe their 40th wedding an­
niversary next week. They 
were married June 2, 1941 , m 
Baltimore, Md. 

They are the parents of 
Judy Hightower of Fort Pierce 
and Terry Tennant of Weirton, 

W.Va They also have five 
grandchildren , Kerri Ryan, 
Kasey King and Shane High­
tower of Fort Pierce and 
Kevin and David Tennant of 
Weirton, W.Va. 

Th e y ar e visiting In 
Waynesburg this week to help 
celebrate the 60th wedding an­
niversary of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Walter Swiger. 

Monday 
Psalms 
47:1-9 

Tuesday 
Psalms 
30:1-12 

Wednesday 
II Samuel 
6:1-5 

Thursday 
Isaiah 
51:1-3 

Friday 
Isaiah 
61:2-7 

Saturday 
Habakkuk 
3:17-19 

~ 
CLoveqs 

c_An CE:ternal 

For some It Isl 

But for others It can be a searing summer . .. an 
early fall ... a chilling winter. 

All depends on the two people who leave the 
church .. . and the road Donna and David 
Daugherty choose for their Journey together. 

For, when love comes to the altar, It Is full of 
hope . . . and faith ... and promise. 

~pring-CJiine 
~ 

And, tflove will return to the altar-week after 
week - It can discover God's unceasing renewal of 
those blessings which first endowed Its sacred 
vows with eternal meaning. 

But It Isn't quite so simple as praying together 
and staytng together. 

It Is a boy Wld g1rrs unending quest for every 
splrltual Insight that will enable them to under• 
stand ... to appreciate . .. to cherish , , . each other! Copyrfght 1981 Keister Advertising Ser11ice 

P.O. Box 8024, Charlortesvllle, Virginie 22906 And God! 
Scnplures selec:led by The Amencan Btble Society 

GREENE COUNTY CHURCH DIRECTORY 
FIRST METHODIST 

WAYNESBURG 
9:45. Church School: 10 :45. 

Worship . Monday. 3:30. Jun­
ior Choir . Tuesday. 8. Senior 
Choir : Wednesday . 4. Prima­
ry Fellowship 

WASHINGTON STREET 
METHODIST, 

WAYNESBURG 
9:30. Church School. I0 ·45 . 

Worship : 6;30. Youth Group : 
Wednesda y. 7. Choir re­
hearsal: 8_-Bible study. 

ROGERSVILLE-NINEVEH 
METnOOIST CHARGE 

VALLEY CHAPEL 9. Wor­
ship . 9:45, Church School 

HOPEWELL : 9 15, Church 
School : 10. Worship. 

NINEVEH 10 . Church 
School. 1 I. Worship. 

REOGEHSVILLE 10 . 
Church School. 11. Worship 

JEFFERSON 
METHODIST CHARGE 

JEFFERSON 9 30. Wor­
ship . 10 ·40. Church School 
Wednesday . 4. 15 . Junior 
Choir ; 6:30. Senior Choir 

RI CES LA NDING 10 . 
Church School 11. Worship. 

MILLSBORO · 7 30. Eve­
ning Worship 

CARMICHAELS 
METHODIST 

9 45. Sunday School. 11. 
Worship, 

GARARDS FORT 
METHODIST 

9. 30 . Wor s lup . JO 30. 
Church School. 

,JOLLYTOWN 
METHODIST CIIAllGE 

LA UREL RUN 9. Worship . 
lO. Church School 

GRA NDVI EW 10. Wor• 
ship : 11. Church School 

PLEA SANT HILL 10. 
Church School. I I. Worship 

JOLLYTOWN ; 10. Church 
School. II , Worship 

MT ZION. 10. Church 
'School; 11 . Worship 

MONONGAHELA 
METHODIST CHARGE 

MORRISVILLE : 9, Church 
, School : 10, Worship. 

C'OA LLI CK· 10. Church 
School. 11. Worship. 

TIIROCK I\Hll{TON 10 . 
Church School. 11. Worship 

OAK FOHEST 10. Church 
School. 7 30. Worship I se('ond 
and fourth Sund a vs 1 

MT PL EAS ANT 10 . 
Worshi p 

UNION 
METHODIST CHARGE 

UNION VALLl£Y 10 . 
Church School· 11.15. Wor­
ship . 7 30. MYF 

FAIRVIEW 10. Worship . 
Church Sc- hool Tuesda y. 
Choir practice 

NEBO 9. Worship JO. 
Church School. 11. MYF. 

FAIRALL 
CLA UGIITON CHAPEL 9. 

Church School. ! I. Worship 
FAIRALi, JO . Churc h 

School . 11 15. Worship . 
KIRllY 10. Church School 

7. Worship 
VALLEY CHAPEL 9. Wor• 

ship . 10. Church Schoo l 

WILLOW GROVE 
INDEPENDENT IIAPTIST 

JO. Sunda v School. 11 Wor­
ship , Thursday . 7 30. prayer 
meeting. 

SUGAR GROVE 
BAPTIST 

10, Worship . 11. Church 
Sch°"I 

MT. ZION BAPTIST 
10, Church School 11 Wor­

ship 7 :10 E\'l'ning Worship 

CALVARY BAPTIST 
10. Su ndav Sc-hool . 11 Wor· 

ship . Wednesday 7 .30. pravcr 
meeting and Bible studv 

,JEFFERSON BAPTIST 
9 45. Wo r s hip 10 45 . 

Churrh SrHool. Wcdncsdav 
7 30. prayer scrvic,•. 

JOIIN COLBY BAPTIST 
9 45 Wors hip . JO 45 

Church Sr·hool . Thursday. 
7 .30, Bible Study and pray(•r 

CARMICIIAELS 
BAPTIST 

9 45. Church School. 11 . 
Worship , 7, Evening Worship : 
Wednesday, 7;30 , Youth 
Choir , Bible Study 

FIRST BAPTIST 
WAYNESBURG 

9 30. Church School . JO 45 . 
Worship · 7. BYF . Wednesday . 
7 311 . t•:vcning Prayer Group. 

BATES FORK BAPTIST 
10. Church School. I I · 30. 

Worship. · 

9 55. Worship . 11. Church 
School. 6 30. BY~- and Jct 
Cadets; Saturda\•. Ill. Unity 
Rehearsa l 

FIRST PRESBYTERIA 
WAYNESBURG 

9 45. Chu1·ch School. 11. 
Worship . 6,30. Coll ege and Ca· 
rccr Group . 7. Senior High 
l'cliowsh1p : Wednesday. 3·45. 
Youth Club . Thursdav. 7.30 
Cham·el Choir . 

GREENE VALLEY 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 30. Church School. 11. 
Worship. 6. 30. Junior and Sen­
wr l11gh P~llowsh1p . Tucsda\ . 
3 30. Teen Chou· Wcclncr.dav. 
7 Calvin Choir . 8. Greene Val 
Irv Choir . Thursdav . 4 15. 
Angel Choir . 

JEFFERSON 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 30. Wor s hi p 10 30 
Church School 

HEWITT 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 45. Church S(·hool. I I. 

WAYNESBURG 
9 45 . Sunday School ; 11. 

Worship ; 6 45. Young People. 
7 30 . Ev e ning Wors hip ; 
Wednesda y. 7 30. pra yer 
meeting 

WAYNESBURG 
CIIURCH OF CHRIST 

10. Bible School. 10 45. Wor­
ship . 6.30. Evernng Service . 
We dnesday . 7 . 30 . Bible 
classes. 

ST. GEORGE'S EPISCOPAL 
WAYNESBURG 

8. Holv Commurnon ; 9.30, 
Senior High Class : 10 :30. 
Church School and Holy Com­
murnon . Thursday. 7 30. Holy 
Communion 

WAYNESBURG 
NAZARENE 

9 45. Church School. 10 45. 
Worship . 7 30. Evening Ser• 
vi ces . Wednesday . 7:30 . 
Praver Scn•icc and NYPS 

ROLLING MEADOWS 
CHURCH OF GOD 

9 45. Sunday School. 11 , 
Worship 7. Evangchsllc Ser­
v1c·cs Wednesday . 7. Family 
Training Hour 

ST. ANN'S CATHOLIC 
WAYNESBURG 

Saturd ay Anll c 1pal or y 
Mass. 6 30 Sundav Masses, 
8 30 and II 30 Confessions. 
Saturday 3 30 to 4 30 

CRABAPPLE 
COMMUNITY 

Worship . W,•dn~sda, . 6. Wcsl· 
mm1 str r Choir i Chane-el 
Chou- 10. Church School 11. Wor• 

, ship . 7 30 Evangchsl1c Ser• 
,·ice . Wcdn csdav. 7 30 , 
Prayer Meeting. · 

C'AHMIC'IIAELS 
CIIRISTIAN 

9 45. Church School. 11 
Wor~h1p . Tm·sdny. 6 30. Chi 
Hh o We dn c•s dny :1 45 
Chancel Choir 4 :io. Youth 
Choir . Sa turdav . 11. Cherub 
Chmr · 

WAYNESBURG 
C'HRISTIAlli 

9 30. 8 1blr School JO 30 
Worship . 6. Youth Groups . 7. 
Evening Worship . Wedncs• 
day. 7 30 H1hlc Study 8 30. 
Choir rehearsal 

MATHER CHRISTIAN 
9 30, Bible School. 10 ·40, 

Worship , 7:30, Bible Study 

FIRST PILGRIM CHURCH 

WEST GREENE 
PR~:SBYTl,:IUAN CHARGE 

IIAHMONY 9. Worship . 10. 
Church School 

UN ITY·BIUSTORIA · 10 10. 
Wor s hip . 11 10 . Churc h 
School 

WEST UNION 10, Church 
School. II 15. Worship 

HATt' IELD FERRY 
1, UTIIE:RAN PARISH 

ST PAUL 0 S. Carmichaels 
9, Worship , 10 15, Church 
School 

JACOBS 9. Worship , II , 
Church School. 

Howard's Grocery 
Two Friendly Stores To Serve You 

OPEN EVENINGS 
120 East High Streel -6.27-5115 
Eaot Gre.-ne Slrt'<'t -627-7007 

W elliilee Coca-Cola 
Bottling Co. 

Drink Coca-Cole -in-Bo·uleo 

"Things Go Better With Coke" 

R.D. 1, Box 215-B 
Morg1111town, W. Va. 26505 

Fox Auto Sales, Inc. 
Mercury ... Ford Cars and Trucks 

SALES and SERVICE 

743 East High St. 
Phone 627-3151 

Stop& Shop 
At The 

FASHION SHOP 
In W ayneebur1_1 

Size 3 through Half Sizes 

Jacobs Oil Products 

E. BRYAN JACOBS 
Exxon Distributor 

424 South Wa,hin(llon Street 
Phone 627-3757 

"Say It With F1ower8" 
Anytime • Anywhere 

Phone 627-6196 
I i 7 E .. 1 Hl11h Slr,~I 

" •> n~1burfl 
I . 

WAYNESBURG FLORAL 

- ----~--' 

I• 
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Miss Parry, Knisely Legion Post Honors Tracy Burkhead Weds 
James Eugene Jacobs 

United In Marriage Jefferson Students Tracy Leigh Burkhead and 
James Eugene Jacobs were 
united in marriage during a 7 
p.m. double ring ceremony in 
the First Presbyterian Church 
of Waynesburg on May 16, 
1981. The Rev. Robert Borland 
heard the exchange of vows. 
Nelson Fox played the nuptial 
music. 

The Cross Lanes United 
Methodist Church in 
Charleston, W.Va., was the 
setting for the double ring cer­
emony on May 23, 1981, uniting 
In marriage Susan Diane 
Parry and Homer Edward 
Knisely of Huntington , W. Va. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. W. Roger Parry 
of 5329 Pamela Circle, 
Charleston, formerly of Way­
neburg. Parents of the bride­
groom are Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Knisely of Waynes­
burg R.D.2. 

The Rev . Thomas Dunlap 
officiated and Karen Gilreath 
was the organist and Mark 

, McVey the soloist. 
Given in marriage by her 

father and mother, the bride 
appeared in a gown of white 

the flower girl. Their gowns 
were yellow, apricot, 
lavender, seamist green and 
blue. 

Terry Cumberledge of 
Waynesburg served as best 
man. The ushers were Charles 
Chaney, James Guy and Den­
nis Neibert all of Huntington, 
W. Va. Bryce Chaney was the 
ring bearer. 

The reception for 125 guests 
was held at the Scarlet Oaks 
Country Club where Eleanor 
Keller, sister of the bride­
groom was in charge of the 
guest book. Out of state wed­
ding guests were from Flor­
ida, Ohio and Pennsylvania. 

The bride is a senior at 
Marshall University in Hunt-

- ington. Her husband is a 1978 
graduate of West Virginia Uni­
versity and is employed as 
manager by ACF Industries in 
Huntington. 

Aller a wedding trip to 
South Carolina and Florida 
the couple will reside at 5 
Lynnwood Terrace, Hunt­
ington, W. Va. 

JEFFERSON - Three 
sixth grade students at Jef­
ferson Elementary School 
have been honored by Brooks­
Crago Post No. 816, American 
Legion, Rices Landing. 

They were selected as the 
representatives of their hom­
erooms who best demon­
strated qualities of courage, 

• 
RONNIE SHAFFER 

honor, leadership, patriotism, 
scholarship and service. 

They are George Bellish Ill , 
son of Mr. and Mrs. George 
Bellish Jr . of Mather ; Billy 
Ivanusic, son of Mrs. Connie 
Mori an of Clarksville; and 
Ronnie Shaffer, son of Mr. and 
Mrs . Ronald Shaffer of Jef­
ferson . 

Each boy received a 
certificate of distinguished 
achievement and a bronze 
medal at the school's first an­
nual sixth grade promotion 
dinner held May 22, and were 
then honored by the Brooks­
Crago Post during the Memo­
rial Day parade and program 
held at Rices Landing. 

BILLY IVANUSIC 

Parents of the couple are 
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas E. 
Burkhead of Waynesburg 
R.D.4 and Mr. anti Mrs. C. 
Eugene Jacobs of Graysville 
R.D.1. 

Given in marrige by her 
father and mother, the bride 
appeared in a formal length 
ivory colored wedding dress of 
shimmer satin. The sleeveless 
gown featured a re-em­
broidered lace ruffle in an off­
the-shoulder design, and a 
skirt which fell softly to the 
floor into a chapel length train 
with scalloped French lace 
edging. Her shoulder length 
veil of silk illusion had 
matching lace appliques. 

She carried a cascading 
bouquet of miniature ivory 
roses, miniature carnations 
and baby 's breath. She also 
wore a diamond pendant 
whic_h belongs to her mother. 

MRS. JAMES E. JACOBS 

School and will be a 1982 grad­
uate of Waynesburg College. 
He is majoring in accounting. 

The couple will take a de­
layed wedding trip to Florida. 

, polyester organza lavished 
with Venise lace. The bodice 
of sheer polyester was 
enhanced with seed pearls and 
exquisite re-embroidered 
scalloped lace which also 
edged the neckline and stand­
up collar, it featured a hi-rise 
waist and Bishop sleeves with 
deep cuffs with tiny self cov­
ered buttons. The back fea­
tured tiny self covered buttons 
to the waist. Venise lace appli­
ques were used on the skirt 
and hem of the sweeping 
chapel train . 

MRS. HOMER E. KNISELY 
diamonds and pearls which 
was worn by her great-grand­
mother Phillips on her wed­
ding day and carried a lace 
handkerchief belonging to her 
great-grandmother Nelson. 
Her bridal bouquet of white 
roses, daisies and baby's 
breath was interspersed with 
aqua, apricot, lavender and 
yellow roses. 

Award Will 
Be Given Reception In Bride's Home 

Deb Steven of Costa Mesa, 
Calif., attended her sister as 
matron of honor . The 
bridesmaids were Carol Re­
arick of Waynesburg, sister of 
the bridegroom, and Barbie 
Bamberger of Graysville , 
cousin . of the bridegroom. 
Their gowns were sea green 
with ivory lace jackets. Kelly 
Wilson of Waynesburg, cousin 
of the bride, was flower girl. 
Her gown was dusty rose with 
ivory lace accents. 

The couple noted the partic­
ipation of their grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Jacobs of 
Cameron Star Route, Waynes­
burg, Mrs. Goldie Bamberger 
of Graysville and Mrs. V.A. 
Burkhead of Waco, Texas, in 
the receiving line. 

Her fingertip length veil of 
nylon illusion was held by a 
lace cap and was edged in 
Venise lace with seed pearl 
trim. She wore a blue garter 
and a six pence in her shoe, a 
lavalier nec~lace with tiny 

Barbara Parry attended 
her sister as maid of honor. 
The bridesmaids were Gwyn 
Theisler, Paulette Pauley and 
Betty Barth. Kristen Fox was 

55 County Students 
Make Dean's List 

WAYNESBURG - Fifty­
five students from Greene 
County were named to the 
dean's list at Waynesburg Col­
lege for the second semester 
of the 1980-81 academic year. 
A total of 185 students were 
placed on the list. 

Students named to the list, 
according to Dr. G. Wayne 
Smith, academic dean, com­
piled semester averages of 
3.25 or higher on a 4.0 scale. 
The dean's list is divided into 
three categories: highest hon­
ors with a 4.0 average ; honors, 
with at least al 3.5 average 
and honorable mention with at 
least a 3.25 average. 

Students from Greene 
County on the dean's list in­
cluded: 

WGHEST HONORS 
Stephanie Butler, Charles 

A. Helms, Susan E. Pool, Joan 
L. Capello and Anna M. Hoff­
nagle, all of Waynesburg ; Vic­
toria Shine of Greensboro, 
Charles Guthrie of Wind 
Ridge, Lawrence Headley of 
Graysville, Scott B. Roberts of 
Rices Landing and J . Marie 
Webb of Nineveh. 

HONORS 
Rachel Bower, Marilyn 

Cassidy, Leslie Cahn, Shelley 

Christ, Mark Corwin, Linda 
Jackson, Nicholas Richards, 
Tamara Davis , Theresa 
Lacava, Samuel Neubauer, 
Donald Smith and Cheryl 
Zeiler, all of Waynesburg ; 
John Antonelli, Julie Beck, 
Dolores Edwards, Keith 
Martin, R. Virginia Moore 
andTbeodore Rodavich, all of 
Carmichaels ; Karen Con­
nolly, Charlene Daniels and 
Tamara Van Scyoc, all of 
Sycamore; Richard Gibson, 
New Freeport ; Judith 
Kalaf sky , Greensboro; Mi­
chael Floreak and Suzanne M. 
Hunt, both of Rices Landing; 
James Jacobs, Graysville and 
Lisa Monas and Kathleen 
Rohrer, both of Mather. 

HONORABLE MENTION 
Thomas Cowan , Anmy 

Doutt, John Harding, Cristy 
McNett, Nancy Cummins, 
Gilllian Friday, Colleen 
McCarty , Megan Patterson 
and William Ryan, all of 
Waynesburg ; Edward Beck, 
Carmichaels ; Gary Jackson 
and Pamela Courtwright, both 
of Wind Ridge ; Terrie Rohrer, 
Mather ; Brenda Smith, Pros­
perity and Michael Zeglen, 
Clarksville. 

CARMICHAELS - The 
Carmichaels 1981 "Outstand­
ing Woman's" award will pre­
sented to Thelma Callaghan at 
a dinner at 6:30 p.m. Friday, 
June 12, at the Carmichaels 
Grange hall. 

Marcia McKenna Biddle 
will speak. She is a columnist, 
the author of several pub­
lished books, president of the 
Greene County Council on the 
Arts and president of the 
Greene Academy of Art. 

The welcome will be given 
by Betsy Bailey, president of 
the Junior Women's Club of 
Carmichaels, which sponsors 
the annual selection and 
award presentation. 

A limited number of tickets 
will be available until Mon­
day , June 8, from Mrs. Bailey, 
966-2337; Mrs. John Brodak, 
966-2559, or Mrs. Russell 
Morris Jr., 966-5284. 

The Church of God of 
Prophecy was the setting Sat­
urday, May 16, for the wed­
ding of Denise Marlene 
Jolliffe of Jefferson and 
Rodney Blane Wright of 
Waynesburg. 

The bride is a daughter of 
Dave Jolliffe of Carmichaels 
and Joyce Butcho of Jef­
ferson. The bridegroom is a 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Leroy 
Wright of Waynesburg. 

Wedding vows were ex­
changed at 2:30 p.m. with the 
Rev. Carl Aites officiating at 
the ceremony. 

The bride was given in mar­
riage by her parents. She ap­
peared in a floor-length gown 
of white organza with an A­
line silhouette, styled with an 
empire waistline, a high 

Miss Renzelli, 
Scott To Marry 

Mr. and Mrs. John P. Renzelli of Anmoore announce the 
engagement of their daughter, Beatrice Anne, to William 
Raymond Scott of Maple Lake, son of Mr. and Mrs. William 
Ross Scott of Greensburg, formerly of Waynesburg. 

The bride-elect is a graduate of Notre Dame High School and 
Salem College, where she received a bachelor's degree in 
criminal justice. Miss Renzelli is the station manager at 
Transportation Rentals Corporation at Be'ledum Airport in 
West Virginia . 

Mr. Scott is a graduate of Bridgeport High School and 
attended Fairmont State College. He is a pilot with Aeromech 
Airlines. 

The wedding is planned for May 30 at the Immaculate 
Conception Church in Clarksburg, W.Va. 

Ar_ts Council Logo Chosen 
JEFFERSON - A county-wide stu­

dent competition to design an official 
logo for the Greene County Council on 
the Arts has been won by a Jefferson­
Morgan High School senior. 

A design by Scot Lippencott of Dry 
Tavern was selected the winning logo 
from over 100 designs entered by stu­
dents from Carmichaels Area High , 
West Greene High and Jefferson­
Morgan. He received $100 for having the 

J 
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winning entry . 
In February 1980, the Greene County 

Commissioners designated the Greene 
County Council on the Arts as the official 
arts organization for the county. 
Purpose of the cou~cil is to promote the 
arts In the county and to technically 
assist local art groups. 

Last summer , the arts council 
brought the American Wind Symphony 

to Greene County for a three day tour 
which included a concert from the wind 
symphony barge moored on the Monon­
gahela River at Rices Landing. Cur­
rently, the council is writing several 
grant proposals to continue its operation 
and to provide county residents with 
quality arts programs. 

The logo will be used for the council's 
letterhead, newsletter , and other 
printed materials. 

• Obsffvtr•R.tporter Photo 

Scot Ltppeneott, seated center, with council directors Chris Holzworth, left, and Dorothy Peccon. 
In back ts Jefferson-Morgan High art instructor Frank Melega. 

' 

neckline adorned with lace 
and bishop sleeves with deep 
cuffs. Her headpice of bows 
held a cathedral-length man­
tilla of empire English il­
lusion , completely framed 
with wide scalloped lace. She 
carried a cascade of red roses 
and white carnations. 

Kim Wilson of Jefferson 
served as her sister's matron 
of honor. Roy Bennington 
served as best man for his 
nephew. 

A reception was held at the 
bride's home. The couple is 
living at Apartment 615 , 
Mountain View Gardens , 
Waynesburg. 

The bride is a 1981 graduate 
of Jefferson-Morgan High 
School. The bridegroom is a 
1979 graduate of Waynesburg 
Central High School and is 
employed by the Cowboy 
Saloon, Waynesburg. MRS. RODNEY WRIGHT 

Randy Guthrie of Wind 
Ridge attended as best man. 
The ushers were Brian Jack­
son of Wind Ridge and Craig 
Burkhead of Waynesburg , 
brother of the bride. Kristofer 
Bergman of McMurray, 
cousin of the bride, was the 
ring bearer. 

The reception was held is 
the social hall of the church 
immediately following the 
ceremony. Out of state guests 
were present from California , 
Texas, Georgia and Ohio. 

The bride is a graduate of 
Chatsworth High School , 
Chatsworth, Calif. She at­
tended Waynesburg College. 

The bridegroom is a gradu­
ate of West Greene High 

Girl Reigns 
At Regatta 

POINT MARION - Lisa 
Elek, a senior at Carmichaels 
Area High School , was 
crowned queen of the annual 
Albert Gallatin Regatta held 
this weekend at Point Marion. 

She was crowned by John 
Butcher, president of the 
Point Marion Chamber of 
Commerce. Helen Gugliotta 
was chairwoman of the cor­
onation ceremony . Lisa 
Martin of Albert Gallatin 
School district was runner-up. 

The Point Marion Junior 
High School Choir sang. The 
regatta also included a pa­
rade, hang gliding, water 
skiing and a race between four 
crews of West Virginia Uni­
versity's Mon Rowing Club. 

Check out 
this new 

Income 
Source! 

IT'S OUR POPULAR NEW 

EASY NOW 
INTEREST-BEARING 

CHECKING ACCOUNT 
Maintain a balance of $500 or more, and It's 
FREE CHECKING; ... plus ... 5¼% PER ANNUM! 
WHERE YOU SA VE-AND CHECK-DOES MAKE A 
DIFFERENCE/ 

STOP IN AND LET US EXPLAIN THIS SERVICE TO YOU 

WAYNESBURG, PA. UNIONTOWN, PA. 
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Housing Development Fight 
Stresses Need For Zoning 

Residents of Cumberland Township in Greene 
County are fighting an uphill battle in seeking to 
block construction of 75 units of garden apart­
ments and town houses near Carmichaels. 

Faces Fro,n The Past-Do You Recognize Them 

The $4 million Parkview Knoll project is being _ 
built by the National Development Corp. under a 
Section 8 agreement with the Department of 
Housing and Urban Development as subsidized 
housing for low and moderate income families. It 
will sit on seven acres of ground adjoining a lot 
plan which was developed for standard, single- ' 
family housing. 

People who are fighting the project, and there 
are about 70 of them, are concerned primarily 
because they feel the housing project will conflict 
with the rest of the area. "We aren't opposed to 
public housing as such, but we feel it is not in the 
best interest of the area in which we live," one of 
the spokesmen for the property owners explained 
at a recent meeting of the Greene County Plan­
ning Commission. 

They are also carrying their fight to the 
Cumberland Township supervisors and have con­
tacted their state legislators in an effort to see if 
anything can't be done to halt construction, but as 
of now the developer is proceeding with the job of 
erecting the units. 

A number of arguments have been raised, one of 
them being that National Development failed to 
begin construction within the required six months 
after obtaining a township permit under its flood 
control ordinance. The residents have also threat­
ened to pursue the matter in court. 

Essentially, however, the problem lies with the 
fact, as was explained at the planning commission 
meeting, that neither the county nor Cumberland 
Township has a zoning ordinance, although the 
township is currently considering such an or­
dinance. 

Without. such land use controls, it is virtually 
impossible to prevent the owner of property from 
developing it as he sees fit, even if that develop­
ment clashes with the general character of a 
neighborhood. 

Greene County municipalities have Jong fought 
the idea of zoning, but in developing areas it is the 
only real method of assuring that new growth 
won't conflict with existing land uses. 

A few more fights of this type might drive that 
fact home. 

Between 
The Bookends 
Marcia McKenna Biddle 

Here is some good light 
reading for the summer. Well, 
not everybody thinks of a 
murder mystery as light read­
ing but, for those who do, these 
are good for taking to the 
beach or napping with on the 
porch. 

Way Back When 
West High Street in Waynesburg in the early 1920s is shown on an old postcard owned by Henry 
Rodney, a native of Uniontown and a Waynesburg College graduate, and now an executive with 
Sears, Roebuck in suburban Philadelphia. Note the horse and buggy parked in front of the Opera 
House Building. The sign says Electric Shoe Repair at the shop owned by the late K. Scope, a 
native of Greece. The building in the right foreground has since been cut down to one story. It 
orginally housed the Hoover & Minor drygoods store. Th George E.Hoge clothings store entrance is 
at left. The four-story Grossman Building in the centr was destroyed by fire on Dec. 23, 1925, The 
fire also destroyed the Downey House Hotel on the extreme right. 

Fact and Folkrore 

Thousands of eager high letter from Mr. and Mrs. 
school graduates in this year Frank (Pete) Ullom who now 
of 1981 are eagerly looking live al 371 N.E. First Avenue, 
forward to entering colleges Miami Beach, Fla. The letter 
or universities this coming was written a few days aner 
autumn for a four-year ex- they had hosted a group of 
perience which hopefully will fellow former students from 
be an important factor in the pre-World War II era who 
shaping the rest of their Jives. more or less by chance have 

Many will be opting for the wound up near each other and 
larger colleges and univer• periodically gather together to 
sities, while others , by per- renew the happy memories of 
sonal preference, will head for . their undergraduate days. 
schools of smaller enrollment There are many others in 
such as Waynesburg College other states or regions who 
where it is possible to have are part of the rapidly grow­
more personal identification ing alumni organizations of 
and a greater number of close the college from coast to 
friends and companions which coast. 
in many cases will remain Both Frank and his wife, the 
enjoyable for the remainder of former Ellen Hoskinson, were 
their lives. hometown ''Waynesburgers" 

No such group at any col- and his uncle, the late Dr. 
lege in the land could have Jesse Hazlett, scored the first 
more truly enjoyable and en- touchdown in Waynesburg 
riching campus experiences College history when he stole 
than those that flourished at the football from a West Vir­
Waynesburg College during ginia University halfback and 
the Depression of the 1920's ran across the goal line back 
and 30's up to the start of in 1895 in a game which West 
World War II. Virginia later refused to rec-

The enrollments then never ognize as a varsity game. 
exceeded 400 and virtually ev• Other former Waynesburg 
eryone on campus knew all students who were guests at 
other students and faculty and the Ullom home at the reunion 
administrative staff mem- party during the Memorial 
hers. Day weekend included his 

These memories were re- cousin, Dr. Frank Hazlett, a 
kindled a tew days ago in a retired physician who prac-

J<;,hn O'Hara 

ticed in Waynesburg and his 
wife, Ruth, who now live in 
Dania, Fla.; Oakley and Ro­
sena Shaw of Largo, Fla.; 
Robert and Cora Marie Car­
roll, Maurice (Mo) and Eliza­
beth Sears Scarry; Bill and 
Ruth Ann (Hoskinson) Penn, 
and Harry and Jeanette Penn, 
all of Miami. 

"The main topics of con­
versation," Pete writes, 
"were reminiscent talks of 
Waynesburg College days." 
The two scrapbooks he had 
compiled of names and places 
from the past and the many 
happenings in the beautiful 
"town and gown" relationship 
which has always existed be­
tween the campus and the 
community were looked at 
again and again. 

The Penn brothers were 
also hometown "Way­
nesburgers" who played both 
football and basketball at 
Waynesburg and then became 
teachers. Scarry, a native of 
Duquesne, came to Waynes­
burg on a basketball scholar­
ship but also played football. 
Later he played professional 
ball at Cleveland aner World 
War II affter which he 
coached at several colleges 
including Waynesburg and is 
now a line coach with the Mi• 
ami Dolphins. 

Another entertaining fea­
ture of the reunion of the 
transplanted Pennsylvanians 
in Florida was reading the 
massive scrapbooks on sports 
in this area by Earl Zook, a 
star athlete at Bethany Col­
lege in the rnid-1920's. Later 
he coached at Redstone High 
School in Fayette County and 
at Waynesburg before locat­
ing in the Washington, D.C. 
area. 

Zook became a legend in 
Bethany College sports his­
tory for his versatility as a 
baseball , football and track 
athlete and as a coach in later 
years. 

He now is associated with a 
large country club as a starter 
on the golf course and is active 
every day even though now in 
his mid-80's. 

And , as former Way­
nesburger, Frank Ullom often 
remarks , " there's nothing 
nicer than the friends and 
companions you can gel to 
know in a small college. The 
enrollments may be smaller, 
but the friendships are deeper 
and more lasting than most 
that are made elsewhere dur­
ing those four years of a per­
son's undergraduate days - a 
time for enjoying the present 
and dreaming of the future 
that Is yet to come.'· 

Veteran Educator Retires 

l'nday, June l>, Hllfl 

AROUND TOWN 
By THE STAFF 

From the moist way May 
ended and June began, many 
Greene Countians would be 
glad to trade what the poets 
describe as "October's bright 
blue weather" to have a little 
of that sunshine delivered now 
in place of the hot, steamy 
weather being experienced 
here the past fortnight . 

Members of the Waynes­
burg Central High School 
Band, their instructors and 
others who were on the recent 
trip to the Orange Bloossom 
fesitval al Orlando, Fla. were 
all complimented by the festi­
val committee not only for the 
band 's fine performance in the 
festival parade and other 
events but also for their de­
portment throughout their 
visit. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Moore 
of Avalon Court are spending 
a few days visiting their 
daughter, Mrs. Ann Hale of 
Clinton, Md. Their son-in-law, 
Roy Hale, a retired Navy of­
ficer, was recently appointed 
a deputy treasurer of the 
United States. 

Thomas Gre~nlee, son of 
Dr. and Mrs. D. Paul Greenlee 
of Waynesburg. has been ap­
pointed mayor of Tionesta 
Borough in Forest County. Mr. 
Greenlee, a former Waynes­
burg resident. is owner of a 
large hunting and fishing sup­
ply store in Clinton County, 
which is in the heart of the 
northern Pennsylvania deer 
hunting section. 

Mrs. Beverly Rinehart 
Rutherford of Joffie, Md. vis­
ited her mother, Mrs. Russell 
Rinehart of Waynesburg, re­
cently and renewed friend­
ships with former Waynes­
burg High School classmates 
of the class of 1952. 

Two long-time former resi­
dents of Wind Ridge who are 
sisters celebrated their birth­
day anniversaries recently at 
the Bonar Apartmens in East 
Waynesburg. They were Mrs. 
Goldie Wtight, who was 91 on 
May 4. and Mrs. Jennie Kuhn, 
who was 94 on May 28. 

For many years Mrs . 
Wright was the telephone op­
erator at Wind Ridge. She re­
calls that the job reached its 

peak during the week of the 
annual Jacktown Fair, where 
it became almost a 24-hour a 
day job because of the many 
fair exhi bitors and con• 
cesslonaries who were in the 
community at that time. 

Mrs. Clara Kay Lettingham 
of Florida. a former Waynes­
burg resident, is visiting her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. William 
Blair of Waynesburg R.D.2. 

Among those who turned 
out to honor Glenn Arnold at 
the county 's first " roast '" Sat­
urday were a number of peo­
ple from adjoining counties 
and more distant places.They 
included Werton Mankin from 
Roscoe in Washington County ; 
BillBlount of Smyae, Ga.; 
Julian Fine of Washington ; 
Mr and Mrs. James Reed of 
Addison. and J. T. Kurmasey 
of Duquesne. And best of all , 
of course. was the visit by his 
son-in-law and daughter , 
Carmen and Judy Mancuso, 
who live in the Los Angeles 
area of California and who will 
be spending the remainder of 
this month in Waynesburg. 

The turnout of more than 
300 friends and acquaintences 
of Arnold reflected a broad 
cross section of the county. 
Many interesting facets of 
Arnold 's interesting career 
were recalled by the roasters 
who followed one another to 
the rostrum. 

One, for instance, recalled 
the first money Arnold ever 
earned by selling the Browns­
ville newspaper at Clarksville 
for two cents per copy. An­
other recalled that Arnold, the 
politician, had an early initia­
tion into that profession when. 
at the age of 21 , he was the 
youngest mayor in the Umted 
States after being elected to 
the office at Clarksville during 
the early 1930's. 

Another interesting facet of 
his early career came during 
his first venture into real es­
tate when he hired road wagon 
pulled by a team of mules and . 
sold all of the lots he had laid 
out on a farm near Carmi­
chaels while he stood on the 
wagon. The sale took only 30 
minutes to complete , as 
though it was an omen of the 
growth which the Carmichaels 
area continues to enjoy to this 
day a half century later. 

The craziest is "The Mind 
Murders," by Janwillem Van 
De Wetering (Houghton Mif­
flin . $9.95.) Set in the city of 
Amsterdam, It features two 
very unusual detectives with 
the unpronounceable names of 
Grijpstra and de Gier, who 
discuss philosophy as they ob­
serve that two of their police­
men, Ketchup and Karate, 
have thrown a man into the 
canal. Karate has now jumped 
in to save the man from 
drowning, but he doesn't want 
to be saved. As a crowd 
cheers, the victim pounds the 
policeman on the head with 
the crutch he had previously 

the author knows what she Is 
talking about when she writes 
of the inner secrets of Wash­
ington. With her automatic 
credibility, ii is tempting to 
try to figure out which parts of 
which characters are based on 
real people. The White House 
details are interesting, and the 
plot complicated enough to 
hold your attention. 

Another new mystery 
writer is showing some prom­
ise, too. Her name is Lucille 
Kallen , and her first book, 
" Introducing C.B . Green­
field ," was nominated for an 
American Book Award in 1979. 
Greenfield Is the irascible edi­
tor of a small-town weekly 
newspaper. His star reporter 
narrates the book, and she is 
not exactly Brenda Starr. She 
is forty-five years old, with an 
engineer husband who is 
mostly away on business trips, 
and two sons who are away at 
college. Very Normal. Almost 
as though Erma Bombeck 
turned detective. The banter 
between editor and reporter 
as he sends her out on strange 
and onen embarrassing as­
signments mAkes the book 
amusing. 

After 27 Years Of Teaching MR.ANDMRS.FR\NKW.WILSOri 

By JIM MOORE Co. , died in 1973. Paul is a 1970 when the Graysville when he got home," Gladys Mona Lea Palone And 

1 
used only for walking. It is a 

, weird scene, and since much 
of the action takes place on the 
canal bridge, ii is reminiscent 
of Camus' "The Fall ." but 
carried on to the extremes of 
comedy. 

At another extreme is 
"Murder m the White House,"· 
by Margaret Truman ( Arbor 
House. $9.95. l It could have 
been called "Margaret's Re­
venge," too. Well , the Secre­
tary of State is murdered 
while sitting alone In the White 
House. The President appoints 
a young lawyer to be special 
investigator into this rather 
embarrassing event. The law­
yer starts to unravel the past 
life of the respected Secretary 
of State, which turns out to be 
extremely scandalous, and not 
even the President can be 
eliminated as a suspect. 

The book is written with no 
humor and little style , but of 
course we have to assume that 

In the second book of the 
series "The Tanglewood 
Murder," (Wyndham Books. 
$9.95. l editor and reporter are 
visiting Tanglewood, Mass., 
the summer home of the Bos­
ton Symphony . Someone 
poisons a violinist, and it is up 
to the amateur detectives to 
find the culprit. Actually , all 
C.B. Greenfield wanted was to 
spend his vacation listening to 
the symphony rehearsals, 
which is another endearing 
characteristic of the princi­
pals in the story. They are 
literate, play classical music 
themselves. but they can still 
get into the weirdest situ­
ations. 

- -,,- - ---------i-

Staff Writer Richhill Township supervisor. school was opened. One of the said. "Nowadays, you can ex-
GRAYSVILLE _ A special, Gladys attented California teachers' aides was a familiar peel the parents to come with F nk w Wil w d 

educational experience that State College for two years figure - her sister Madlyn. a lawyer if their child gets a fa 
O 

SO n e 
dates back to 1935 and con- and then received her Madlyn, like her sister, had spanking," she lamented. 
cerns two sisters came to an teaching certificate and a been raising children. She and There were no big, yellow 
end Tuesday at the Graysville position at Maple Glenn school her husband had three chit- buses when she first started 
Elementary School. in West Finley. She also at- dren , Robert P., deceased; teaching. Students walked or 

Gladys A. Day, a veteran of tended Waynesburg College Charles R., manager of the came by horseback or wagon. 
over 27 years in the teaching and West Liberty College. Shop-N-Save market in "Many times we didn't eat all 
profession, said a tearful One of the students in the Waynesburg; and Jerry W.. of our sack lunch in the winter 
farewell to a career that eight grades she taught at Ma- employed by Wheeling Ma- because there was always a 
started with a one-room school pie Glenn was sister Madlyn, chine in Elm Grove, W Va. possibility we would gel snow­
in West Finley Township in who received "orders" from Both attend the Nebo Meth· bound and need to eat supper 
1935 but was interrupted for 18 home that sister or no sister, odist Church and ench have a at school. " 
years while she raised two Gladys was the boss. child celebrating a birthday Gladys recalled the bitter 
children. The warning apparently on December 30. However. winter or 1936 when the snow 

Her retirement Tuesday worked because Madlyn was Jerry was born in 1956 and began to fall early In the day. 
was also a sad occasion for her determined to have an 11th Mark in 1958. They live side• Five worried parents came to 
sister, Madlyn A. Day, who grade aptitude on the basis of by-side and even their phone the school early and led a 
once was her sister 's pupil and her eighth grade achievement numbers are side-by-side - single-file march through the 
later a teacher's aide when test.Giadyswentontoteachat one is 428-4114 and the other's drining snow toward home. 
both came to the Graysville Knob School , Rocky School in is 428-4112. "We looked like a line of 
Elementary School when it West Fmley Township, Sparta Gladys, who was honored at ducks going over the fields ," 
opened in 1970. School In Morris Township a retirement dinner at the Gladys said. 

They are the daughters of and then West Alexander High Greene County Country Club Gladys hopes to do some 
the late Mr . and Mrs. Robert School, where Madlyn was last week, reflected on her traveling during her retire­
Archer and were born and again in her sister 's class. career and noted the many ment including a long visit 
raised in Washington County. At this point , Gladys quit changes. not the least of which with her daughter. 
Gladys was born in Ma- teaching to raise her children, was the $800 annual salary In D • , 0 

8 jorsville and Madlyn m West Marsha McKelvey, a physical 1935. avin 8 pen 
Finley. Not only are they sis• education teacher in the Com- "There was more together• 0 l S 
ters. they also are sisters-in- modore Perry School District ness years ago, " she said. Ut et tore 
law, having married brothers in Mercer County , and Mark, "The teacher knew all the WAYNESBURG - Davin's 
in 1948. who graduated from Carne- parents and there were many furniture stripping shop has 

Gladys was married to g1e-Mellon University last soci~I events at which we got opened an outlet store ·at 153 
Ralph Day on May 29 and a month with a bachelor of sci• to know each other," she East High Street, the former 
week later, Madlyn wed Paul ence degree in electrical eng1• added. location of Denny's Restau· 
Day and many of the flowers neering. "'Discipline was also better rant. 
from the first wedding were After an eighteen-year in the earlier years. When a Owner Miles Davin will con· 
used. Ralph Day, who was absence from the classroom, child got a smacking at school, linue with the stripping shop 
employed by Columbia Gas Gladys returned to teaching in he could expect another one on North Morgan Street. 

- ·I 

CARMICHAELS - Mona 
Lea Palone. daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam Palone of Dry 
Tavern, and Frank W. Wilson , 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Lutton of Vestaburg. were 
married Saturday. May 2. 
1981 , in the Carmichaels 
Christian Church. 

The double ring ceremony 
was performed by the Rev. 
Dominick Sgro , with 
Mrs .Mable Pletcher as or­
ganist and Mrs. Martha Litten 
as soloist. 

The bride was given in mar­
riage by her father She wore 
a white quiana over taffeta 
gown fashioned with a Queen 
Ann neckline. empire waist. 
full , sheer sleeves.and a skirt 
embroidered with appliques of 
venice lace and pearls, with 
the lace-trimmed hemline ex­
tending into a chapel train. 
Her matching Juliet cap held a 
double tiered vell of Illusion 
edged ,n matching lace and 
she carried a bouquet of white 
daisies and blue carnations. 

Cheryl Palone served as 
matron of honor for her sister• 
in-law and Debra Burkette 
wa s maid of honor 
Bridesmaids were Regina 
Palone. Dorothy Adamson and 

Renbie Komula . Christy 
Adamson served as flower ·girl 
and Bradles Miles Palone as 
ring bearer 

The bridegroom was at­
tended by David Summerfield 
as best · man. Ushers were 
David Lee Ward. Johnny 
Wilson. Chip Lutton and Sam 
Palone. 

A reception at the Dry Tav­
ern Inn followed lhe wedding. 
after which the newlyweds ten 
for a wedding trip to Niagara 
Falls. 

The bride 1s a graduate of 
Jeffer so n-Morgan Hi gh 
School The bridegroom. a 
graduate of Beth-Center High 
School. is serving with the 
U.S. Army in Germany. 

LCB Suspends 
LitJUOr License 

The Stale Liquor Control 
Board has lifted the liquor 
license of a Waynesburg lodge 
for seven days for permitting 
gambling or gambling devices 
on the premises. 

The suspension , levied 
against Aerie 598, Fraternal 
Order of Eagles, 52-54 West 
High Street , is effecl1ve June 
23. 
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1797 One Hundred Eighty-Third Auditors Annual Statement County Of Greene 1980 
Financial Report Of Greene County, Pennsylvania, For The Fiscal Year Ending December 31, A.O., 1980 

SUMMARY 
STATEMENT 

OF RECEIPTS 
AND 

EXPENDITURES 
THE SOURCE 
OF COUNTY 

INCOME 
ING GREl!NI COUNTY FINANCIAL REPORT 

TAX STATEMENT 
RUI El!ale ....... ................. ..... ........ ......... 97.218.785.00 
Per C1plla (2•,•70) .................... .. ................. 122.350.00 
Personal Properly ............ .. ............ .. ......... 7.390.•"6.00 

tt1 

tt2 

TAXABLE VALUATION ............................................... 104.731.581 .00 
value of Real Estate Exempt from Taxation........... .. ..... to,211.1•0.oo 115 
TAX RATE : 

Gen1ral County Purpases ............................. 18.5 MIiis 
Personal Propertv ... .............. ..... ........... ... ...... . 4, MIiis 
Per Capita ...... .. ....................................... .. .. 5.00 Each 

LEVY : 
Real Estala .. ............ .................. ... ............ 1.797.550.32 
Per Capita .................... .......... .................. ... 122,350.00 
Personal Properly ......................................... 29.561 .78 

116 
TOTAL CURRENT TAX LEVY ... .................................. 1.U9,"62.10 

GENERAL FUND 
BALANCE -JANUARY I. 1981........................................ (99.751.581 

REVl!NUE RECEIPTS 118 
TAX COLLECTIONS 
Land and Improvement ... ... ...... .............. 86S,882.70 
FrffPOrt Coal .......................................... 80.112.12 
Pittsburgh Coal . ........... ........................ .. 5.S.814.79 
Sewickley Coal .................................... ... 163.091 .17 119 
Waynesburo Coal .......................................... •6.89 
Gas end 011 .......................................... .. ... 3.'58.6' 
1979 TIX Book to May, . 1980 .......... ....... ... . 7.015.0A 
Tax Claim Bureau ................................... 36 • .S7.2A 

TOTAL TAXES COLLECTED ...................... ........ . 
Per Capita ........ ..... ....... .... ...... .... ............. 85.273.55 
From 1979 Duplicate ............................... . 10,032.75 
Prior Years ..................... ...... .................... 1.050.00 

TOTAL PER CAPITA TAXES COLLECTED ......... 
Personal Propertv ............................. ... ... 27,4173 .96 
From 1979 Ouplicate ........... ....................... 2,024.63 
Prior Years ........................ , .......... .. ............ 126.10 

TOTAL PERSONAL PROPERTY TAXES COL· 
LECTEO ................... .............................. ............ . 

II TOTAL PROPERTY 
TAXES COLLECTED ........................... .......... .. . 

Ill LICENSES AND PERMITS ................... ............. .. 
IV COURT COSTS. FINES AND FORFEITS ............ .. 
V REVENUE FROM USE OF MONEY 

AND PROPERTY .................................... ...... . .. 
VI GRANTS AND GIFT!,-FEDERAL 

6A. Growth Manaoement and Housing 
Plennlno . ....... ......................... . ............. 17.197.00 
Trv-Again Homes ........................... .... ... ,8,270.00 
Community Treatment Specialist ........ .. 11 .022.00 
Crime and Oellnquencv ..... ........ .. .... ...... ,s,111.,1 

TOTAL. .................. ................... .. ... ................. ... .. 
68 . STATE 

For Child Welfare Services ..... . ............ 269. 11U7 
For Juvenile Probation 

Probatloo Programs ........ : ................ . 90,u..t. T3 
For Public Assistance .................... 1.607 .7SA .B9 
Community Action 

Dav Care Center ........................... 246,'61.98 
Re imbursement for Court Costs .. ....... 29,Q2l.60 
C.E .T.A. Titles II and VI .................. 389,505.26 
C.E .T.A. Frlnoe Beneflts ................... . 23.026.03 
Adult Probation .. .. .... ...................... ..... 1.670.00 
Juvenile Probation .............................. 5.885 .00 
Highway Safety Grant ......................... 3.210.00 
Emergency Medical Service .... ....... .... . 5,137.50 

a~~e(~~n~~,~~u~;fli~tthe·A~t·s:::::::t~:: 
Rat Control. .... .................. . ................. 6,000.00 
Misc. Receipt from E .E .P .O.P ............. t.200.00 

TOTAL ...... .. ...................... ................ ...... ... ........ .. 
60. TOTAL ...................... .. .. .. ........... .. .... ............. . 

VII DEPARTMENTAL CHARGES 
ANO REIMBURSEMENTS 
A. Treasurer ................... .......... .. .............. 3.732.50 
B. Recorder of Deec11 .................... , ........ .. 58M9.42 
0 . She r lll ................................................. 13,883.99 
F . Prothonotarv ....... .... .. ... .. .. .. ..... ........ .... 27 ,ao,.a, 
G. Clerk of Courts .................... ... ............. .. 3,11S.90 
L. 1 Payments for Mllltarv 

Ballots & Postaoe .............................. ....... 187.87 
M. Tax Clalm Bureau-Lien 

Certificates ....................... ...... ............. . .. .. 570.00 
N. Costs and Fees(T.C.B. ) ....................... 32,899.62 

TOTAL ........ ............. .......... .... ............................. . 
VII PAYMENTS IN LIEU OF TAXES 

B. State Game Lands ..................... .. ......... . 1, .. 37.09 
E . Houslno Authority .................. .. ............. 1.965.56 
F . Public Utility Really Tax ..................... 16.825.53 
G. sewer Treatment Plant ... ......... .. ............. 2S3.58 

TOTAL .... . ....... . .......... ... ......... .......... ... .. .............. . 
IX OTHER REVENUE RECEIPTS 

Sale of Countv Produced Items .................. 2,7'6.00 
State Tax Equalization Board .... ..... .............. 200.60 
Malntt-nance of Childreo In 

Foster Homes1 .. ........................... ..... .. .. 37,097.30 

TOTAL. ..... ............... .. .... .. ...... ......... ... ... .............. . 
X TOTAL REVENUE RECEIPTS ........................... . 

NON-REVENUE RECEIPTS 
XI TEMPORARY LOANS .......... ............................. .. 
XIV SALE OF PROPERTY. . 

SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT ....................... .. .. . 
XVII OTHER NON•REVENUE RECEIPTS 

A. Miscellaneous Receipts . ...... ................. 20,20.22 
8 . Reimbursement for Mental Health ........ 2,660.00 
C. Child Welfare Refunds .. ........ ...... ........... 1,-160 .97 
0. Curry Home Misc. Receipts ..... .. ... . .. .. .. . 1. .. 31.09 
E. Becauests to Curry Memorlal Homa ........ 1,373.76 
F. settlement of Insurance Clalms ............. 1.453.97 
G. Misc. Refunds•Swlmmlng Pool. ............. l.A25 .95 
H. Repayment of Loan by G.c . 1.O ............ 10.000.00 

TOTAL ......................... ......... ........... .......... ...... .. .. 
XVIIITRANSFERS FROM OTHER FUNDS 

XIX 
xx xx, 

101 

A. From Federal Revenue Sharing ......... 'l3S,OOO.OO 
C. From Liquid Fuel for Payroll .... ... ...... .. 28,765.85 
0 . From Child Enforcement Program ..... 1S3,282.S5 
E. From Sinking Fund ............................ 800,000.00 
F . From Liqu id Fuel Fund ....................... 25,633.11 

TOTAL .................... ... .. ....... ............. ......... ...... .... . 
TOTAL NON•REVENUE RECEIPTS ................... . 
TOTAL ESTIMATED RECEIPTS .... ... .. .. ............. . 
TOTAL ESTIMATED 
BALANCES AND RECEIPTS ............ ........ ...... .... . 

GOVERNMENTAL E XPENDITU RES 
I GENERAL GOVERNMENT 

ADMINISTRATIVE 
COMMISSIONERS 

1.1 ... 908.59 
121 

122 
96.356.30 

126 

29.62•.69 

1,870.889.58 
4.006.50 

'9.563.72 

207,971.21 151 

122,207.AS 
152 

153 

15; 

2,691.308.06 
2.813,S15.5A 

155 

157 

180.86' .14 
158 

20.481.76 

159 

160 
AO,OAl.90 

5.187,336.26 

800.000.00 

•27.50 161 

163 

100,0.S.96 165 

1.2,2.681 .51 
2.lAl.157.97 
7 .330.'94.23 

199 

7,230.736.65 201 

Salary of Solicitor ...................................... . 272.88 
Salaries of Deputies and Clerks ............... 26 .959.33 
Wages .. ......... .................... ........ ............... 6. 168.02 
Other Servlces ............. .. ..... ............... ...... ,S.•27.59 
Melerlals and Supplies ............................. 1.843.09 

TOTAL-TREASURER .. .... ........... ........................ . 
DELINQUENT TAX OFFICE 
Personal Services ................................... 25,717, 10 
Other Services .......................................... •.19t .00 
Materials and Supplie s .................. .. ........ I .328.S6 

TOTAL-DELINQUENT TAX OFFICE ... .............. .. 
AUDITORS 
Personal Services ...................... ... . , .... .... 1 .. ,8-18.70 
Other Servlces ....... ....... ...... ... ............ ....... 3.765.32 
Materlall and Supplies ................................ .S7.30 

TOTAL · AUDITORS ...................................... . ... .. 
PLANNING AND ZONING 
Personal Services ................................... 28,152.00 
Other Services .. .. .. .......................... ........ 19,611 .41 
Materials and Supplies .... • ............. .. .. .. ....... .. 200.A9 

TOTAL · PLANNING AND ZONING ......... .. ........ .. 
RECORDER OF DEEDS 
Salary of Recorder ........................... .. .... . 16,S00.00 
Solicitor .............. .......... ......... ............. ... ..... 954.00 
Salaries of Deputy and Clerks ................. 22.476.00 
Waves ...................................................... 2.235.10 
Other Servlces ..... ............. ....... ......... ........ 6,99"35 
Materials and Supplies ... .................... ......... 333.03 

TOTAL· RECORDER OF DEEDS .............. .. ...... .. 
CENTRAL TELEPHONE SERVICE 
Other Services ............... ..... .. ... .. .... ... ...... 29.'62.22 

TOT.l>.L · TELEPHONE SERVICE .. .. .... .. ............. . 
CENTRAL PURCHASING 
Other Services .................. ...... ..... .. ..... .. .. 29.124.92 
Materials and Supplies ..... .. .. .. .................. 7.410.60 

TOTAL · CENTRAL PURCHASING .... ........ .... ..... . 
MICROFILMING AND 
PHOTO RECORDING 
Other Services .. .. .................. .. ........ .... .... 11.721.62 
Mater lall end Supplies ............. .. .. .. .......... 2.099. 76 

TOTAL· MICROFILMING AND 
PHOTO RECORDING ... .. .. ... .......... ..... .. ... . .......... . 
POSTAGE 
Other Services ... . .... ... .............. ....... . ..... .. 28,500.00 
TOTAL · POSTAGE .. .. ..... .. .............................. .. .. . 
FISCAL DIRECTOR 
Personal Services .... .. ...... ...... .. ........ .. ..... 12,180.00 
Other Servlces ..... .. ..... ........ ... .. ..... . .... .. ......... 96.18 

TOTAL · FISCAL DIRECTOR ................... .. ........ . 
TOTAL · ADMINISTRATIVE 
Personal Services ...... ...... .. ...... .............. lt0,119.58 
Other Servlces ............ .... ... ...... .. ............ 206 . .Sl .72 
Materials and Supplies ............ .. ............. . 41,782.77 

TOTAL ADMINISTRATIVE .. .. ... ......................... . 

JUDICIAL 
SHERIFF 
Salary of Sheriff .. ... ...................... .. ... .. .. . 12,500.00 
Sollcllor .. .... ........ .... . ...... .. ...... . ... .. .. ... ... .... 2.721 .U 
Salaries of Deputies and Clerks ... . ...... ..... 90,534.66 
Wages of Special Deputies and Clerks ... .... 4,422.09 
Ottler Servlces ........ ... .......... ..... ... .. ....... .. 17,960.65 
Meterlals and Supplies .. .. ........ ..... . ........... t .oa. .oo 

TOTAL· SHERIFF .. .. .. ..... .. .... .. ...... .. .... ... ........ ... . 
CORONER 
Personal Services ... ..... ........ .. .. .. ..... .. ........ 9,684.00 
Other Servlces ......... .... .. .. ... ............. ......... 5.219.1• 
Materlals and Supplies ......... .. ........ .. .. .... .... . 235.20 

TOTAL · CORONER ................... ................. ... ..... . 

PROTHONOTARY 
Salary of Prothonotary .... .. ...................... 15,SOO.OO 
Salary of Solicitor .. .. ....................... .. .......... 408.00 
Salaries of Deputies and Clerks ...... .. .. .. .. . 22 ,296.10 
Wages ....... ........ .... ........ ....... .................... 2,723.42 
Other Services . ........... . ........... ..... ... .. ........ 8.88..03 
Matorials and Supplies ................. .. ............. 722.3' 

TOTAL· PROTHONOfARY .. .... ............... .. .... ... . .. 
CLERK OF COURTS 
Salary of Clerk ............. .. ........................ 16.SOO.OO 
Solicllor .............. .. ............. .. .. .............. ....... 687.U 
Salaries of Deputies and Clerks .. ............. 23.376.00 
Other Servlces ............ ..... .... ... .................. 2.155.41 
Materials and Supplies ......... .. ................ .. .. . 166.38 

TOTAL · CLERK OF COURTS .. .......................... .. 
DOMESTIC RELATIONS OFFICER 
Personal Services ......... ~ ... , .. ..... . ... , . 1 ......... .. 2,.t02.10 
Other Services .............. .... ... .... ............. .. 28,111 .75 
Materials and Supptles .......... ... ................ 3,795.85 

TOTAL · DOMESTIC RELATIONS OFFICER .... ... 
PUBLIC DEFENDER 
Personal Services ...... ............... .... .. ..... ... 27,58-4.88 
Other Servlces .. . .. ... ........ .......................... 5.097 .98 
Materials and Supplles .... . .. ......................... 627.96 

TOTAL · PUBLIC DEFENDER .......................... .. 
DISTRICT ATTORNEY 
Salary of District Attorney ................ .. ........ 16,500 
Salaries of Assistants, 
Detectives and Clarks .... .. .. ..... ...... .. ........ 25.796.A0 
Other Services . ........ .............. ....... .......... 11,536.62 
Materials and Supplies ... ..................... ..... 3, 16S.1 .. 

TOTAL · DISTRICT ATTORNEY ....... ........ .. .. ...... . 
LAW LIBRARY 
Other Services ... .. ................................... 10,000.00 

TOTAL · LAW LIBRARY .. ..... .. ...... ...... .. :-:::::::=-
COURTS 
Salary of Staff ........................................ 37,«0.SO 
Waves .... ..... ......... . ................................. 58.372.13 
Other Services ...... .................................... 3, 168.67 
Materials and Supplies ............................. 3.3•2.93 

TOTAL · COURTS .. ............................................ .. 
DISTRICT JUSTICES 
Personel Services ....... ........... .... .... .... ..... 33,977.83 
Other Services .......... ................... .. ......... 17.5-16.07 
Materials and Supplies ........................... .. J ,S39.S8 

TOTAL · DISTRICT JUSTICES .............. ::::::::::::::-
CONSTABLES 
Personal Serv ices ...... ... ... ...... ................. ... . 991 .05 

TOTAL · CONSTABLES .. ........ .... .. ......... :-:::::::=-
TOTAL JUDICIAL 
Personal Services .................... ..... ......... ... , .. 18.84 
Other Servlces ........................... ............ 109,680.32 
Matarlals and Supplles ............................ 17,279.38 
TOTAL · JUDICIAL.. ......................................... .. 
TOTAL GENERAL GOVERNMENT 
Personal Servlces .......... .... ....... ... ........ .. 9S5, 198.•2 
Other Servlces ... .. ... ............................... 316,132.0 .. 
Materials and Suoplies ......................... ... 59.062. 15 

TOTAL · GENERAL GOVERNMENT ................. .. 
II CORRECTIONS 

PROBATION AND PAROLE . ADULTS 
Personal Services .... .. .................... .. ....... 19,156 ... S 
Other Servlces ... ... .. .. ... ... ............. ............. 1,078 ... s 
Materials and Supplles . ............ ...... .. .... .. ..... 139.17 

Sala ries of Commissioners ...................... '6,S00.00 202 
TOTAL · PROBATION AND PAROLE .ADULTS. 
PROBATION AND PAROLE · JUVENILES 

102 

105 

106 

107 

108 

109 

Sala ries of Clerica l Staff ... ... .... ............... .. 3,022.16 

:::::,1sina:::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::: .. 1.~~!~:~ 
i~:-:::i't~s ~~~~:mis;ion~rs·eoncss:::::::::.~:~~:~ 
Associa tion Dues and Expenses ................ 1.278.00 

~,e;ri;;1s·and"s~·ppiies::::::::::::::::::::::·.:::::: ~:~::~ 
rg[:t~fg(tMISSIONERS ......... ........... . == 
Salary of Solicitor ..................... ... ........... 11 .020.32 
Salary of Sol lc ltor 's Cler k .... ... ............. ... .. 6,S88.00 

~80~\~0J-0'i~19~Gs ............... ... ... .. .... ::::::::::::::-
sa1ar1es of Staff .. , ............... .. .................. S7,A23 . .t6 

';Yi:i~tiat1t:·water·and·s·M;;;ag~·::::::::.:·:. 1t~:~i 
Other ....................................................... 7.980.10 
Materia ls and supplles ............................. . 1,9-11 .29 

!8i~~ ~0lti1UA'4\~NG ..... ............ == 
~e:,:.~::s s:~~,~~~·p·1·1es::::::::::::::::::::::::::: .. 1t~~:: 
~g~i~~n1l lR~z11:~ATION ........... == 
AND GENERAL ELECTIONS ~::r:!~~~!~~::::~~~~~:.:.· .. :.:.· .. · .. :.:.:.· .. · .. :.:.:.:.:.:.:.:.:.:_:.:.:.:.:.:_.~i:ill:~ 

i~1Aks~~~J',XtfJr°F ELECTIONS ....... == 
b:~~n~ r~r~;!~.~~:::·.:·.:::::::::::::::::::::::::::::.~::~~t : 
Materia ls end Supplies .......... ................... 6,269.79 

iii~~rt!~5,.~~~~~~1s··· .............. == 
~:~~"s

0
~r~~!!~.~~::·.·.:·.:::::::·.:::::::·.:::·.:::·.::::::·.t~}·: 

Materi a ls and Supplles ................................ 2 .. 3:58 

:J:~11~JilJ~HTS AND MEASURES .. ... ::::::::::::::-

Salarv of Treasurer ................... ... ............. . 15,SOO 

11 3.832.90 

17.608.32 

127.782.<3 

18.695.06 

•7.312.48 

105,267.87 

3.95' ... 

205 

206 

208 

209 

299 

302 

3CM 

Personal Services ................. .... .............. 15,S71.92 
Other Servlces ... .. .... ..................... ... ......... 1,10,.01 
Materials and Supplles ....................... .. ... .... 187.03 

TOTAL • PROBATION AND PAROLE · JUVE· 
NILE .................................................................. . 
MAINTENANCE OF ADJUDICATED 
JUVENILES IN PUBLIC TRAINING SCHOOL 
Payments for such Maintenance ......... .... .. 3,133.80 

TOTAL FOR SUCH MAINTENANCE ...... == 
MAINTENANCE OF ADJUDICATED JUVE• 
NILES 
IN PRIVATE TRAINING SCHOOL 
Pevment for such Maintenance ............... 15,369.57 

TOTAL FOR SUCH MAINTENANCE ..... == 
MAINTENANCE OF ADULTS IN 
NON-COUNTY INSTITUTIONS 
Payments for such Malntenance ... ........... 16, .. , ... oo 

TOTAL FOR SUCH MAINTENANCE ..... == 
COUNTY JAIL 

~~~n~r!T::!~~~::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::: ~:::t!: 
Meterlal1 and Supplles .... .. .......... ... ......... 21,056.38 
Capital Outlay .............. .. .......................... 1.900.80 

TOTAL · COUNTY JAIL ......................... == 
TOTAL CORRECTIONS 
Personal Serv ices ...... ............................. 78 ,021 .72 
Other Services ........................................ 63,578.38 
Material s and Supplles ............................ 21,382 . .51 
Capital Outlay .......................................... 1,900.80 

TOTAL · CORR E CTI ONS .... .. ................. ::::::::::::::-
111 WELFARE 

COUNTY HOME 
COUNTY HOME ADMINISTRATION 
Se larv of superintendent ......................... 1S,34.00 

i~~~1
~

1
e~!1~e~t.~~~~.~~~.~'. ~.~~~.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.'.' ~~;~;:: 

Mater ial , and SUPPiies ............................. 2.867.2• 

TOTAL · COUNTY HOME ADMINISTRATION ..... 
COUNTY HOME POWER PLANT 
Sa larv of Engineers ............. ................... 16,16'l,.t6 

TOTAL · COUNTY HOME POWER PLANT ......... . 

306 COUNTY HOME NURSING CARE 

56, 170.91 

309 

31.236.66 

311 

19. 101.32 314 

320 
47.963.90 

49.A92 .,8 
322 

29.-162 .22 

326 

36.535.52 329 

339 

13.821 .38 

28.S00.00 399 

12.276. 18 

AOl 

759.0U.07 

so; 

602 

129.223.2A 

603 

15.138.3' 

60A 

so.53J.B9 605 

606 

43.ffl.63 601 

74.309.70 608 

33.310.82 609 

56.998.16 

10.000.00 
610 

102.32•.23 
611 

612 
613 

55.063 • .S 615 
618 
620 
622 

991 .0S 
623 
625 
626 

571 .378.SA 627 
621 

629 

630 
1,330.392.61 

631 

633 
63A 
635 

20,374.07 
637 

6', 

6'S 
699 

17,-163.02 

3,13J.80 

701 

199 

15,369.57 899 

t6 ..... oo 

Salarlu of Phys icians and RN• , ............ 13A,963.99 
SalarlH at Othar Slalf-Aldes .................. 661.287.25 
Wages ..... ... .. ...................... ....... ...... ...... .. . 9.-167 .02 
Physical Therapy ........ .. .... ........... ........ .. , . B.400.00 
Materials end SUPPlies ............................ 86.251.89 

TOTAL · COUNTY HOME NURSING CARE ... .... .. 
TOTAL C:OUNTY HOME 
Personal Services .. ...... . ............. . ........ 1,246,36S.JS 
Olher Servlces ..................... ... ......... ...... 120.065.07 
Materials and Supplies .......................... 222,820.49 

TOTAL . COUNTY HOME .................. .. ..... .. ....... .. 

ADULT WELFARE SERVICES 
ADULT FOSTER CARE 
Other services ............................................ 250.00 
OUTDOOR RELIEF 
Other Servlces .......................................... 1,620.73 

TOTAL · ADULT WELFARE SERVICES ........... .. . 
JUVENILE WELFARE SERVICES 

CHILO WELFARE GENERAL SUPERVISION 
Salary of Child Welfare Director ............. 23. 162.AO 
Salaries of Child Welfare Workers ........... B1,12•.s2 
Salaries of Other Stalf .... ......................... 23,860.08 
Other Services .... .. ............ .. ...... . ............. 22.902.83 
Materials and Supplies ... ............ .... ......... . 1.147.86 

TOTAL · CHILO WELFARE 
GENERAL SUPERVISION ........... . . ....... ............. . 
MAINTENANCE OF CHILDREN IN FOSTER 
FAMILY HOME UNDER SUPERVISION OF 
COl,NTY CHILD WELFARE AGENCY 
Peyments for such Maintenance ....... .. ... 112,980.50 
Other .. ......................... .. .... ..... ... .. ........... 19.072.43 

TOTAL · FOR SUCH MAINTENANCE ................. . 
MAINTENANCE OF DEPENDENT CHILDREN 
IN PRIVATE INSTITUTIONS 
Payments for such Maintenance ................... ... ... .. 
DAY CARE PROGRAM 
Other Servlces ...... ... .. . .... ................... .. .. 250.080.BB 

TOTAL ·DAY CARE PROGRAM ......... ... .... . .. .. .... . 
TOTAL JUVENILE WELFARE SERVICES 
Personal Servlces . .... .. .... .................. ..... 134,147.00 
Other Servlces . ....................... .. ... .. .... .. .. 561 .286.77 
Materials and Supplies ... .. ............. .. ......... 1,1'7.86 

TOTAL · JUVENILE WELFARE SERVICES .. ... ... 
TOTAL WEtFARE 
Personal Services ... . ........ ............ ....... 1,380,S12.3S 
Other Servlces ..... .... .. .. ......... ...... ...... ..... 6113.222.57 
Materials and Supplies ..... ..... ..... ........ ... 223.968.35 

TOTAL· WELFARE .. .... .. ......... .. ........... ...... .. .... .. 
IV HIGHWAYS 

MAINTENANCE OF ROADS ANO BRIDGES 
Personal Services ... . ..... . .................. .. .... . 26,93 ... .0 
Other Services ....... .. ................. ... ... ..... .. . 38,583.16 
Materials and Supplies ............... .. ............ .. ,278.8.-1 

TOTAL · HIGHWAYS ... .. ........... .... ......... ......... ... .. 
V HEALTH AND HOSPITALS 

MENTAL HEALTH/ MENl:AL 
RETARDATION SERVICES 
Other Services . .. .. ... ..... .............. ....... . ..... 39.627 . .S 

TOTAL · HEALTH ANO HOSPITALS ........... .... .. .. 
VI MISCELLANEOUS 

CIVIL DEFENSE 
Other Services .... . ....... . ... ... ................... .... 3,2 .. l.01 
Materials and Supplles .. ... .. .. .............. ... .. . ... . 667 . .(7 

TOTAL· CIVIL DEFENSE ............ ... ........ .. ........ .. 
MILITARY AFFAIRS 
Personal Services ... ... .......... .......... .. .. . .... 18,088.00 
Other Services .. .. ... .......... ............. ... .. ..... 16.405.31 
Materials and Supplies ...... ... ................ .. .. 1,786.13 

TOTAL · MILITARY AFFAIRS ...... ........... .... .... .. . 
AIRPORTS 
Personal Services ....... ... ..... ...... .............. 40,:i.o.o• 
Other Services .. .............. ... ................... .. 25.'56.23 
Materials and Supplles .................. ... ... .... 6-(, 199.9 .. 

TOTAL · AIRPORTS .................................... ....... . 
LIBRARIES 
Other Services ....... .... ... ...... .................... 17 ,SOO.OO 

TOTAL· LIBRARIES ......................................... .. 
TOURISM 
Other Services ......... .......... ....................... .. ,300.00 

TOTAL· TOURISM ...................... ... .. .................. . 
PARKS 
Personal Services ......... . ... .. .................... 29,S2.(.45 
Other Servlces ..... .,., ....... ~ ................ rt., ... , . .- 60,965.SS 
Materials and Supplies ............... .. .. ... ...... 19,153,58 

TOTAL· PARKS ............ ........ .. ............ ............. . .. 
RECREATION 
Personal Services ........ ... .. ........ .... .. ..... ... 67,476.54 
Other Services ... . ..... .... ...... .. . .................. 62, .. 48.31 
Materials and Supplles ............................ 19,277.79 

TOTAL · RECREATION .. .................................... . 
EMPLOYEE BENEFITS 
OTHER SERVICES 
1. Payments to Retirement fund .............. 63 ,7 .. 9.S2 
2. Soclal SecurllY .......... .................. .. ... .. 175,70.'9 
3. Hospltallzatlon . ..... ... ........... .... ............ 86 .946.27 
... Life Insurance ................... ....... ....... .... 33,203.27 
5. Service Employees lnternat lonal 

Unlon .. ........... ......... ........... ........................ 8.32 
6. Unemplovment Compensatlon ..... ......... « ,S18.63 

~: ~~\~~,;;:;· c~~~~~::::::::::::::::::::::::::::.·:::::::.~ ~~:: 
TOTAL· EMPLOYEE BENEFITS .......... .. ... .. . ... .. 
INSURANCE 
OTHER SERVICES 
Fire ........ ..... .. .. .. ................ .... .. ............... 13,930.00 
LlablillY ................................................. 57,A28 .00 
Workmen's Compensation ...................... . 56,191 .00 

TOTAL · INSURANCE ........ , ............................... . 
HISTORICAL AND 
CIVIC ASSOCIATIONS .... ........ ............... .. ..... ... ... . 
FIRE COMPANIES ... ............... ................ .. ....... .. . 
AGRICULTURAL E XTENSION 
SERVICES ........... ... .......... .. ... ........ ..................... . 
UNPAID BILLS OF PRIOR YEARS ... ............ ..... . 
COUNTY FAIRS AND FARM SHOWS ...... .. ........ .. 
INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT .... .. ................ .... . 
REDEVELOPMENT · S. W. PA. 
WATER AUTHORITY ........................................ .. 

ti~\'o~,lEt:tJ~~~·Ni'rv·iic·i'::::::.·::::::::::::::::. 
COMPREHENSIVE EMPLOYMENT 
TRAINING ACT ... ... . .. ........................ ................ .. 
TRY-AGAIN HOMES .. ........................................ . 
GOVERNOR'S JUSTICE COMMISSION· 
COMMUNITYTREATMENT SPECIALI ST ......... .. 
GOVERNOR' S JUSTICE 
COMMISSION · 1977 .... ... ..................................... . 
GOVERNOR•S JUSTICE 
COMMISSION · 1978 ......... .... ............. ............ .. ... . . 
GOVERNOR•S JUSTICE 
COMMISSION • 1979 .......................................... .. 
HIGHWAY SAFETY ACT ........... ... ...................... . 
EMERGENCY MEDICAL SERVICE .. ................ .. 
WARRIOR TRAIL. ... .... ... ................................... .. 
EMERGENCY EMPLOYMENT PARK S 
DEVELOPMENT PROGRAM ........... .... .. .... .... .. .. . 
GREENE COUNTY COUNC IL 
ON THE ARTS ..................... ...... ......... ................ . 
RAT CONTROL ................................................. .. 
TOTAL MISCELLANEOUS 
Personal Services ........ .......................... 1S5, .. 29.0J 
Other Services ... .............. ................... 1,A26,814.S6 
Materials and Supplies .......................... 185,017.57 
Capital Outla y ......... .............................. 2A7,168.31 

TOTAL · MI SCELLANEOUS .............................. .. 
VII INTEREST 

INTEREST ON TEMPORARY LOANS .... 29.127.36 

TOTAL INTEREST .................................... ........ .. 
TOTAL GOVERNMENTAL EX P E NDI TUR ES 
Persona l Services ............................... 2,S96,095.92 
Otht-r Se rvices .................................... 2,568,028.19 
Materl a ls and Supplies .......................... •93,709.•9 
CaPllal OutlaY ....................................... 2'9.069. 11 
Interest .................................................. 29,827.36 

TOTAL · GOVERNMENTAL E XP E:WI T URE S ... 
NON-GOVERNMENTAL EXPENDITURES 

IX DEBT REDEMPTION 
92.099.0

2 
901 TEMPORARY LOANS REPAIO ............ 839.795.00 

TOTAL . DEBT REDEMPTION .................. ........ . 
X TRANSFERS 

1001 TRANSFERS TO SINKING FUND ........ 829.827.36 

16'.883 . .S 1299 
TOTAL · TRANSFER S ...... .................... ............... . 
TOTAL NON -GOVERNMEN T AL EX P E N• 
OITURE S ........................................................... . 

1399 TOTAL EXPENDITUR ES ................................... . 
1•99 BALANCE AT END OF YEAR ........................... .. 
1599 TOTAL ESTIMAT ED E XP E NDIT URES 

AND BALANCES ...... .. .................. ..................... .. 
FEDERAL REVENUE SHARING FUND 

BALANCE FROM PREVIOUS YEAR ................. .. 
Transfe r from Genera l Fund ................... 20,000.00 6'.94 • . 06 

t. 
5. 
6. General Revenue Sharing Gran t ............ 366,105.00 

161162.-16 

21. TOTAL BALANCE ANO RECEIPTS ....... ............. . 
EXPENDITURES 

Grants ....... ...... .... ................................... 38.000.00 
Assassmont • L. Robert Kimball .............. 26.9'0.26 
Greene County Civil Defense .................... S.000.00 
Recreation · Swimming Pool ....... ............ 75.805 . .a 

900.370.15 His torical SocletY ............ ......................... 2.500.00 
Fire Companles .................... .................... 6,000.00 

1001 Transfers lo General Fund ................................. .. 
1,589.250.91 

1399 Total E xpenditures .............................................. . 
1'99 Balance al End,. Year ...................................... .. 
1599 Total Expenditures and Balance ........... .. ....... . .... .. 

1. 

1.870.73 9• 

158,197.69 

1399 

192.052.93 1'99 
1599 

96.250.13 t. 

250.080.88 

9. 

696,581.63 

2,287.703.27 

69.796.AO 

39.627 • .S 

3.908.48 

36.279 ... 

129.996.21 

11.soo.oo 

. NEW COUNTY JAIL 
BALANCE FROM PREVIOUS YEAR .................. . 
OTHER REVENUE RECEIPTS 
A. Loans from First National Bank 

& Trust Co .......... .. ...... .. ..... .... ... .. ..... .. . 857.792.71 

TOTAL BALANCE AND RECEIPTS .. ................. .. 
PURPOSE OF EXPENOITURES 

Chapman Corparatlon ..................... ....... . s .. ,020.99 
Electrical Service Co .... .......... ..... .. ... .. ... 169.093.25 
Frank trey, Jr ...... ................................. 367,229.SO 
Whitby Plumbing & Air Condltlonlno ..... 1"6,489.58 
Harry C. Partridge, Jr ................ ..... ....... 58.860.00 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES .................. .. ...... ........ .. 
BALANCE AT ENO OF YEAR . TOTAL ...... ........ . 
TOTAL EXPENDITURES AND BALANCES ...... .. 

COUNTY FAIR 
BALANCE FROM PREVIOUS YEAR 
Cash In Bank .......................................... 10.577.9' 
Investments ..... .... .. ... ............. ................. 51 ,676.95 

TOTAL BALANCE ........ .. ................................... .. 
OTHER REVENUE RECEIPTS 
A. State Aid .................. .. ............... ........ ... BAI .91 
B. Interest on Certlficates ......................... S,939.8 .. 
C. Class and Harness Entry Fees .............. 5,2..(9.50 
D. Space Rental • Inside, Outside, 
and Restaurant ....................................... !1,8,o.oo 

E . Carnival ......... .................................... 11 ,500.00 
F. Gate and Grandstand Admission ......... 25,46.t.96 
G. Cooler Blankets ..... .. . .. ..... .. ..................... 380.00 
H. Safety Program and Program Sales ........ 230.1 6 
I. Cancelled Checks for 1978 and 1979 ........... 3'1.36 
J. Collected for Previous Years ...... .. ........... 120.00 

TOTAL· BALANCES ANO RECEIPTS ....... ...... .. .. 
PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE 

Class Premiums and Racing Purses ........ 48,0 .. 6 ... 0 
Harness and Flat Race Expenses & 
Track Maintenance ......................... ......... 5,831 ... 2 
Grandstand Entertainment ....................... 9,829.50 
Advertising, Printing, Postage, Telephone 
and Supplles ............................ ................. 5,328.57 
Judges. Official Aides. Office Help. 
and Member Expenses ............................. s, .. 29 . .s.t 
Home and Garden Help, 
and Maintenance ........... ..... .............. ...... 2,547.93 

Pollce, Custodians Ticket-Sellers & 
Gate Salemen ........................................ ... 3,816.88 
Payroll Tax ....................................... ....... 2,055.39 
License, Dues, Ribbons, and Cooler 
Blankets .................... - ................. ... .... ..... 1.295.57 
Wllson ·Radio and Electricians .. ..... .. ............ 772.00 
Porta.Johns, OIi for 
Roads and Parking ........... ........................ 2,080.00 
Loader tor Barn, Scales, Blocks, Sled 
& Loos ... ......................................... .... .... 1,652.50 

Garbage and Mlscellaneous ... . ... .. ................ .. 21 .SO 
Return of Change .... ..................................... 61 .00 
Purchase of Land ...................... .. ............ 12,000.00 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES .... ... . ........................... . 
U99 BALANCES AT ENO OF YEAR 

4.300.00 

1599 

109.643.58 1. 

149,202.6' 

1499 
1599 

1. 
AS. 
AlB. 

21 
,o •. 301.00 

628 

1499 
1599 

127.5'9.00 
1. 

2.soo.00 6B 
600.00 

!BA 
28.000.00 21 

369.971.07 

1i:ggg:: AO! 

5.ooo.oo 
5.090.25 

11 .300.00 

387,707.33 
.a.210.00 .05 

11 .91 3.04 

19.653.00 
628 

1101 
35,587.95 

Cash in Bank ..... ..... .......... ....... .. ..... .... ........ 742.87 
securities and Investments Held ............. 58,251.SS 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES ANO BALANCES ........ 
AIRPORT IMPROVEMENT FUND 

BALANCES FROM PREV IOUS YEAR ... •2. .. 9.4J 
TOTAL BALANCES AND RECEIPTS ................. .. 

PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE 
Michael Baker, Jr ....... .. ........ .. ................. 9,960.21 
Fritch Construct ion Co ............................ 3',576 ... 3 
Pittsburgh Testing Laboratory ..... ..... .. ........ 29--4 ... 9 

TOTAL EXPENDITURES ...... ... ... ....................... . 
BALANCES AT END OF YEAR ......................... .. 
TOTAL E XPENDITURES ANO BALANCES ...... .. 

SINKING FUNDS 
BALANCES FROM PREVIOUS YEARS .............. . 
INTEREST ON BANK BALANCE S ...................... . 
TRANSFERRED FROM GENERAL FUND ......... . 

TOTAL BALANCES ANO RECEIPTS ........... .. .... .. 
PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE 

TRANSFERRED TO GENERAL FUND ...... .. ...... . 

BALANCES AT END OF YEAR .......................... . 
TOTAL ESTIMATEU E XPENDITURES 
AND BALANCES .............. .... .............................. . 

COUNTY LIQUID FUELS TAX FUND 
CASH IN BANK FROM PREVIOUS YEAR ......... .. 
STATE LIQUID FUELS TAX GRANT ................ . 
MISCELLANEOUS RECEIPTS .......................... .. 
TRANSFERS FROM GENERAL F UND .............. . 
TOTAL BALANCES AND RECEIPTS ................. .. 

PURPOSE OF EXPENDITURE 
MAINTENANCE OF ROADS AND BRIDGES 
1. Persona l Services .... ............. .. ............. 28,908.07 
2. Other Servlces ..................................... 17,689.61 
3. Mater ials and Supplies .......................... 9,700.28 

TOTAL · MAINTENANCE OF ROADS 
ANO BRIDGE S ................................................... . 
OISCRETIONAL GRANTS TO MUNICIPALI T IES 
2nd Class Townships ................................. .. ........ .. 
MISCELLANEOUS E X PENDITUR ES 
SOClal Security .................................................... . 
A. TRANSFER TO GENERAL FUN D ................ .. 

13.192.92 1399 TOTAL EXPENDITURES ...... ............................ .. 

A.517.95 :~:: ~~i:~~~¢i1;~~a°F YEAR ............................ . 
3•:~:: EXPENDITURES AND BALANC E .................... .. 

676. 11 

5.ooo.oo 
6,000.00 

2.01 •.•99.• 7 

GREENE COUNTY AIRPORT 
RECEIPTS : 
Gasol lne Sales .. ..................................... 70,7.53 ... l 
Hanger and Restaura nt Rent .................. 22,081.00 

TOTAL REC E IPTS ........ ..................................... . 
TOTAL AMOUNT P AID TO TR EASURE R .......... . 

REPORT OF MAGISTERIAL DISTRICTS 
John C. Watson, Maglste rla l Dis trict l l-0J-01 ........ . 
Ruth Hughes, Magiste r ia l Distr ic t 13-03·02 ........... . 
Emll Bertug ll, Magls te r la l Distr ic t 13-03·03 .......... . 

388.478.4' 

15•.2•5.7' 
235,000.00 

389.2•5.7• 
·161.30 

388,A78 ... 

125,061.99 

857,792.71 

982,85A.70 

795,693.32 
187,1 ~1 .38 
982,854.70 

62,254.89 

97.907.73 
160. 162.62 

101 . 168.20 

58.994.42 
160.1 62.62 

•2 ... 9.Al 

...831.13 
-2,381.67 

A2,449.'6 

t.Jt7 .09 
561.AO 

829.827.36 

831.711.85 

829,827.36 

831 .711 .85 

52.01 9.55 
97.536.68 

"68.53 
25.000.00 

175.024.76 

56,297.96 

•0.000.00 

1.922.38 
25,633.11 

12J.853.•5 
51.171.31 

m .02•.16 

92.83A.•1 
I0J,205.95 

10.036.98 
17.1 11 .17 
5.775.08 

TOTAL . MAGI STERIAL DIST RI CT ..................... 32,923.23 

29.927.36 

S.936.730.07 

839.795.00 

829.827.36 

1.669.622.36 
7.606,352.Al 

-375.615.78 

7 ,230.736.65 

1,673 ..... 

386.105.00 

COST OF OPERAT ING 
MAGIST ERIAL DISTRI CTS................................. 55.063 . .S 

COMPREHENSIVE EMPLOYMENT TRAINING ACT 
BALANCE • J ANU ARY 1, 1980 ................ 92,J t3.75 
RECEIPTS · 1980 .................................. 397.161.8' 

TOTAL RECE IPTS ANO BALA NCES .................. . 
DI SBUR SEMENTS: 
C.E .T.A. Pay roll Account ........................ , o,sl ... 73 
BALANCE . JANUARY 1, 1981 ........................... .. 

CO. C. SECOND BATTALION, 110th INF , 
BALANC E • J ANUARY t . 1980 ................... A55.35 
DEPOSITS - From Cbuntv of Gre-ene ........ 1..S00.00 

Other Deposits ................... 255.0S 

TOTAL REC E IPTS AND BALANCES ................ .. 
E XPENDITUR ES ............................................... . 
BALANCE • JANUARY I. 1981 ........................... . 

GREENE COUNTY INDUSTRIAL 
DEVELOPMENT, INC . GENERAL FUND 

BALANCE • JANU ARY 1. 1980 ........................... .. 
RE CE IPTS: 
GRANTS: 
Commonwea lth of Penna .......................... 1,526.00 
Countv of Greene .................................... 51 ,SOO.OO 
Cente r Townshi p ......................................... 283.00 
Ca rmlchae lt Boro ....................................... JOc.oo 
Fra nklin TownshlP ................................... 1,500.00 
w1vnesburg Boro ....................................... 750.00 
Cumberland Townar, lp .............................. 1,500.00 

(Continued on Next Pa11eJ 

.S9.•75.59 

•&.960.86 

2.210.•o 
1,873.07 

JJ7 .33 

S.7'5.0A 

- - - - - ·------------------------ --------- ----------- --------------·------------ - --,, 
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AAA Mobile Services Schedule ( County Obituaries 
WAYNESBURG - The has announced the schedule 
Southwestern Pennsylvania for' Its mobile services for the 
Arca Agency on Aging (AAA) month of June. 

Public Notices Public Notices 
(Continued from Preceding Pagel 

The unit will be at the Car­
michaels Senior Citizens Cen­
ter on June 8, the Bobtown 
Community Center on June 9 
and the Hewitt Presbyterian 
Church at Rices Landing on 
June 11. 

Transferred From Gift Accounl.. ............. 88,7.el.13 
Mlscel laneous ................ ............. ... ......... 10,056.00 
Contractual Services ............................... 28,535.61 

TOTAL RECEIPTS ANO BALANCES ................. .. 
DISBURSEMENTS : 

100 ADMINISTRATION 
101 Salarles ... ........................................ .. 33,756.00 
102 lnsuranct .. .. .............. .. ............ .. ........ 22,851 .18 
103 General Office ... ...... .. ........... .. ...... .. .... ,,231.60 
10, Dues and Perlodlcals .... .. .... ........... .. .... .. 969.17 
105 Consulfanls ..... ..... ........ .. .......... .. . ........ 2,050.00 
106 Rent ........... ............ .... ..... ........ ... ....... . 6,s,s.oo 
107 Miscellaneous .... . ..... ....... ........ .. .. ........ ... 2,6.S0 

TOTAL ............................. ................ ........ .. .. .. .... .. 
110 PROSPECT SOLICITATION 

111 Travel. .. .. .. ... ... ............ .. ............... .. .... , ,737.47 
112 Lodging .. .. ............ .. ....... ... .. ....... .. .... ... ... 154.56 
113 Meals .... .. ...... ... .. . ...................... .. ...... . 2,2'3.00 
11' Telephone ........ ......... .. ... .... .. ........... .. ... . 889.59 
11 s Miscellaneous .. ... ... ..... .. ..... .. .......... ... ..... n,.oo 

TOTAL ...... .. .... ...... .... ................... ...... ... ... .... .... ... . 
120 PROGRAM EXPENSE 

121 Studies and Survey .. . .... .. .................. .. 1,193.80 

18•,695.7• 
190,4'0.78 

70,6•9.45 

8,758.62 

This program utilizes a spe­
cially designed 35-foot mobile 
unit which carries 
professionally trained staff 
and volunteers. Services 
available include multl-phasic 
health screenings, arts and 
crans, legal services, a noon 
meal, films, recreational ac­
tivities, casework services 
and Information on such topics 
as Social Security, Sup­
plemental Security Income 
(SS1), food stamps and Medi­
care. 

Appointments are required 
for the health screenings and 
can be made by calling the 
following numbers: Carmi­
chaels, 966-2290; Bobtown, 
!IS9-7162 and Rices Landing, 
852-1510. 

122 Advertising and Promotion ................. 3,892.64 
123 Olher Proiects ....... .. ...... ........ .. .... .... 100,,3U2 

' These services are avail­
able to anyone age 60 or older 

TOTAL.. ...... ............... ......... ... .. . .. .. ..... ........ ..... .. .. . 105,521 .26 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS.. . ...... ... ... .. ..... ... .. .. .. ... 18",929.33 
BALANCE - JANUARY 1, 1981... ........................ 5,511.•S 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ANO BALANCES..... .. 190,«0.78 

GREENE COUNTY INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENT, INC. 
COUNTY DEVELOPMENT FUND 

RECEIPTS : 
BALANCE - JANUARY I, 1980.... .. .... ... .. .. .. ..... ... 4,589.•6 
Received from County ............. .. ....... ... .. 18,500.00 
Transfers ............. ............. .... ...... ... .. •. ..... 4,989.59 

23,.89.59 

TOTAL RECEIPTS ANO BALANCES ....... ... .. .. ... .. 
DISBURSEMENTS 

200 ADMINISTRATION 
201 Salaries .. .... ............. ........ .. ..... ...... ..... 11 4'8.00 
202 Insurance ........ .. . ... ... ...... ... ... .... , ......... 2,7••.24 
203 General Olllce .. .... ............... .. ...... .. .. ...... 285.00 
204 Dues and Perlbdlcals ........ ... .... .. .. ... ....... •S9.00 
205 Mlsc:ellaneous •..•••• .•••.••••• .. ••..•• •. .•. .••.. •.. ••• .. --·· 

TOTAL ADMINISTRATION .. .. .. .. . ... .. .. .... ........ ... .. 
210 COUNTY DEVELOPMENT EXPENSES 

211 Travel .. .. .. .. ..... .. .... .. .. .. ..... .. ... .. ... .. ........ 757.56 
212 Lodging .. .. .... ... ......... ... ....... . .. .. ... ......... .. 471 .23 
213 Meals ..... ... .......... .... ... ... .......... ..... .... ... .. 601.71 
214 Telephone .... ..... ... ......... .. .......... ..... .. ... 3,183.61 
215 Mlscellaneous ... .................... ...... .... .. .... . 679.35 
TOTAL ... ..... ..... ... ........ .... .... .. .......... ... .. ... ... ......... . 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ... . ... .. .. ................ .. .. .. . 
CLOSING BALANCE - JANUARY 1, 1981 ... ..... .. .. 
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS ANO BALANCES .. .... . 

FAMILY SERVICES OF GREENE COUNTY 
JOHN C. GRAHAM, DIRECTOR 

FINANCIAL REPORT 
OF 

AOULT PROBATION AND PAROLE SECTION 
FOR THE YEAR OF 1910 

BEGINNING JANUARY 1, 1910 
ENDING JANUARY 1, 1911 

Balance on Hand - Januarv 1, 1980 .. .. .. ... ..... .. ............. .. 
NSF check from previous year cleared , .......... .. ..•.. ... .•... 

Monies Received - 1980 ........................ ............. .. ....... .. 
Monies Disbursed - 1980 .. ... .. . . . . ... . . ............ ....... ..... .. . ... . 

Clerk of Courts ........... .. .... ........................ .. . S55,327.99 
Restitution ....... ........ .•... .. ... ............................ 9,97,t.57 
Maglstrate ... ... .... ... .............. .... .. .. ... ..... .. .. . ... .... . 161 .00 
Olher Courls ...... . ................... ...... ... .... ........ ...... 120.00 
Refunds ......... .. .......... .. .. ..... ..... ...... .. ..... .. .. ........ 129.50 

Balance on Hand - January 1, 1981 ......... .. ...... . .... ... .. ... . 
Commonwealth of Pennsylvania 
County of Greene 

ss: 

28,079.05 

14,936.24 

5,693.46 
20,629.70 

7,449.35 
28,079.05 

$3,101.94 
175.00 

3,276.94 
62,683.67 
65,713.06 

2•7.55 

I , John C. Graham, Director of Famfly Services and Chief Officer, 
Adult Probation and Parole Section, Court of Common Pleas, In and for 
the County of Greene, Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, hereby deP0se 
and say that the foregoing ls a true and correct statement of all monies 
received and disbursed by this office for and during the year 1980. 

John C. Graham 
Director, Family services 

Chief Probation Officer 
SWORN TO ANO SUBSCRIBED 
BEFORE ME 
THIS 29th DAY 
OF JANUARY, 1981. 
MITZ L. DAVIS, 
Not ary Public 

FAMILY SERVICES OF GREENE COUNTY 
JOHN C. GRAHAM, DIRECTOR 

FINANCIAL REPORT 
OF 

JUVENILE PROBATION OFFICE 
FOR THE YEAR OF 1980 

BEGINNING JANUARY 1. 1980 
ENDING JANUARY 1, 1981 

Balance on Hand, January \ , 1980 ......... .. .. ... ..... Sl,7.Cl.47 
Monies received In 1980 .. •... .......................... ..... 5,085.66 

Oisbur ~ements - 1980 
Clerk of Courts ........ ................... .. ... ...... ......... s -0· 
M agistrates ............... ..................... .......... .... .. ... 2,028.00 
Restitution ................. ....................................... 2,206.61 
Treasurer ............ ..... .... .... ............ .. .... ... ..... .... ..... . -Q. 
Other .... .......................................... ............. .. ... 1,396.61 

Balance on Hand, January 1, 1981. ........ ........ .. .............. . 
COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA 
COUNTY OF GREENE 

ss : 

$6,829.13 

S,631 .22 
Sl,197.91 

I , Nancy S. Brozlk, Probation Officer, Juvenile Probation Section, 
Court of Common Pleas, In and for the County ofGreene, Com­
monwealth of Pennsylvania, hereby depose and say that the foregoing Is 
a true and correct statement of all money received and disbursed by me 
for and during the year of 1980. 

Nancy S. Brozlk 
Probation Officer 

Report received and approved : 
John C. Graham, Director 

Family Services 
SUBSCRIBED TO ANO SWORN 
BEFORE ME 
THIS 28th DAY 
OF APRIL, 1981. 
MITZI L. DAVIS 
NOTARY PUBLIC 

FAMILY SERVICES OF GREENE COUNTY 
JOHN C. GRAHAM, DIRECTOR 

FINANCIAL REPORT 
OF 

DOMESTIC RELATIONS SECTION 
FOR THE YEAR OF 1910 

BEGINNING JANUARY 1, 1910 
ENDING JANUARY 1, 1911 

Balance on Hand, January 1, 1980 ................... $11 ,770.59 
Total Amount Received, 1980 ........... ............ .. . 657,692.80 $669,463,39 

DISBURSEMENTS : 
Payments In Support .. ....... ... .................... ...... 650,229.50 
Payments to Treasurer ............ .................. .. ...... 4,683.lA 
Payments to Clerk of Courts .............................. 1,178.10 
Payments to Other ............. .... ..... ........... ...... ..... 5,390.,tl 
Payments to Escrow ......................................... 7,962.04 669,4-43 .39 

Balance on Hand, December 31 , 1980...................... ...... . s 7,982.04 
COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA, 
COUNTY OF GREENE 

ss :-
1, Thomas Glaser, Domestic Relations sect ion in and for the County 

Greene, Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, hereby depose and say that 
the foregoing is a true and correct statement of 111 money received and 
disbursed by me for and during the year of 1980. 

SUBSCRIBED TO ANO SWORN 
BEFORE ME THIS 2NO OAY 
OF FEBRUARY, 1981. 
MITZI L. DAVIS 
NOTARY PUBLIC 

Thomas Glaser, Domestic Relations 
Section 

Report received and approved : 
John C. Graham, Director, Family 

Services 

COMMONWEALTH OF PENNSYLVANIA, 
COUNTY OF GREENE 

SS :• 
On this fourteenth day of May, A .O., 1980, before me, personally 

appeared the undersigned, Vlola G. Donovan, Genevieve M . Morrow, 
Betlv June Long, Auditors of Greene County, Pennsylvania, who being 
duly sworn, depese and say thal lhe foregoing Audit , with an Itemized 
Statement of the same, consisting of two (2) books, flied In the 
Prothonotary' s Office has been prepared from the original books, 
papers, and records of said County, and !hat we have carefully 
examined the seme and declare the same to be a complete and correct 
statement of the financial transaction and condlrlons of said County, In 
respect to each and every matter therein set forth to the best of our 
knowledge, information, and belief , for the period January 1, 1980 • 
December 31, 1980. 

Subs.cribed and sworn to 
before me this fourteenth 
day of May , 1981. 
Charles T. Hogue 
Prothonotary 

Viola G. Donovan 
Genevieve M . Morrow 

Betty June Long 

6-5·81 

Public Notices 
EXECUTRIX NOTICE 

ESTATE OF LENA M. DOW of 
Rices Landing Borough Greene 
County, Pennsylvania, deceased. 

Letters testamentary on the 
above named estate having been 
oranted to the undersigned, notice 
Is hereby given to all persons In­
debted to said estate to make Im· 
mediate payment, and to those 
having clalms against the same to 
Present them, properly authen­
ticated for settlement. 

Jean Churney 
303 S. Richhill St. 

Waynesburg, Pa. 15370 
EXECUTRIX 

POLLOCK, POLLOCK 
& THOMAS 
Attorneys 

6·5, 12, 19 

EXECUTRICES' NOTICE 
Estate of ANNA LUTES 

YODERS late of Morgan Borough 
Township Greene County, Penn• 
svlvanla, deceased. 

Letters testamentary on the 
above named estate having been 
granted to ttle undersigned, notice 
Is hereby given to all Persons In• 
debted to said estate to make Im­
mediate payment, and to those 
having claims against the same to 
present them properly authen­
ticated, for settlement. 

MARTHA POLANOER 
R.O.#1, Box 229C 
Jefferson, PA. 1.534' 
MARY HASCHETS 
R.D.,1'1. Box 367 
Coal Center, PA. 15'23 
Executrices 

R. Wallace Maxwell, 
Attorney 

6-5,12,19 

EXECUTRIX NOTICE 
Estate of E. M. Pauley, late of 

Jefferson Township , Greene 
Countv, Pennsylvania, deceased. 

Letters testmentary on the 
above named estate having been 
granted to the undersigned, notice 
Is hereby given to all persons in• 
debted to said estate to make Im• 
mediate payment, and to those 
having claims against the same to 
present them oroperlY authen­
llcated, for settlement. 

Wilma Tuttle 
Executrix 

512 W. Main St., 
Monongahela, Pa., 15063 

A. J. Marlon 
Attorney 

S-29; 6-S, 12 

EXECUTRIX NOTICE 
Estate of LOIS E. TWYFORD 

late of Morgan Township Greene 
County, Pennsylvanla, deceased. 

letters testamentary on the 
above named estate having been 
granted to the undersigned, notice 
ls hereby given to all per.sons in­
debted to said estate to make Im• 
mediate payment, and to those 
having claims against the same to 
present them properly authen­
ticated, for settlement. 

LOIS McCLAY 
5620 Fltlh Avenue 

Pittsburgh, Pa. 1523'2 
Executrix 

THOMPSON ANO BAILY 
Attorneys 

5-29; 6-5. 12 

ADMINISTRATOR'S NOTICE 
ESTATE OF Frank E. Church 

of Center Township, Greene 
County, Pennsylvania, deceased. 

Letters of administration hav• 
Ing been granted by the Revlster of 
Wills In and for Greene Countv, 
Pennsylvania, on the estate of the 
above named decedent. to the un• 
dersigned, notice Is hereby given 
to all person, having claims' or 
demands against the estate of said 
decedent, to make known the 
same; and all persons Indebted to 
the said decedent are requested to 
make payment without delay to 

Craig S. Church 
Administrator 

R. 0 . 2 
Prosperity, Pa., 15329 

Wllllam R. Davis, 
Attorney 

S-29 ; 6-5, 12 

ADMINISTRATOR'S NOTICE 
ESTATE OF ANTHONY W. 

VAVREK ~ CUMBERLAND 
TOWNSHIP, Greene County , 
Pennsylvania, deceased. 

Letters of administration hav­
ing been granted by the Register of 
WIiis in and for Greene County, 
Pennsylvania, on the estate of the 
above named decedent, to the un• 
dersfgned, notice is hereby given 
to all per.sons having claims or 
demands against the estate of said 
decedent, to make known the 
same ; and all persons Indebted to 
tne said decedent are requested to 
make payment without delay to 

FRANCES HARRISON 
Administrator 

Box 160·8, R.O. 1 
Rices Landing, Pa. 15357 

THOMPSON S. BAILY 
Atlornevs 

S-29 ; 6-5, 12 

c'LASSi'FIED 

Tbe 
Waynesburg Republlcen 

Makes An Appropriate Gift 
For Everyone, A Gin Card 

Announcing The Donor 
Mailed With Every 

Subscription 
$It.GO A Year 
$5.50 6 Months 
$3.50 3 Months 

Phone Waynesburg 627-3131 
10-31-tf, 

and their spouses , regardless 
of age, at no cost. However. 
participants are given the op­
portunity lo donate. 

The mobile services for the 
aging program is sponsored 
by the Soulhwestrn Pennsyl• 
vanla Area Agency on Aging 
in cooperation with the Ameri­
can Cancer Society. The AAA 
is funded in part by the Penn· 
sylvania Departments of Ag­
ing and Public Welfare. 

Additional information Is 
available by calling 684-9000, 
extension 432 or toll free 800 
342-8980, extension 432. 

ACCEPTS POSITION -
Brian D. Cole, a 1981 
gradaute of Waynesburg Col­
lege, has accepted a position 
with Barnes, Saly & Co., an 
accounting firm in John­
stown. While at Waynesburg 
he attained a 3.92 cumulative 
average and gradauted 
Summa Cum Laude. He 
served as a tutor for in­
termediate accounting and 
made the dean's list every 
semester. He was a member 
of Xi Psi Epsilon and re· 
ceived departmental account­
ing honors in addition to the 
Pennsylvania Institute of 
CPAs' special recognition. He 
is a son of Mr . and Mrs. C.H. 
Cole of Crescent Hills, 
Waynesburg. 

Woman Hurt 
WAYNESBURG - Carla 

Porter, 23, of Waynesburg, 
was treated at Greene County 
Memorial Hospital for a knee 
and several small facial lacer­
ations following an accident 
on Waynesburg's South Wash­
ington Street Monday afler­
noon. 

., L 

GRADUATES - Suzanne C. 
Knapik, daughter of Mrs. 
John Knapik Sr. of Clarks• 
ville R.D.1, graduated with 
honors recently from Point 
Park College, Pittsburgh, 
with a major in theater arts. 
She is now working for Kauf­
mann 's Department Store 
and is also working with the 
Robert Morris Summer Thea­
ter, where she will play the 
lead in "Charlie's Aunt " 
July 1-14. Miss Knapik, who 
graduated from Jefferson­
Morgan High School in 1977, 
plans a career in the theater. 

GRADUATES - Mark E. 
Day, son of Gladys A. Day 
and the late Ralph W. 
Day .graduated from Carne• 
gie-Mellon University on May 
18 with a degree in electrical 
engineering. He was a mem• 
ber of Lambda Sigma, Eta 
Kappa Nu and Tau Bola Pl. 
Mark has accepted a position 
with Texas Instruments in 
Johnson City , Tenn., will be­
gin work on June 15. 

Yoders 
Anna Mae Lutes Yoders, 74, 

of Jefferson R.D.I, died in her 
home following a heart attack 
at 4:45 p.m. Wednesday , May 
27, 1981. Her death was unex• 
peeled. 

She was born March 8, 1907, 
in Arnold City, a daughter of 
John and Anna Ruller Dodds. 
She resided most of her life in 
Greene County. 

Her first husband, James H. 
Lutes, died in 1966. Her second 
husband, Irvin Yoders, died in 
1981. 

Mrs. Yoders was a member 
of the First Baptist Church in 
Carmichaels, Filer-Sadlek 
Unit 954, American Legion 
Auxiliary of Jefferson and the 
Carmichaels Senior Citizen 
Club. 

Surviving are four sons, 
John Lutes of Jefferson R.D. I, 
James Lutes of Ellsworth, 
William Lutes of Wayneburg 
R.D.5, and Walter Lutes of 
Oxford , England; seven 
daughters, Mrs. Sarah Lentz 
of Azuza, Calif., Mrs. Charles 
(Mary) Hafchets of Coal Cen­
ter, Mrs. Anthony (Viola) 
Chopp of Washington R.D.4, 
Mrs. John (Dora) Vassallo of 
Greensboro, Mrs. Allan 
(Bessie) Zeller of Altoona, 
Mrs . Robert (Martha) Po­
lander of Jefferson R.D.l, and 
Mrs. Edward (Dolores) Janco 
of Rices Landing R.D.I; 41 
grandchildren; 57 great­
grandchildren; and a great­
great-granddaughter. 

Also surviving are a step­
son, Irvin T. Yoders of Jef­
ferson R.D. l; four step­
daughters, Mrs. Ralph ( De­
lores) Blaker of Carmichaels 
R.D.I, Mrs. Duke (Emma) 
Shubert of Cleveland, Ohio, 
Mrs. William (Joan) Fuller of 
Jefferson R.D.I and Mrs. Carl 
(Carol) Blaker of Carmi­
chaels; four sisters, Mrs. 
Blanche Haywood of Waynes­
burg R.D.I, Mrs. Sylvia Os­
borne of Uniontown, Ohio, 
Mrs. Laura Sands of 
Mogadore, Ohio, and Mrs. 
Ocie Chopp of Washington; 
and three brothers, Walter 
Dodds of Carmichaels, Ray 
Dodds of Garfield Heights, 
Ohio, and James Dodds of 
Akron, Ohio. 

A daughter, Laura Hayden, 
two brothers and a sister are 
deceased. 

Zollars 
James Russell Zollars, 55, 

of Pittsburgh, a former resi­
dent of Waynesburg, died 
Thursday, May 28, 1981, in his 
home. 

He was a son of James Rus­
sell Zollars and Edna Mildred 
Barnhart Zollars. He was born 
December 28, 1926, in Waynes­
burg. where he lived most of 
his life. He was a member of 
the Methodist Church. 

Mr. Zollars worked as a 
barber In Waynesburg. Aller 
moving lo Pittsburgh, he was 
employed by Gulf Oil Co. 

Surviving are three sons, 
James Zollars Ill, Robert 
Zollars and Russell Zollars ; 
two daughters, Mildred and 
Sheryl Zollars; a brother, 
Robert Allan Zollars of 
Portland. Ore., and 10 sisters, 
Mrs. Ray (lvanor l Foster , 
Mrs . Paul (Patricia) 
Mathison, Mrs. Ralph (Ju­
dith) Adamson, Mrs. Timothy 
(Bonnie) Cain and Mrs . 
Marlene Zollars , all of 
Waynesburg, Mrs. Thomas 
(Wilma) Deary of Pittsburgh, 
Mrs . John (Dolores) Cox of 
Carmichaels , Carol Jean 
Zollars of Connecticut, Mrs. 
Cheryl C. Wise of Dayton, 
Ohio, and Mrs. Jack I Donna) 
Harrier of Detroit, Mich. 

Services were held in Pitts• 
burgh. 

Park 
Mrs. Myrl Park, 63, of 

Morgantown, W.Va ., died 
Thursday morning, May 28, 
1981, in Monongalia General 
Hospital. 

She was born October 6, 
1917, In Mannington , W.Va., a 
daughter of Theophilus and 
Dessie Jones Efaw. 

Mrs. Park was a member of 
the Union Valley Baptist 
Church, and was formerly em­
ployed by the Morgantown 
Health Care Center. Her hus­
band, George Frederick Park 
Sr., who died May 10, 1975, 
was formerly of the Waynes­
burg area. 

Surviving are three sons, 
George F. Park Jr. of Vidor. 
Texas, Willlam Park of Scran­
ton and Theophilus Park of 
Morgantown ; five daughters, 
Mary L. and Joy Park of 
Morgantown, Margaret Park 
of Granville, W.Va., Mrs. Jack 
( Ethel J Snodgrass of Man• 
nington and Mrs . Albert 
(Helen) Stottlemire of Lit­
tleton. W.Va .; a sister, Mrs. 
Sterling ( Margaret) Santee of 
ldamay, W.Va. ; and 19 grand­
children. 

Rohamaa 
Joseph P. Rohanna, 60, of 

351 Bridge Street, Waynes­
burg, died unexpectedly of an 
apparent coronary occlusion 
at 2: 15 p.m., Thursday, May 
28, 1981, at his residence. 

He was the proprietor of the 
Rohanna Restaurant and 
Motel and associated with 
Rohanna Iron and Metal Inc. 
In Waynesburg. 

He was born April 20, 1921, 
in Mannington, W.Va., a son of 
Andrew K. and Gemelia Shad­
ady Rohanna . His wife, Mabel 
Louise White, died January 21, 
1979. 

Mr. Rohanna had spent all 
of his life in the Waynesburg 
area where he was a member 
of St. Ann Church. He also was 
a member of James Farrell 
Post 330 of the American Le­
gion, BPOE Elks 757, the 
WaynP.sburg Optimist Club 
and other civic organizations. 
He was a veteran of World 
War 11, having served with the 
U.S. Army in the Pacific Thea­
ter. 

Surviving are three 
daughters , Mrs. Joetta 
Marlene Morris of Man­
chester, Conn. , Mrs. John E. 
(Linda Joyce) Mariner of 
Waynesburg and Mrs. Law­
rence (Kathleen) Gaso of 
Bentleyville; ten grand­
children; one sister, Mrs. 
Joseph (Mary Rose) Wakim of 
Geneva, Ohio; four brothers, 
Issac P., Andrew K. and Rob­
ert E. Rohanna, all of Waynes­
burg, and Edward G. Rohanna 
of Mc Murray; and several 
nieces and nephews. 

Two brothers, K.A. and 
Woodrow G., are deceased. 

Kniha 
John P. Kniha, 95, of House 

99, First Street, Mather, died 
afler a long illness, Monday, 
June 1, 1981, at I :55 a.m. in 
Greene County Memorial Hos­
pital. 

He was born in Austria, 
February 2, 1886, a son of John 
Kniha. 

Mr. Kniha was a retired 
coal miner, having worked at 
the Mather Mine. He spent 
most of his life in Mather and 
was a member of St. 
Marcellus Roman Catholic 
Church at Jefferson, the 
Greek Catholic Union and 
UMW A Local 6330. 

Surviving are three 
daughters, Mrs. Alex (Mary) 
Kukler of Belle Vernon, Mrs. 
John (Agnes) Yanzek and 
Mrs. Robert (Dolores) Ric­
chuito, both of Pittsburgh ; one 
son , John K. Kniha of Mather ; 
II grandchildren ; 15 great­
grandchildren; and one sister, 
Mrs. Anna Budosh of Hyde 
Park. 

His wife, Magdalena Min• 
irak, died in 1957. A sister, 
Mary Medved, is deceased. 

Nelson 
Mae M. Nelson, 69, of 

Sycamore, died Sunday, May 
31 , 1981, at 11 :45 p.m. in her 
home following a long illness. 

She was born May 23, 1912, 
in Aleppo, a daughter of the 
late Benson C. Moniger. Her 
mother , Ethel Morris Moniger 
of Waynesburg R . D .2, 
survives. 

Mrs. Nelson was a former 
resident of Bristoria and Pros­
perity. For the past eight 
years she had lived in 
Sycamore and was a member 
of the Crabapple Community 
Church. 

On April 6, 1935, she mar­
ried Walter N. Nelson, who 
survives. 

In addition to her mother 
and husband. she is survived 
by two sons, Walter Robert 
Nelson of Brave Star Route, 
William Paul Nelson of Pros­
perity R.D.! ; one daughter, 
Martha Louise Tennant of 
Metz, W Va.; seven grand• 
children ; two great-grand­
children , two sisters, Mrs. 
Helen Bradley of New Free­
port. Mrs. Mary Bradley of 
Weirton, W.Va.; and one 
brother , Johnson Blair 
Moniger of Eldersville, W.Va. 

One brother is deceased. 

Mason 
Elsie Simmons Mason, 77, 

Cameron, W. Va ., died at 10 
a.m. Saturday, May 30, 1981, 
in Ohio Valley Hospital , 
Steubenville, Ohio. 

She was born July 26, 1903, 
in Whetzel County, W.Va .. a 
daughter of Robert and Dora 
Calvert Simmons. She was a 
member of the Shepherd 
United Methodist Church at 
Adaline !Fish Creek ). W.Va. 

Surviving are a son. Charles 
Gibson Mason of Colorado 
Springs, Colo.; a daughter, 
Mrs. George (Amy) Peters of 
Saginaw. Mich.; four grand­
children ; and two brothers, 
Russell G. Simmons of Cam• 
eron and Lawrence W. Sim• 
mons of Proctor, W Va. 

Bryan 
William R. Bryan, 66, of 254 

Third Avenue, Waynesburg, 
died Friday, May 29, 1981 , at 
4:20 a.m. at Greene County 
Memorial Hospital. He had 
been ill for six months. 

He was born March 29, 1915, 
In Waynesburg, a son of John 
K. and Stella Conklin Bryan. 

On September 15, 1938, he 
married Virginia Allison, who 
survives. 

For several years, Mr. 
Bryan was involved with the 
operation of Bryan's Dairy 
and was a partner in the Bry'n 
Moore Studio in Waynesburg. 
From 196S-76 he wa:.employed 
as a government photogra­
pher at Hawthorne Naval 
Base in Nevada. 

A veteran of World War II, 
he served with the U.S. Army 
in Europe. He was a member 
of the First Baptist Church of 
Waynesburg and the Waynes­
burg Sportsmen's Club where 
he was active on the rifle 
team. 

In addition to his wife, he is 
survived by a brother, John H. 
Bryan and a sister, Mrs. Floyd 
(Thelma) Turner, both of 
Waynesburg ; and several 
nieces and nephews. 

A brother, Frank J . Bryan, 
is deceased. 

Hetrick 
Clarence H. Hetrick, 67, 

Waynesburg, a former resi­
dent of ~efferson, died at 9:45 
a.m. Sunday, May 31, 1981, in 
Greene County Memorial Hos­
pital afler a brief illness. 

He was born June 25, 1913, 
in Oakland, Md., a son of Roy 
and Adaline Hetrick, and lived 
most of his life in Greene 
County. He served with the 
U.S. Army in Europe during 
World War II. 

Mr. Hetrick, a retired 
miner, was a member of the 
Waynesburg Eagles Lodge 
and the Waynesburg Senior 
Citizens Club. 

Surviving are a son, 
Wendell Hetrick of Richey­
ville ; two daughtrs, Mrs. 
Clara Jane Miller of Clarks­
ville and Mrs. Claudia Bissett 
of Waynesburg; nine grand­
children; a brother , Roy 
Hetrick of Rices Landing, and 
two sisters, Mrs. Elsie Miller 
of Waynesburg and Mrs . Viola 
Redman of Waynesburg. 

A sister, Myrtle Fox, and a 
brother, Fred Hetrick, are de­
ceased. 
Fonzi 

Lida Marie Fonzi, 77, of 
Holbrook, died at noon Thurs­
day, May 28, 1981, in Greene 
County Memorial Hospital af­
ter a long illness. 

She was born January 16, 
1904. in New York City, a 
daughter of Joseph and San­
tina Amatelli. 

Her husband, Harry A. 
Fonzi, whom she married No­
vember 17, 1952, died in 1957. 

Mrs. Fonzi was employed 
for several years as a tele­
phone operator at the Hilton 
Hotel in Pittsburgh. 

Surviving are a daughter. 
Mrs . Robert (Elizabeth) 
While of Washington; a son. 
Norman Pizzica of Rehobath 
Beach , Del.; a grand­
daughter, Mrs. Roger (Linda) 
Grimes of Holbrook, with 
whom she had resided for the 
past two years ; a grandson, 
Harry Fonzi of Bethel Park ; 
and three great -grand­
children. 

Varesko 
Paul P. Varesko, 75, of 

Crucible, died at 6:30 p.m. 
Sunday, May 31 , 1981. in 
Greene County Memorial Hos• , 
pital. 

He was born October 24, 
1905, in Lambert, a son of 
Edward and Lucinda White 
Varesko. He lived most of his 
life in Crucible. A retired coal 
miner, he had been employed 
by Crucible Fuel Co. 

As a young man, Mr. 
Varesko was known as a sand­
lot baseball player. He was a 
member of St. Mary Church, 
Crucible, the Crucible 
Slavonic Club and Dilworth 
Local No. 1980, UMW. 

Surviving are his wife, Lucy 
Wojtowicz Varesko ; three 
daughters, Mrs. Edward 
(Dorothy) Hanko of Crucible, 
Miss Ruth Varesko, at home, 
and Mrs. Donald (Virginia) 
Hathaway of Bolivar, Ohio; a 
son , Paul E. Varesko of Cleve­
land, Ohio; six grandchildren ; 
one great-grandson ; six sis­
ters, Mrs. Lucy Tuckish of 
Carmichaels, Mrs. Julia Cole 
of Mather, Mrs. Raymond 
(Evelyn) Maurin of Rices 
Landing R.D.I, Mrs. Edward 
(Alice) Zavora of Carmi• 
chaels, Mrs. Henry (Ruth) 
Savora of Waynesburg, and 
Mrs. Robert (Dolores) Hughes 
of West Virginia ; and six 
brothers, Edward of Cleve­
land, Ohio, Andrew of Carmi­
chaels, Charles of Erie, Wil­
liam of Mather and John and 
Robert, both of Rices Landing 
R.D.I. 

A sister, Mrs. Alice Wolfe, 
and four brothers. John, Louis 
and Rudolph Varesko and Mi­
chael Michli!t, are deceased. 

Raymer 
Harold C. Raymer, 65, of 

West Finley R.D.2, died in his 
home at 10:15 a.m. Thursday, 
May 28, 1981. 

He was born October 9, 1915, 
near West Finley, a son of 
Charles E. and Ida Magers 
Raymer. His wife, Verona 
Hemby Raymer, dled Septem• 
ber 23, 1975. 

Mr. Raymer was a farmer 
and resided in Richhill Town­
ship all his life. He was a 
veteran of World War 11, hav­
ing served with the Army. 

Surviving are four step­
da1111hters, Mrs. Laura Redic 
of Snow Hill , N.C., Mrs. Sybil 
Gray Nethercutt of Green­
ville, N.C., and Mrs. Dora 
Dean Radford and Mrs. Peggy 
Newsome, both of Selma, 
N.C.; and two stepsons, 
Dewey Allen and Jenness Al­
len , both of Greenville, N.C. 

Ernest 
Robert L. Ernest, 63, Cam• 

bridge. Ohio, a former resi· 
dent of Cameron, W. Va., died 
Friday, May 29, 1981 , in 
Gurnsey Memorial Hospital, 
Cambridge. 

He was born January 25, 
1918, in McMechen, W.Va. , a 
son of Lester Ernest of 
Gorham , Maine . who 
survives, and the late Pearl 
Taylor Ernest. 

Mr. Ernest never married. 
He was a retired farmer and a 
member of the Church of 
Christ. 

Surviving in addltion to his 
father are two brothers, Leo 
Ernest of Cambridge, Ohio, 
and Charles Ernest of 
Gorham, Me. 

Health Center Plans To 
Make Special Calendars 

GREENSBORO - The 
board of directors of the 
Southeastern Greene Com­
munity Health Center is 
launching its first annual com­
munity birthday calendqr 
fund-raising program. 

The calendar will list the 
birthdays and wedding an· 
niversaries of family mem­
bers of those purchasing the 
calendar. The calendar also 
will list meeting dates and 
time of area church, school, 
civic and social organizations. 

The community birthday 
calendar is meant to promote 
community spirit and " neigh­
borliness" in the southeastern 
Greene area . It ls also a good 
way to remember friends and 
loved ones on their special 
day, according to Laurie 
Duraney, community services 
coordinator. 

Funds raised through the 
calendar sale will be used for 
renovations al the Greensboro 
Health Center and the Bob­
town Health Center. The main 
floor of the Greensboro center 
Is to be completely remodeled 
to add an e,i:amlnlng room and 
office for the physician arriv­
ing In July. An examinlnl! 
room and office for lhe physi­
cian will be added al the Bob-

T 

town center. 
Board members will be tak­

ing orders for listings and 
calendars through July 15. 
Cathy Ealy is community cap­
tain in Bobtown and can be 
contacted by calling 839-7200. 
Board members taking orders 
in Bobtown include Shirley 
Gasti, Helen Latanation and 
Elizabeth Ryan. 

Susan Drew is the Green­
sboro captain and may be con• 
!acted al 943-3819. Also helping 
in the drive will be Ann 
Bargerstock, David Brozlk, 
Harry Drew, Ed Helmick, 
Rick Podollnski and Ralph 
Shafer. 

Adverllsements for the 
calendar wlU be handled by 
Laurie Duraney. who may be 
contacted at the Greensboro 
center. 

The communlly calendar 
will run from Oct. 1, 1981, 
through Sept. 30, 1982, and 
they will be delivered in Sep­
tember, 1981. -----

ENOS TRAINING 
Navy Seaman Recruit Han­

nah J . Lockett , daughter of · 
Marva L. Lockett of Clarks­
ville. has completed recruit 
training at the Naval Training 
Center In Orlando, Fla. 


