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Phillippi's 
Prescriptions 
Questioned 

WAYNESBURG - A Waynesburg 
doctor accused in the Phristmastime 
kidnapping of a Pittsburgh invest­
ment broker may have practiced 
medicine without a license last year, 
authorities said Thursday. 

Greene County District Attorney 
Charles Morris said Waynesburg po­
lice are investigating whether Dr. 
Grover Phillippi wrote medical 
prescriptions in 1983. Morris said 
Phillippi let his license expire in De­
cember 1982. 

'' It seems as though he might have 
written some prescriptions in 1983, 
but we don't know if it's enough to 
make a case," Morris said. 

Just prior to the abduction, Phil­
lippi was believed to have contacted a 
local pharmacy to inquire about ob­
taining sodium pentothal ( truth 
serum) and allegedly asked a fellow 
doctor about an animal tranquilizer. 
It is not known if he acquired either 
drug. 

Borough police are still sifting 
through boxes of material taken from 
Ph111ippi's residence on East Greene 
Street shortly after his arrest. 
Neither the police nor the magistrate 
who issued the search warrant have 
revealed what the police were seeking 
specifically. 

Phillippi and another Waynesburg 
man, Michael L. Conklin, are charged 
with kidnapping and conspiracy in the 
Dec. 21 abduction of broker Robert J . 
Haye of Mount Lebanon. 

Allegheny County authorities al­
lege that Phillippi, dressed as Santa 
Claus, and Conklin, dressed as a 
chauffeur, abducted Haye from an 
office Christmas party in Pittsburgh. 

Haye told police he was chained to 
a bed and tortured during the next 12 
days . Police freed him Jan. 2 from a 
mobile home inside a farm storage 
building about 50 miles south of Pitts­
burgh near the West Virginia border. 
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One person was killed and three injured in this accident near Mt. Morris Tuesday night. 

W. Virginia Man Killed, 
Two Girls Badly Injured 

MT. MORRIS - A 66-year-old 
Maidsville, W.Va. man was killed and 
two girls, one of them his grand­
daughter, were seriously injured in a 
grinding truck-<:ar collision on In­
terstate 79 at 9:25 p.m. Tuesday. 

Pronounced dead at the scene of a 
broken neck was Harley (Jake) Ben­
nett, who retired last month from 
Wilson Chevrolet in Morgantown, 
W.Va., following 26 years of employ­
ment. 

south. The truck driver, George M. 
Anderson, 31 , of Lower Burrell , es­
caped injury. 

The accident occurred about 4½ 
miles north of the Mt. Morris exit. 

Police said the truck smashed into 
the back of the 1981 Corvette and 
continued on for some 300 feet before 
coming to a stop. It took rescue work­
ers an hour and a half to free the 
victims with power tools. 

Taking part in the resue efforts 
were volunteer firemen from 
Waynesburg, Mt. Morris and East 
Bethlehem townships and the 
Monongalia County Rescue Squad. 

The victim was pronounced dead 
at the scene by Greene County Deputy 
Coroner Charles Behm. 

It is believed Bennett may have 
missed the Mt. Morris exit and was 
attempting to turn around. 

Bennett was born September I, 
1917, in Calhoun County, W.Va. , to 
Neva Wilson Bennett of Maidsville 
and the late Doil Bennett. 

Surviving in addition to his mother 
are his wife Anna Pellegrini Bennett ; 
two daughters, JoAnn Tovorkey of 
Allison Park and Connie Bennett, at 
home and three grandchildren, 
Sharon Michele Tovorkey and 
Tammy Haller. 
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Magistrates 
Ask The State 
To Decide Case 

WAYNESBURG - An atlorney 
representing two of Greene County's 
three district magistrates has asked 
the Commonwealth Court to in­
tervene in their legal battle over a 
Greene County Court order which 
limits the number of secretaries they 
can employ in their offices. 

Mark E. Mascara of Washington 
confirmed Monday that he has asked 
the state court to intervene because a 
jurist assigned to adjudicate the issue 
has failed to take any action since last 
October, when the plantiffs filed a 
motion for preemptory judgment. 

Magistrates John Watson and 
Ruth Hughes filed the equity action in 
June, naming Greene County Judge 
Glenn Toothman as defendant. They 
contended that Toothman's adminis­
trative order of Jan. 27, 1983, was 
invalid because the county court 
" does not have jurisdiction over the 
appointment, dismissal and duties of 
the plaintiffs' necessary personnel 
staffs." 

The administrative order was 
based on a state)Vide study by the 
Administrative Office of Pennsylva­
nia Courts of the staff requirements of 
district magistrates. The order re­
duced staffmg to one full-time secre­
tary in Watson's office and one full 
time-time and one part-time secre­
tary in Mrs. Hughes office. Prior to 
that, each had employed two full-time 
secretaries. 

The magistrates complied with the 
order, but they filed a petition with 
the Pennsylvania Supreme Court ask­
ing that the order be set aside. The 
Supreme Court in May dismissed the 
petition, without setting forth its rea-

sons for doing so. 
The equity action was filed in 

Greene County Court at that time and 
Judge J . Quint Salmon of Beaver ' 
County was assigned to adjudicate · 
the case. 

" Our belief is that we are correct 
in our legal position, and Judge 
Salmon's lack of action fortifies that 
belief," Mascara said. "We have ap­
pealed to the Commonwealth Court 
because no hearing has been sched­
uled and we want the issue to be 
resolved." 

The plaintiffs contend that the act 
creating the magisterial system gave 
magistrates the power to appoint, 
discharge and fix the duties of their 
necessary personal staff, and that the 
county court therefore does not have 
the jurisdiction to assume those re­
sponsibilities. 

Watson is magistrate for Waynes­
burg and western Greene County. 
Mrs. Hughes , with an office in F'rank­
lin Township, has jurisdiction over 
the central part of the county. 

The third magistrate in the county 
is Emil Bertugli of Carmichaels, who 
has jurisdiction over eastern Greene 
County. While the Jan. 27 court order 
also affected staffing in his office, he 
has not joined in the legal efforts to 
have it set aside. 

Sheriffs 
Staff Pay 
Approved Phillippi claimed to have lost hun­

dreds of thousands of dollars in the 
gold market through mismanaged in­
vestments. 

He and Conklin remain in the Alle­
gheny County Jail in lieu of $100,000 
cash bond. They wlll be formally 
arraigned next month in Allegheny 
County. 

Listed in fair condition at the Uni­
versity Medical Center in Morgan­
town Wednesday were Tammy 
Haller, 15, ofMaidsville, a grandchild 
of the victim, and Tonya Snyder, 15, 
also of Maidsville, a friend and neigh­
bor of the Haller girl. 

According to state police, Bennett 
was traveling north when he went 
through an emergency crossover in 
the highway divider and pulled in 
front of a tractor-trailer traveling 

Plans Ready For Sewage Plant 
WAYNESBURG - The Greene 

County Commissioners in a brief 
meeting Thursday made appoint ­
ments and approved salaries in the 
sheriff's office. 

Motion To Dismiss 
DWI Charge Denied 

WAYNESBURG - Greene County 
Court refused to dismiss a drunken 
driving charge against a motorist 
who was arrested while sitting in a 
truck parked on a private lane in 
Jackson Township. 

In an opinion handed down Tues­
day, Judge Glenn Toothman rejected 
a motion to dismiss charges of driving 
while intoxicated and driving during 
suspension which state police filed 
against James W. Rogers , 42, 
Holbrook. He directed that the case 
be scheduled for trial. 

Rogers was arrested by a state 
policeman on March 19, 1983, several 
hours after an accident occurred on 
Route 18 in Jackson Township. The 
officer made the arrest on the basis of 
a description given to him of the truck 
and motorist involved in the accident, 

after spotting the vehicle parked in 
the private n~ad leading to a farm­
house. A subsequent intoxolyzer test 
gave a .23 percent alcohol reading . 

Rogers ' attorney based his motion 
for dismissal of the charges on the 
contention that the arresting officer 
did not see the defendant driving on 
the public highway. He and the dis­
trict attorney presented conflicting 
court cases involving the legality of 
drunken driving arrests on thorough­
fares which are not public highways. 

In his ruling , Toothman stated that 
the place where the arrest was made 
is immaterial. The key issue is 
''whether the state is able to prove the 
defendant was driving on Route 18 at 
the time of the accident," a question 
which would have to be resolved at 
the trial , Toothman said. 

Judge Favors Consol 
In Firing Of Miner 

PITISBURGH (AP ) - A federal 
judge, refusing to overturn the firing 
of a miner who claimed Saturday as 
his Sabbath, said Consolidation Coal 
Co. made a reasonable effort to ac­
commodate the employees' religious 
beliefs. 

U.S . District Judge Hubert 
Teitelbaum ruled Wednesday that 
Thomas Friend Jr. of Glen Dale, 
W.Va., had no adequate reason for 
refusing Consol's offer of a warehouse 
job in which he would not be sched­
uled to work Saturdays or Friday 

over-time rates, and the UMW would 
not exempt him from over-time 
provisions of its contract. 

Negotiations involving the Equal 
Employment Opportunity Com­
mission produced an offer of the 
warehouse job, which Friend re­
jected. 

Teitelbaum, who presided at a 
non-jury trial , noted that federal civil 
rights laws clear employers of re­
ligious discrimination charges if 
they've made reasonable efforts . 

By Bob Eichenlaub, Green• County Editor 

WAYNESBURG - Preliminary 
plans for the construction of a new 
sewage treatment plant to serve the 
town of Nemacolin were presented to 
the Greene County Planning Com­
mission at its meeting Monday. 

The plant will be built by Jones 
and Laughlin Steel Corp. , which owns 
the Nemacolin mine. It will handle 
waste from both mine facilities and 
the 460 homes which make up the 
community. 

Once it has been built and placed 
in operation, the plant will be turned 
over to Nemacolin, Inc., an organiza­
tion of community residents who su­
pervise town facilities . 

County Planner Valerie Cole said 
she will review the planning module 
with the Department of Environmen­
tal Resources office in Uniontown so 
the necessary approvals can be ob­
tained as quickly as possible. She said 
J&L hopes to begin construction as 
soon as possible so the plant can be 
completed this year. 

The planning module, prepared by 
Chester Engineers, calls for a new 
secondary treatment plant designed 
to handle a normal flow of 100,000 

gallons of water per day and up to 
142,000 gallons per day at peak flow. It 
will replace a primary treatment 
plant which was built in 1918. 

Mrs. Cole said the county Sewage 
Facilities Plan which was prepared in 
1971 calls for construction of the new 
plant to meet DER standards, which 
require secondary treatment facil­
ities . 

Mrs. Cole said there is no cost 
estimate included in the planning 

Approves Project 
WAYNESBURG - A water line 

extension to 20 residents along Route 
21, west of Waynesburg, may become 
a reality after all following a meeting 
between the Franklin Township Su­
pervisors and the Southwestern Penn­
sylvania Water Authority recently. 

Following a review of the engi­
neering plans, Southwestern has 
agreed to the project and bids will be 
accepted Feb. 13 in the township of­
fice . 

Plans call for the installation of a 
12-inch line from a point in West 
Waynesburg to a point 1,000 feet west 
of Old School House Road. 

Husband Shot Accidentally 
MATHER- A 21-year-old Mather 

man was listed in stable condition 
Thursday at West Virginia University 
Medical Center of a gunshot wound 
inflicted by his wife, who thought he 
was a burglar. 

Gary L. Black underwent surgery 
Thursday afternoon for a bullet 
wound in the right side of his chest. 

According to police, Black arrived 
at his home on TR 855 in Morgan 
Township at about 3:30 a.m. Thurs­
day. The home is about a mile west of 
Mather. 

Mrs. Black told police she thought 
it was a burglar and fired a 6.5-mm 

rifle. The Blacks had been hearing 
strange noises around the house for 
several days and were concerned 
about burglars. Gary Black said. 

When Mrs. Black turned on the 
lights, she found her husband on the 
floor . She rushed him to Greene 
County Memorial Hospital where he 
was treated and then transferred to 
the Morgantown facililty. 

Black was in stable condition when 
he arrived in the emergency room , 
according to a spokesman at the med­
ical center. No condition report was 
available because Black was stlll in 
the recovery room. 

module, which must be approved 
before construction plans can be 
prepared. She added that she was told 
by J&L that Nemacolin Inc. will 
provide a small percentage of the 
construction cost, but that the bulk of 
the expense wlll be borne by the steel 
company. No state or federal grant 
money is involved. 

Mrs. Cole also reported that Car­
michaels Council has halted construc­
tion of its new borough building until 
necessary site approvals are obtained 
from the planning commission. 

A letter from borough Solicitor 
Charles J . Morris said that the 
borough 's failure to obtain ap­
propriate approval was an oversight 
and that construction will not be re­
sumed until it has been obtained. 
Planning commission members 
asked that review of the plans be 
expedited so work will not be delayed 
any longer than necessary. 

County Commissioner L.R . 
(Butch ) Santore, who attended the 
meeting, said the board of com­
missioners will soon be in a position to 
authorize filling of the post of assis­
tant county planner, which was left 
vacant recently with the resignation 
of Linda Kolat. 

"Speaking for myself, I hope we do 
come up with someone soon because I 
feel an assistant planner is badly 
needed," Santore said. He asked that 
a job description be provided so that a 
qualified person can be hired. 

Robert Lang, planning com­
mlssion chairman, said he has talked 
to both of the other two county com­
missioners and has bee~ assured that 
the vacancy will be filled . 

The planning commission will con­
tinue to hold its regular meetings on 
the fourth Monday of each month at 
7:30 p.m. in the commissioners' meet­
ing room of the new County Office 
Building, it was announced. 

Lang appointed John Titus , 
Marion Rush and Raymond Randolph 
to a nominating committee for the 
electlon of 1984 officers. 

nights . , 
Friend belongs to the World Wide 

Church of God, which observes the 
Hebrew calendar and recognizes the 
time between sunsets on Friday and 

Ruff Creek Area Man Fears Propane Blast 
Satiuday as the Sabbath. 

The origin of Friend's suit dates lo 
1981 while he was living near Waynes­
burg and working at Consol 's 
Humphrey Mine No. 7 in Mt. Morris 
near the West Virginia line . The min­
ers were on strike and Friend decided 
during that time to begin attending 
services of the World Wide Church of 
God, a fundamentalist sect in which 
he was raised that Is based in 
Pasadena, Calif. He had been absent 
from active participation in the 
church for some time. 

The company refused to let Friend 
work double shifts or on Sundays at 

WAYNESBURG - At least one 
resident In the Ruff Creek area has 
expressed concern over the possi­
bility of a propane explosion resulting 
from mine subsidence. 

The area in question is located in a 
narrow valley , about 100 yards wide, 
through which Interstate 79 and 
Route 19 pass. It is about a half-mile 
north of Exit 4 on the interstate . 

The landowner, who wishes to re; 
main anonymous, has contacted fed­
eral authorities lo investigate the sit­
uation . 

Gateway Coal Company plans to 
conduct long-wall mining operations 
in the area early this spring. The 

mining process consists of extracting 
a "panel" of coal 600 feet wide and 
2,000 feet long. When the coal 1s re­
moved, a subsidence of 30 Inches can 
be expected within six to eight weeks . 

Of concern 1s the six-inch propane 
line through the affected area The 
line is owned by Consolidation Gas 
Supply Corp. 

The worried resident Is afraid sur­
face subsidence of this magnitude 
could cause the propane lme to de­
velop a leak, which could lead to a 
disastrous situation for the residents 
of the valley and motorlsta traveling 
through the area . 

He cites an incident In 1977 when 
leaking propane was ignited by a 
vehicle ignition. The resulting ex­
plosion killed two men and 30 head of 
cattle, and denuded vegetation for a 
mile and a half from the Ignition 
point. 

He also cited the possibility of 
propane leaking into the ventilation 
system of Gateway Mine nearby. He 
said Gateway recently, at its own 
expense, Installed a new six-Inch 
propane line encased in a new 10-inch 
pipe, three-quarters of a mile long. 

The resident Is asking Consolida­
tion to cease the flow of propane 
during the critical six- to eight-week 

period when subsidence would occur. 
A spokesman for Consolidatlon in 

Clarbburg, W. Va .. said Thursday the 
situatlon would be monitored closely. 
The spokesman said It would proba­
bly be May before mining Is done 
under the line, which is buried three 
feet deep. 

Co1110lidatlon also has taken the 
precaution of installing an expansion 
pipe In the area where subsidence 
may occur. Company ofncials also 
revealed It waa a 12-lnch converted 
natural gas line which leaked propane 
In 1977. Since that time, the company 
has replaced that line wlth six-inch 
line over 90 percent of the length. 

The commissioners. meeting with 
County Treasurer Joseph Souders to 
form the salary board, increased the 
monthly salary of Claudia O'Conner 
from $4,32 to $696 per month. Mrs. 
O'Conner has been promoted to chief 
clerk to replace Lois King, who re­
signed recently. 

Pamela Snyder was hired to fill 
the former position of Mrs. O'Conner 
at an hourly rate of $4.16. 

Melvin Clark of Waynesburg was 
appointed to another term on the 
Greene County Industrial Develop­
ment board. 

Named as commissioners' repre­
sentatives to the Washington-Greene 
Community Action board were Wil­
liam L. Ross of Waynesburg by Com­
missioner John Gardiner and 
Barbara Logan of Wind Ridge by 
Commissioner Dan Bailey. 

Gardiner was named the board of 
commissioners' representative to the 
Greene County Library Board to fill a 
vacancy created by the resignation of 
Dr. Richard Cowan. 

The first-quarter allocation to the 
Greene County Extension Office was 
approved. 

Fire Starts 
In Home's 
Basement 

CLARKSVILLE - " We got there 
in the nick of time," Clarksville fire 
chief Edward Lorence said In describ­
ing how firefighters were able to con­
tain a fire to the basement of a home 
in the Chartiers Hill area early Sun­
day night. 

Lorence said fire damage to the 
Dean Minerd home located about 
three miles from Clarksville was con­
tained to a portion of the basement 
and Integral garage. "The upper liv­
ing area of the home may have re­
ceived some smoke but we didn 't 
have to put any water there ," he sa id . 

The Minerd family was not at 
home when the Ore was noticed by a 
neighbor and reported al approx­
imately 6 p.m. 

Although no estimate of loss was 
made, the fire chief said some furni­
ture stored in the garage was heavily 
damaged in the fire which he thinks 
started In an electric heater. 

"They apparently had some frozen 
pipes and had a small electric heater 
on top of a deep freezer ," Lorence 
said. "I don 't know exactly how It 
started - an extension cord was 
hanging free and away from anything 
but It seemed to have started In that 
area. 

Members of the Jefferson Volun­
teer Fire Co. assisted with a water 
tanker. 
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Boy Scout 
Executive 
Promoted 

J. Bruce McDowell has been 
promoted to field director of the South 
Field in the Allegheny Trails Council, 
Boy Scouts of America, which encom­
passes Washington and Greene coun­
ties. 

In the South Field, more than 5,200 
Cub Scouts, Boy Scouts and Explorers 
participate in four local districts: 
Catawba, Iroquois, Mon Valley and 
Greene. 

Since April 15, 1971, McDowell has 
been Catawba District executive. He 
was previously assistant district ex­
ecutive of the Admiral Perry District 
in Pittsburgh. 

McDowell has been vice chairman 
of the Salvation Army Advisory 
Board, vice president of the Washing­
ton County Association of Retarded 
Citizens and a director of the Wash­
ington Rotary Club. 

A graduate of the University of 
Pittsburgh and an Eagle Scout, 
McDowell recently served as the 
camp director of Eagle Base at 
Heritage Reservation apd was a staff 
member of the 1981 National Scout 
Jamboree held at Fort A. P. Hill, Va. 

McDowell, his wife and two sons 
will continue to reside in East Wash­
ington. 

all around 
greene county 

USA GRADUATE 
Army Capt. James W. Beatty. a 

1968 graduate of .Jefferson-Morgan 
High School, has graduated from the 
Defense Equal Opportunity Manage­
ment Institute at Patrick Air Force 
Base, Fla. 

The one-year, five-phase program 
is designed for Army and Air Force 
Reserve and National Guard person­
nel. 

Beatty is being assigned to the 2nd 
Brigade, 28th Infantry Division in 
Washington. He is a 1981 graduate of 
California State College. 

FIRST lllRTHDA Y 
Kan Lynn Stockdale, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs . Greg Stockdale of En­
dicott, N.Y., celebrated her first 
birthday on Friday. Jan . 13. 

Paternal grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs Oliver Stockdale of Waynes­
burg and maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs . Joseph Koescher of 
Apalach1a , N.Y Paternal great­
grandparents are Mr. and Mrs . 
Charles I Phillips of Waynesburg, 
Hillard Stockdale of Rogersville and 
Sarah Stockdale, who is deceased. 

UMW MEETS 
United Methodist Women of lhe 

Kent's Chapel Church. Brave. cele­
brated the birthday of the church 
pastor al a covered-dish dinner held 
recently in the church social room. 

A birthday cake was presented to 
lhe Rev Joseph Kosarek. He and 
Robin Ammons were presented with 
gifts in appreciation for work done 
during the past year. 

The dinner was attended by 42 
people. 

RECEIVES MEDAL 
Pfc. Michael L. McGinnis. son of 

Mr. and Mrs. Phillip W McGinnis of 
West Finley, has been decorated with 
the U.S. Army Commendation Medal 
at Fort Bragg, N.C. 

The medal is awarded to those 
1ndi v1duals who demon s trate 
outstanding achievement or merito­
rius service in the "performance of 
their duties on behalf of the army 
McGinnis also received the Combat 
Infantry Badge for service during the 
Grenada operation 

He 1s an indirect-fire infantryman 
with the 82nd Airborne Dlvl!lion and a 
1982 graduate of McGuffey High 
School. 

AT USAF SCHOOL 
Staff Sgt. Anthony A Hainzer, son 

of Ann Hainzer of Dilliner, has gradu­
ated from the U.S. Air Force non­
commissioned officer leadership 
school at Whiteman Air Force Base, 
Mo. 

He is a securi ty supervisor with 
the 351st Missile Security Squadron 
and a 1975 graduate of Milton­
Hershey High School in Hershey. 
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GREENE COUNTY CHURCH DIRECTORY 
FIRST METHODIST 

WAYNESBURG 
9:45, Church School; 10 :45, 

Worship ; Monday, 3:30, Junior 
Choir ; Tuesday, 8, Senior Choir , 
Wednesday, 4, Primary Fellow­
ship. 

WASHINGTON STREET 
METHODIST, 

WAYNESBURG 
9:30 Church School ; 10:45 , 

Worship : 6:30, Youth Group : 
Wednesday, 7. Choir rehearsal ; 
8, Bible study. 

WEST GREENE PARISH 
BETHANY · 9, Worship, 10, 

Church School. 
VALLEY CHAPEL: 10 · 10 

Worship : 11, Church School 
ROGERVILLE 10, Church 

School , II , Worship 

JEFFERSON 
METHODIST CHARGE 

JEFFERSON : 9:30, Worship . 
10 :40, Church School , Wednes­
day , 4 15, Junior Choir ; 6:30. Sen­
ior Choir. 

RICES LANDING 10. Church 
School ; 11 , Worship 

MILLSBORO : 7:30, Evening 
Worship. 

CARMICHAELS 
METHODIST 

9: 45, Sunday School , 11 , Wor­
ship. 

GARARDS FORT 
METHODIST 

9 30, Worship . 10 30, Church 
School 

JOLLYTOWN 
METHODIST CHARGE 

LAUREL RUN 9, Worship . 
l0, Church School. 

GRANDVIEW 10, Worship , 
11 , Church School 

PLEASANT HILL: 10, Church 
School , 11 . Worship. 

JOLL YTOWN : 10, Church 
School , 11 , Worship. 

MT ZION . 10, Church School , 
11 , Worship. 

MONONGAHELA 
METHODIST CHARGE.• 

MORRISVILLE . 9, Church 
School , 10, Worship. 

COALLICK 10 . Church 
School ; II , Worship 

THROCKMORTON: 10 , 
Church School ; II. Worship. 

OAK FOREST: 10, Church 
School : 7:30. Worship (second 
and fourth Sundays) . 

MT. PLEASANT : 10, Wor­
ship. 

UNION 
METHODIST CHARGE 

UNION VALLEY : 10, Church 
School : 11.15, Worship , 7:30. 
MYF. 

FAIRVIEW : 10, Worship , 
Church School. Tuesday, Chotr 
practice. 

NEBO : 9, Worship : 10. Church 
School , II, MYF. 

FAIRALL 
CLAUGHTON CHAPEL . 9, 

Church School. II. Worship. 
FAIRALL: 10, Church School , 

II 15. Worship 
KIRBY 10, Church School ; 7. 

Worship. 
VALLEY CHAPEL · 9. Wor­

ship , 10, Church School 

WILLOW GROVE 
INDEPENDENT BAPTIST 
10, Sunday School , 11 , Wor­

shtp , Thursday, 7:30, prayer 
meeting. 

SUGAR GROVE 
BAPTIST 

10 , Worship . 11 , Church 
School 

MT. ZION BAPTIST 
10. Church School, l l. Wor­

ship, 7:30, Evening Worship 

CALVARY BAPTIST 
10, Sunday School ; I l. Wor­

ship , Wednesday, 7.30, prayer 
meetmg and Bible study. 

JEFFERSON BAPTIST 
9:45, Worship ; 10 .45. Church 

School . Wednesday, 7 30, prayer 
service. 

JOHN COLBY BAPTIST 
9:45, Worship . 10 :45, Church 

School , Thursday, 7 30, Bible 
Study and prayer . 

CARMICHAELS 
BAPTIST 

9·45, Church School , II , Wor­
ship , 7, Evening Worship . 
Wednesday, 7:30, Youth Choir. 
Bible Study 

FIRST BAPTIST 
WAYNESBURG 

9:30. Church School ; 10 .45, 
Worship ; 7, BYF: Wednesday, 
7: 30 , Evening Prayer Group. 

BATES FORK BAPTIST 
10, Church School ; II :30. Wor­

ship. 

9:55, Worship : II . Church 
School : 6:30, BYF and Jel 
Cadels. Saturday. 10. Unity Re­
hearsal. 

FIRST PRESBYTERIAN 
WAYNESBURG 

9:45, Church School : II. Wor­
ship : 6 30, College and Career 
Group ; 7, Senior High Fellow­
ship ; Wednesday. 3 45. Youth 
Club . Thursday. 7 30 Chancel 
Choir 

GREENE VALLEY 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 30, Church School . 11. Wor­
ship . 6.30 , Junior and Senior 
High Fellowship . Tuesday. 3 30. 
Teen Choir . Wednesday , 7. 
Calvin Choir , 8. Greene Valley 
Choir : Thursday . 4.15, Anl(el 
Choir. 

JEFFERSON 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 30. Worship 10 30. Church 
School 

REWITI 
PRESBYTERIAN 

9 45. Church School . 11 . Wor 
ship , Wednesday . 6. Wes t 
minister Cho1r . 7. Chancel Choir 

CARMICHAELS 
CHRISTIAN 

9 45, Churrh School . 11 , Wor· 
ship . Tuesday, 6:30, Chi Rho 
Wednesday. 3:45 , Chancel Choir , 
4:30, Youth Choir ; Saturday, II ,. 
Cherub Choir 

WAYNESBURG 
CHRISTIA 

9 30, Bible School , 10 30, Wor­
ship , 6, Youth Groups, 7, Eve• 
nmg Worship , Wednesday, 7 30. 
Bible Study: 8 30. Choir re­
hearsal 

MATHER CIIRISTIAN 
9 30, Bible S<:hool , 10 : 40, Wor 

ship , 7 30, Bible Study 

FIRST PILGRIM CHURCH 
WAYNESBURG 

9·45 . Sunday School ; II . Wor­
ship . 6:45. Young People : 7:30, 
Evening Worship Wednesday. 
7:30. prayer meeting. 

WAYNESBURG 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

10, Bible School : 10 :45. Wor­
ship. 6:30, Evening Service ; 
Wednesday, 7 30. Bible classes. 

ST. GEORGE'S EPISCOPAL 
WAYNESBURG 

8, Holy Communion : 9 30 , Sen­
ior High Class . 10 :30, Church 
School and Hol y Communion , 
Thursday, 7·30. Holy Commu­
n1011 

WAYNESBURG 
NAZARENE 

9: 45. Church School , 10 45. 
Worship : 7 30. Evening Services, 
Wednesday. 7 30, Prayer Service 
and NYPS 

ROLLING MEADOWS 
CHURCH 0~' GOD 

9 45, Sunday School , 11 . Wor­
ship . 7. Evangelistic Services. 
Wednesday . 7, Family Trammg 
Hour. 

ST. ANN'S CATHOLIC 
WAYNESBURG 

Saturday Anl1c1patory Mass. 
6 30. Sunday Masses. 8.30 and 
11.30 , Confessions. Saturday, 
3 30 to 4 30. 

CRABAPPLE 
COMMUNITY 

10. Church School, 11 Wor­
ship 7 30, Evangelrslic Service. 
Wednesday, 7 30, Prayer Meet 
mg 

WEST GREENE 
PRESBYTERIAN CHARGE 
HARMONY 9. Worship , 10, 

Church School 
liNITY-BRISTORIA JO· JO, 

Worship , II 10. Church School 
WEST UNION 10, Church 

School . 11 15, Worshtp 

HATF'IELD FF;RKY 
LUTHERAN PARISH 

ST PAUl,'S, Carmichaels 9, 
Worship . 10 15, Church &hool 

JACOflS 9, Worship , 11 , 
Church School 

John Humble & Sons 
CARPET COMPANY 

• Armstrong • Congoleum • Vmyts • Lees • Downs 
• Galaxy • V1kmg • Custom Weave • Callaway 

• BRUCE HAROWOOO FLOORS 
FREE SHOP AT HOME SERVICE TO 

• Aesldent1a1 • Commercial • lndu11na1 

1000 E. High Street, Waynesburg 
Phone 628-5229 

Howard's Grocery 
Two Friendly Stores To Serve You 

OPEN EVENINGS 
120 East Hi/lh Street - 627-5115 
E8At Greene Street - 627-7007 

W ellslee Coca-Cola 
Bottling Co. 

Drink Coca-Cola in Bottle• 

"Things Go Better With Coke" 

R.D. l, Box 215-H 
Morgantown, W. Va. 26505 

Fox Auto Sales, Inc. 

Mercury .. Ford Cars and Trucks 

SALES aml SERVICE 

7 43 Eoot Hi/lh Sr. 
Phone 627-3 I 51 

Stop & Shop 
At The 

FASHION SHOP 
In Waynr1hur,r 

Size 3 through Half Sizes 

"Soy It With l-1owen" 
Anytim.- • Anywher.­

Phont• 727,6196 

117 ~ul H1-h Slrf'f'I 
W•ynt"llfmrf( 

WAYNESBURG l<'LORAL 
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Countians Nan1ed To Waynesburg College Dean's List 
WAYNESBURG - Slxty•two stu• 

dents rrom Grc~ne County were 
nmong 172 students named to the 
Academic Dean's list at Wayncsburi1 
College for the first semester of the 
1983-34 academic year. 

Academic Dean G. Wayne Smith 
sald those named to the list compiled 
semester averages of 3.25 or hi gher 
on a 4.0 scale. Highest honors denotes 
a perfect 4.0 average ; honors an aver­
age of at least 3.5, and honorable 
mention an average of at least 3.25. 

Greene County students on the 
list : 

lllghest Honors - Llsa Elek 
Jones, Carmichaels; Michael Zcglen, 
Clarksville ; Kevin S. Henderson , 
Rices Landing; Karen E. Connolly, 
Sycamore ; Aviva D. Bower , Waynes­
burg ; Karl A. J arek, Waynesburg; 
Amy M. McMill an, Waynesburg ; 
Sharon L. Wagner, Waynesburg : 
Cheryl L. Ziler , Waynesburg; Re­
becc11 S. Henderson, Carmichaels; 
Margaret T. Crouse , Prosperity ; 
Linda K. Schifko, Rices Landing ; 
Charles R. Beyer , Waynesburg; 
Joyce A. Conkltn ,-Waynesburg ; De· · 
borah H. Larson, Wa ynesburg; 

W ayneshurg Woman 
Receives Scholarship 

WAYNESBURG - Nadine Ob· 
ermiller, a Waynesburg College stu­
dent from Waynesburg, has been 
selected to receive a scholarship 
award under the new Scholars in 
Education program. 

The program. administered by the 
Pennsylvania Higher Education As­
sistance Agency, is open to students 
from Pennsylvania who are enrolled 
in colleges and universities within the 
Commonwealth which have ac­
credited teacher-education pro­
grams, 

Mrs . Obermiller is the second 
Waynesburg College student to re­
ceive an award under this program. 
Earlier , Carla Wheeler . a senior from 
Washington , received an award . 

Recipients of the awards must 
meet academic criteria established 
by the PHEAA and must be com-

milted to teaching mathematics or 
science at the secondary level in 
Pennsylvania . 

Mrs. Obermiller is majoring in 
geology and is pursuing a secondary­
education certificate. As a recipient, 
she has agreed to teach one year for 
each year she receives the award. 

Dr. Paul Perdew, Mathematics 
Department chairman ; Dr. R. Carl 
Carnien, Geology Department chair­
man; Dr. Donald D. Christian , as­
sociate academic dean and Education 
Department chairman ; and Jamie 
Scott, assistant director of financial 
aid, assisted Mrs. Obermiller in ob­
taining the award. 

Waynesburg College has both an 
elementary education program and a 
secondary education program lead· 
ing to certi fica tion in biology , 
chemistry , English, general science, 
mathematics and social studies. 

Lauren M. Patterson, Waynesburg; 
Megan M. West, Waynesburg. 

Honors - Malvine A. Jacobs, 
Waynesburg ; Duane D. Makel , Rices 
Landing ; Irma J . Vihlidal , Jefferson ; 
R. Virginia Moore, Carmichaels; 
Bruce J . Randolph , Waynesburg ; 

ENGAGED - Mrs. Lois Speelman 
of Waynesburg R.D.4 and Robert 
Speelman of Waynesburg are an­
nouncing the engagement of their 
daughter Lynne Renee to Thomas 
Braun Jr. of Washington , son of Dr. 
Thomas Braun of Bentleyville and 
the late Muriel Braun. She is a 1980 
graduate of Waynesburg Central 
High School and a 1983 graduate of 
Waynesburg College and is a 
substitute teacher. Her fiance is a 
graduate of Bentworth High School 
and is employed as an optician at 
DuBois Optical in Washington. A 
July 21 , 1984, wedding is planned. 

Cal State 
Appoints 
Instructors 

CALIFORNIA - Dr. 
Margaret A. Marcinek 
and Sandra Olsen have 
been appointed to the up­
per division nursing pro­
gram at California Uni­

' versity. 

I 

t 

Nadine Obermiller is congratulated by Jamie Scott on her 
scholarship award. Looking on are, from left , Dr. R. Carl 
Ca111ein and Dr. Donald D. Christian. 

all around greene 
GETS PROMOTION 

Kerry A. Swestyn, son of Norma J . 
Swestyn of Rices Landing and Daniel 
Swestyn of Miami , Fla., has been 
promoted in the U.S. Air Force to the 
rank of technical sergeant. 

He is an avionics systems techni­
cian at Torrejon Air Base, Spain , with 
the40lst Tactical Fighter Wing. 

His wife, Lois, is the daughter of 
Phyllis Baker of Roanoke, Va. The 
sergeant is a 1972 graduate of Miami 
Coral Park High School. 

SECOND BIRTHDAY 
Daniel Ryan Roszak, son of Mr. 

and Mrs. Dan Roszak of Dilliner 
R.D.l , celebrated his second birthday 
on Wednesday, Jan. 18. 

He is the grandson of Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Novak of Bobtown and Mr. and 
Mrs. Kasmier Roszak of Masontown. 
Great-grandparents are Mrs. Eliza­
beth Johnson of Masontown and Mrs. 
Amelia Snyder of Uniontown. 

BIBLE CLASS MEETS 
Connie Moody was elected presi­

dent of the Mildred Siflon Adult Bible 
Class at the Bobtown United Method· 
ist Church. 

Other officers are Grace Davison, 
vice president , Connie Fell , secre-

tary-treasurer ; Joan Dingle, devo­
tional leader ; Nell Scott, assistant 
devotional leader and George Gapen , 
pianist. 

METHODIST CLASSES 
The administrative board of the 

Bobtown United Methodist Church 
has voted to hold adult confirmation 
classes on Monday nights at 7 p.m, 
beginning when books arrive. 

The classes will be held fo r mem­
bers of the church and anyone who 
desires to learn more of the church 
doctrines and history. Those in­
terested as asked to contact Rev. Dan 
Glover at 943-4085. 

It was also learned at the board 
meeting that the 1983 budget would 
not be met through offerings . The 1984 
budget was reviewed. 

4-H MEETING HELD 
The Waynesburg 4-H Horse and 

Pony Club met recently to discuss the 
annual horse show to be held May 13. 

Guest speaker was photographer 
Bernie Kowalsi. 

The next meeting will be held at 10 
a.m. Saturday , Feb. 4, in the 4-H 
Building at the Greene County Fair­
ground New members will be wel­
comed. 

They will teach 
classroom and clinical 
courses, help with cur­
riculum development 
and seek out agencies 
that will provide work 
experience for students . 

Mrs . Marcinek re­
ceived a diploma from 
the Uniontown Hospita l 
School of Nursing, a 
bachelor's degree from 
Pennsylvania State Uni­
vers ity, a m aste r ' s 
degree from the Univer­
sity of Maryland and a 
doctorate in education 
from West Virginia Uni­
versity . 

She worked as a nurse 
at Allegheny General 
and Presbyterian Uni­
versity hospitals and 
was a faculty member at 
WVU. She has published 
article s in se ve r a l 
professional journals 
and has spoken at state 
and national 
professional meetings. 

The daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. J oseph Boyle, 
Masontown, she and her 
husband , Bernard, live 
in Point Marion. 

Mrs. Olsen holds a 
bachelor's degree from 
the College of St. Scho­
lastica. Deluth, Minn., 
and a master 's degree 
from the University or 
Minnesota . She has 
worked as a hospital 
staff nurse in Minnesota , 
Iowa and South Dakota, 
an instructor in a nurs­
ing program in South 
Dakota and supervisor 
of community health 
nursing in Pierre, S.D. 
She is a specialist in ma­
ternal-ehild nursing. 

She and her husband , 
Tom , li ve in Uniontown. 

California offers a 
bac he lor of science 
degree in nursing. 

Chamber Of Commerce 
Will Hold Elections 

3 Greene County Students 
R eceive Degrees At PSU 

WAYNESBURG - Elections to fill several 
vacancies on the board of directors will be held 
during a general membe, ship luncheon meeting of 
the Greater Waynesburg Area Chamber of Com­
merce Wednesday , Jan . 25 , in the main dining room 
of Benedum Hall at Waynesburg College. 

Guest speaker will be Waynesburg College Pres­
ident J . Thomas Mills. Tlle deadline for reserva­
tions is Monday, Jan . 23. Reservation may be made 
by calling the chamber office at 627-5926. 

Those nominated to fill the board of director 
vacancies are Don Headlee, of Gallatin National 
Bank ; Jacki Eddy, McDonalds Restaurant ; Pat 
Wachter, Hardees Restaurant ; Jill Antonacci , Tri­
County Carpel; Vanda Wall , Ki,w1 Fence; and Sam 
Milliken, Mariner and Milliken Funeral Home. 

The chamber will sponsor an Estate Planning 
Seminar to be held from 9 a .m. until 3 p.m. on 
Wednesday, Feb. 29 , in the Waynesburg Moose 
Lodge. Additional information may be obtained 
from the chamber office located in the old county 
office building, Waynesburg. 

Three students from Greene County received 
degrees at the fall semester commencement cere­
monies at Pennsylvania State Umversity at Umver­
sity Park this month. 

Robert J . Stajnrajh of (;armichaels R D.2 re­
reived a bachelor of science dq'ree in mining 
engineering and Glenn D. Miller o: Clarksville 
received a bachelor of science degree in electrical 
engineering. 

Mark A. Ross of Clarksville received a bachelor 
of art.~ degree in r Pneral arts and sciences 

Divorces Granted 
WAYNESBURG - Two divorce decrees were 

handed down in Greene County Court Thursday by 
Judge Glenn Toothman. Both were under no-fau lt 
agreements. 

J ames H. Ely of 'W,;lynesburg and Slurley Victor 
Ely, also of Waynesburg, were married Oct. 13, 
1955, and had eight children. 

John D. Cettln of Dill iner and Victoria Jeffries 
Cettin were married July 2 1979, and had two 
children. 

Jennifer L. Pool , Waynesburg ; Brian 
D. Griedel, Waynesburg ; David L. 
McCollum , Waynesburg ; Karen E. 
Sabo, Mather ; Christopher P . Hudak, 
Greensboro; Ronda A. Whipkey, 
Greensboro; Carol M. Huffman, 
Spraggs; Jeffrey C. Kurtyka , Rices 
Landing ; Dolores J . Edwards, Carmi­
chaels; Dennis K. Hooker , Wind 

Bowlby Library 
Lends Cameras 

WAYNESBURG - Operation 
Outreach and Bowlby Public Library 
in Waynesburg are participating in 
" Check This Out," a program provid­
ing free instant cameras to public 
libraries throughout the United 
States. 

The cameras, which are from the 
600 series, feature built-in electronic 
flash and one-button operation. Spon­
sored by the Customer Services 
Division of Polaroid Corp., the pro­
gram is being offered in cooperation 
with the American Library Associa­
tion. 

According to Polaroid Program 
Manager Lynda Wilson , the idea of 
borrowing a camera from the library 

. isn' t as unusual as it may seem. 

.. 

"Libraries offer a wide variety of 
services and materials to patrons," 
she said. " Instant cameras are a 
natural for an information-oriented 
facility like a library." 

At Operation Outreach or Bowlby 
Library, persons 15 years old or older 
with valid library cards may borrow 
a camera for up to two weeks. Pa­
trons must supply their own film . 

For additional information, call 
852-1900. 

Ridge ; Ossama 0 . Boulos, J efferson ; 
Michael T. Churney, Sycamore ; 
Mary M. Zimmerman. Waynesburg ; 
Rudy K. Marisa , Waynesburg ; Jan R. 
Ellis, Waynesburg ; Melody R. Ben• 
nett , Mt. Morr is; Michael G. 
Menharl, Carmichaels; John E. Ad­
dis, Rices Landing ; Janet S. Morris, 
Graysville ; Peter Kovalec, Waynes­
burg ; Bryan S. Cumber ledge , 
Waynesburg. 

Honorable Mention - Glenn T. 
Curry, Carmichaels ; Nadine M. Ob­
ermiller , Waynesburg ; John H. Hig­
gins , Wa ynesburg; Theresa L. 
Crouse, Carmichaels; T. Craig 
Burkhead, Waynesburg ; Billie J . Lee, 
Carmichaels; Denise E. McDonald , 
Clarksville ; John L. Behm, Jeferson ; 
Donna M. Miller, Carmichaels : 
Margaret A. Smith, Waynesburg; 
Donna S. Helms, Waynesburg ; 
Margaret A. Yorko, Carmichaels; 

Craft Classes 
Are Offered 

WAYNESBURG - Those in­
terested in participating in arts and 
craft classes at the Greene County 
Craftsman will have until Feb. 4 to 
register for classes. 

Being offered for the winter-spring 
session are such classes as cake deco­
rating , soft-sculpture dolls, tin 
punching and piercing, macreame 
purses, flower arranging , bow mak­
ing, candy making, stained glass, 
chicken scratch embroidery. begin­
ners tole painting and bunny Easter 
baskets. 

Fees range from $3 to $28.50. Ad· 
vanced registration .is required. For 
additional information call 852-2249. 

Kr istin M. Connolly, Sycamore, 
Kathy F. Lawver , Waynesburg ; Mi­
chael J . Floreak, Rices Landing ; 
Barbara A. Moss, Waynesburg ; Pa­
tricia L. Enoff, Greensboro; Jeanine 
M. Husarcik , Jefferson ; Paul A. De­
ynzer , Waynesburg . 

Students On 
Dean's List 

CALIFORNIA - Several students 
from Greene County were recently 
named to the dean 's list at California 
University of Pennsylvania for the 
1983 fall semester. 

Receiving highest honors were 
David Little and Rubert Vilenica, 
both of Carmichaels ; Donna Frameli 
of Clarksville ; Kimberly Ann Krause 
of Crucible ; Ruth Ann Medenciy of 
Prosperity ; Tyra Braden of Jef­
ferson ; Cynthia Mancini of Green­
sboro ; Debra Dotts of Nemacolin ; 
Sharon Thomas of Rices Landing and 
Earlene Schifko of Waynesburg. 

High honors were received by Jef­
frey Baney and Stephen McCann , 
both of Carmichaels ; Margaret Cor-

. azzi and Dale Davis , both of Clarks­
ville ; Patricia Correll of Holbrook ; 
Susan Hathaway of Jefferson; James 
Goode and Kimberly Willis, both of 
Rices Landing and J anis Shipe of 
Waynesburg. 

Making the honors list were 
Valerie Galatic and Elizabeth Lucas, 
both of Carmichaels ; Richard Krause 
of Crucible ; Emil Paci of Ne111acolin; 
Colleen Ryan of Rices Landing and 
Louise Antonelli , Suzanne Lemley 
and Karen Schifko, all of Waynes­
burg. 

Ten grand-prize fi nalis~s wil! be 
selected from claimed free-ticket 
winners. They will then be e ligible 
to win a top prize of $1,000-a-week 
for life ( $1 million guaranteed.) To 
be eligible, free-ticket winners must 

--\ be claimed by a date to 
\ be announced. 

~ •

0 

On the average, 
1 in 4 tickets wins. 

1 in 10 tickets 
wins cash. 
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Mon River Lock Project 
Necessary Improvement 

The economic importance to the entire region of adequate 
navigational facilities on the Monongahela River has been 
emphasized once more in a feasibility study just completed by 
the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers. 

The report, which deals with alternatives for correcting the 
river bottleneck created by the antiquated locks and dams at 
Greensboro and Point Marion, reiterates the importance of 
good river transportation to industrial development throughout 
the length of the Mon Valley - something which is becoming 
increasingly important in the face of the crisis in heavy steel. 

The report recommends replacement of the existing lock 
and dam at Greensboro with a larger facility three miles 
downstream at Grays Landing at a cost of $91.9 million. It also 
recommends that a new and larger lock be built at Point 
Marion at a cost of $70.7 million. 

Both of the present structures were built in 1925 and are the 
only ones on the river between Fairmont, W.Va. and Pittsburgh 
which have not been replaced or updated. The problems they 
can cause was underscored last month when a malfunction at 
the Point Marion lock caused a loaded coal barge to sink in the 
lock chamber, closing the river to traffic for almost a week. 

The Corps of Engineers study is currently being reviewed by 
the Board of Engineers for Rivers and Harbors at Fort Belvoir, 
Va., which will receive written comments on it until Feb. 7. It 
will then go to the Corps headquarters at Washington, D.C. for 
action. 

The report has received the endorsement of DINAMO, a 
Pittsburgh-based coalition committed to improving inland 
waterways, and was also welcomed by Congressman Austin J. 
Murphy and other legislators who have been pushing in 
Congress for the funds necessary to build the two structures. 

The campaign to update the two locks and dams has been 
underway for a number of years. But for the first time, chances 
for obtaining the necessary funding now appear realistically 
bright. 

It's something that would benefit all southwestern Pennsyl­
vanja and it needs to be done. 

WAYNESBURG REPUBLICAN 

Faces From The Past-Do You Recognize Them? 
~ --

H.C .. Sayers Jr., left and H.C. Sayers are pictured here skinning small animals at their 
gar11ge in Waynesburg. 

Decision On Prosecuting 
Phillippi, Conklin Delayed 

PITTSBURGH - U.S. Attorney 

Jerry Johnson told the Observer-Re­

porter Tuesday no determination has 

been made at this time about federal 

prosecution of Dr. Grover Phillippi 
and Michael Conklin in the alleged 

kidnapping of a Mt. Lebanon stock­
broker. 

"We are reviewing the complete 

file at this time, but no decision has 

been made," Johnson said. 
Assistant District Attorney 

Anthony Krastek of Allegheny County 

confirmed this week that stockbroker 

Robert J. Haye was held prisoner 

inside a warehouse located in West 

Virginia. For a time, police. thought 

the warehouse was in Fayette County, 
Pennsylvania. 

Only three acres of the 47-acre 

farm , which includes an abandoned 
farmhouse , are in Pennsylvania. 

However, the Mason-Dixon line goes 
between the farmhouse and the re­

cently constructed warehouse. An en­

gineering firm was hired by Fayette 

County Court Agrees 

County officials to survey the prop­
erty and it was determined the ware­
house is 50 feet into West Virginia. 

Monongalia County (W.Va.) Pros­
ecutor Thomas Newbraugh told the 
Observer-Reporter Tuesday he talked 
with Allegheny County officials last 
Friday and they said nothing about 
federal prosecution in the case. "Per­
haps they will let me know something 
today," Newbraugh said. 

Phillippi and Conklin remain in the 
Allegheny County Jail in lieu of 
$100,000 cash bond. 
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Fact 
and 

Folklore 
1 John O'Hara 

Good old mother nature. 
Just when you think you can' t 

stand one more day of sub-freezing 
weather, along comes a day of 
sunshine such as we had on Monday 

Greene County, like every other 
area in eastern United States, has 
been ,uffering through several days 
of sub-zero weather since Christmas 
weekend. No one has been happy with 
the exception of tow truck operators, 
garage owners and plumbers. 

_Only this past Saturday, the of­
ficial weather reporting station in 
Waynesburg noted it was 20 degrees 
below zero. 

The local weather recorder said it 
was the coldest Christmas in Greene 
County in the past 60 years since 
records have been kept. Last Satur­
day 's temperature was the second 
coldest on record and the lowest in the 
past 21 years. 

For those who keep track of such 
things, the coldest temperature regis­
tered here ofticially was a 25 degrees 
below recorded on Jan . 29, 1963. 

You might also note the first 
month of 1977 was the coldest month 
recorded here. The temperature got 
above freezing on only six of the 31 
days . Below zero readings were re­
corded on 15 of the 31 days with the 
lowest being minus 16 on both Jan. 13 
and 14. The average low temperature 
was 3.9 degrees above zero and the 
average high was 24.9. 

Those who like to flee Greene 
County each winter in search of 
warmer climes did not escape the 
lastest cold wave. Every state in the 
union, with the exception of Hawaii. 
had temperatures below freezing one 
day last week. 

Crews from the Southwestern 
Pennsylvania Water Authority were 
the busiest people in the county the 
past few weeks. The combination of 
old lines and sub-zero temperatures 
caused many breaks that sent water 
into the streets to freeze and add 
more woes for the drivers . 

At least one funeral had to be 
postponed last week because the 
ground was frozen so hard the grave­
diggers could not dent the plot. 

AROUND TOWN 
By THE STAFF 1. CoTunWAtOyYNCoEu!lrtBaUgRrreedG ~TupeTsdheay!ltroeedn1·s~~~ "~~!~f ~, U.I 

, the house was in Pennsylvania and 

miss a drug law violation charge not in West Virginia." 

Newsletter Features 
Victim's Interview 
By Christie A. Molzon, Staff Wnter outlook for the future of A.U.B. was 

positive. He spoke on the need to 
develop more programs for the uru­
versity as well as recruiting new 
faculty and administrative members 
and seemed hopeful that more non­
Lebanese students would enroll in the 
school once circumstances in the 
country improve. 

Pfc. Michael McGinnis, son of Mr 
and Mrs . Phillip McGinnis of West 
Finley, has been presented the Army 
Commendation Medal and Combat 
Infantry Badge for duty in the recent 
Grenada operation. 

Greene County Treasurer Joseph 
Souders has returned to his duties 
following major surgery at a Pitts­
burgh hospital. A former state police­
man, Mr. Souders was recently 
sworn-in for his second term. 

The story of two Waynesburg men 
having been charged with kidnapping 
and criminal conspiracy was page 
one news all over the United States 
The incident was even reported in the 
ultra-<:onservative financial maga­
zine Barron's in a tongue-in-<:heek 
manner 

Greene County residents have 
been suffering as the result of the 
" Siberian E,cpress" cold wave that 
caused freezing temperatures in 49 of 
the 50 states on one day last week. The 
local water company has had the 
most problems what with broken Imes 
in all parts of the county. Tow truck 
operators and garages are having a 
field day . 

Jake Bennett of Maidsville, W.Va. 
was killed in a head-on crash on 
Interstate 79 last week. It was re-

ported that he was chasing another 
motorist who had backed into his car 
in a Morgantown parking lot. Bennett 
apparently gave up the chase and 
crossed the medial to return to the 
Mt. Morris exit. A tractor-trailer 
drove up the back of his sports car 
killing him and seriously injuring two 
young women passengers . 

Waynesburg is all aglow following 
the installation of new street lights in 
the two-block area between Morris 
and Morgan Streets. The recent snow 
reflects the lamp light and gives the 
appearance of an old-time street 
before the turn of the century. 

Contractor Bill Hopkins and his 
crew recently razed part of an old 
hardware store in Rogersville in re­
cord time. A resident called to sug­
gest a picture but before the photog­
rapher could reach the scene, 
Hopkins and his crew had the struc­
ture down and was loading debris on 
the trucks. The work is being done 
prior to construction of a new bridge. 

John McCall , former Waynesburg 
Borough manager, has accepted a 
position with the Kiwi Fence Co in 
Waynesburg. McCall will retain his 
interest in a clothing store on East 
High Street. Kiwi Fence Co., owned 
by Mr. and Mrs. John Wall , special­
izes ,in special fencing and trellises. 

Attendance At Texas 
Convention Approved 

CARMICHAELS - After much 
discussion , the Carmichaels Area 
School Board approved by a vote of 
l>-4 the attendance of the superinten­
dent, business manager and any 
board member at the National School 
Board Association convention this 
spring in Houston, Texas. The action 
was taken at their meeting Thursday 
mght. 

New board member James Clovis 
objected to any member attending the 
convention saying, that the money 
might be better spent by attending 
conferences within the state. Board 
members who had attended the na­
tional convention in the past stated 
their beliefs that knowledge gathered 
in the convention workshops had 
enabled them to save money for the 
district. 

Board President Henry Bacan said 
he believed attendance at the conven­
tion was valuable to the district the 
same as teachers and other district 
employees attending conferences in 
their area of responsibility. 

Following an executive session the 
board voted to offer employment to 
Linda W. Nichols as elementary li­
brarian. She is currently serving as a 

substitute in that position and was 
placed on the third step of the dis­
trict's contracted salary scale . 

Erma Jean Thomas reported on 
the success of a thre~ay workshop 
on drug and alcohol abuse which was 
attended by administrators, teachers , 
parents , and student representatives 
from each school building in the dis­
trict. The district policy and cur­
riculum were reviewed and a plan is 
being developed to teach prevention 
of drug and alcohol abuse district 
wide. 

The board also gave approval to 
business manager Louis Pascuzw to 
participate in cooperative purchasing 
board in which the district's general 
supplies will be purchased through 
the Intermediate Unit with a seven to 
10-percent savings. 

The board approved changing the 
district's checking account to one 
which gives a slightly higher interest 
rate. 

Board member Edward Chess ex­
pressed his appreciation to security 
personnel Mary Lewis aad Leroy 
Baker for the good job they have been 
doing during basketball and wresting 
events at the high school 

against Jerry Lewis Williams, 23, The West Virginia trooper then 

New Freeport R.D.2. turned the evidence over to Pennsyl-

The motion to drop the charge was vania state police, who brought 

made by District Attorney Charles W. charges. 
Morris, who told the court that no Morris said he agreed with the 

search warrant was obtained by a defense attorney that the arrest was 

West Virginia state trooper. The defective because no search warrant 

trooper had received an anonymous was received . 
tip that marijuana was being grown "If the officer had just happened to 

at the Williams home, located on the be driving past and had seen the 

West Virginia line. plants , he would have been correct in 

"The officer drove to the scene and what he did ," Morris said. "But hav­

saw two or three plants growing on ing gone to the house on the basis of a 

the property," Morris said. "There tip. he should have obtained a search 

was no one at the house so he took warrant before entering onto the 

photographs and pulled up the plants property." 

Court Hears Testimony 
On Fuller's Dismissal 

WAYNESBURG -
The Greene County 
Court took testimony 
Friday on events which 
led to the dismissal last 
fall of Michael J . Fuller 
as a member of the 
Waynesburg Borough 
pohce force . 

Fuller, who was fired 
in September for refus­
ing to obey a direct order 
from his superior of­
ficers , has appealed the 
dismissal on the grounds 
that his constitutional 
rights were violated and 
that he was the target of 
bias by his immediate 
supervisor, LI. David 
Clark . 

Fuller's dismissal 
stemmed from an inci­
dent on Aug . 19 when LI. 
Clark overheard part of 
a conversation at the po­
lice station between 
Fuller, Patrolman Glenn 
Bates and state police 
Trooper Joseph Palmer 
He reached the con­
clusion that the borough 
officers were being 
critical of the police de­
partment to an outsider 
in violation of a pohcy 
which prohibits public 
critical discussion of 
matters involving police 
department affairs. 

Bates complied with 
an order from Clark to 
write a report about the 
subject matter of the 
conversation in which he 
stated that no matters of 
departmental policy 
were discussed Fuller, 
however, refused to sub­
mit a written report, al­
though ordered to do so 
by both Clark and Chief 

Timothy Hawfield. 
Fuller, a veteran of 

five years on the police 
force , was suspended by 
Mayor Roy Huffman and 
on Sept. 12 borough 
council dismissed him 
from the police force . a 
decision which subse­
quently was upheld by 
the borough Civil Ser­
vice Commission follow­
ing a public hearing held 
in October. 

Fuller's attorney. 
Robert Clarke of Wash­
ington , called a former 
patrolman, Timothy 
Stevenson, in an effort to 
show that while he had 

all around 
greene 

RECEIVES MEDAL 
Tech. Sgt. Donald J 

Smith, son of Mr and 
Mrs Columbus Smith of 
Clarksville, has received 
the Air Force Achieve­
ment Medal during cere­
monies at Holloman Air 
Force Base, N.M 

The award is given in 
recognition of ac­
complishment, merito­
rious service or acts of 
courage. 

Smith 1s a metal shop 
supervisor with the 
833rd Civil Engineering 
Squadron 

His wife Diana 1s the 
daughter or Rheta 
Klapak of Cleveland 
Heights, Ohio.and the 
sergeant is a 1968 gradu 
ate of Beth Center High 
School 

also been charged with 
disobeying an order at a 
different time, he was 
subjected to no more 
than a three-day 
suspension. 

Harry Cancelm1, at­
torney for the borough, 
elicited information that 
the circumstances sur­
rounding that incident 
were different and that 
an apology had been 
made. To counter the 
claim that Fuller had 
been a target of Lt 
Clark, he brought out 
testimony that until the 
time of the August inci­
dent Clark had publicly 
supported Fuller in the 
aftermath of the 
McGilton shootmg case. 

Patrolman Bates and 
Fuller testified that the 
d1scuss1on on Aug. 17 
was a private , general 
discussion which did not 
involve police depart­
ment matters and Tpr 
Palmer testified that he 
did not recall the subJect 
of the conversation 

Fuller's attorney con­
tends that Fuller was ex· 
erci s ing his First 
Amendment rights in 
holding a private dis­
cussion while off duty 
and that his superior of• 
ficers did not have the 
right to demand that he 
prepare a report on the 
conversation 

Arguments m the case 
will be held before the 
court sometime in 

March, setting the stage 
for a decision on th<' ap­
peal from the ruling or 
the Civil Service Com­
mission 

WAYNESBURG - The same 
morning she learned the president of 
the American University of Beirut 
was killed, Patricia Byers received. 
ironically, a newsletter from the 
school - featuring an interview with 
the president. 

Dr Malcolm Kerr, president of 
A.U.B., was shot to death Wednesday 
morning in one of the campus build­
ings. A pro-Iranian Moslem group has 
claimed responsibility for the as­
sassination of the 52-year-old father of 
four who assumed his duties as presi­
dent of the university this fall . 

In the most recent A.U.B. Newslet­
ter, Kerr is quoted as saying he hoped 
to keep the school out of the regional 
conflicts. "For the time being," he 
said, "we must remain insulated 
from the conflicts of the country and 
of the region in general. We sympa­
thize with all the people of Lebanon 
and the Middle East on a human 
level , but we are not involved in any 
of their factional conflicts.'· 

Mrs. Byers , who lived in Beirut 
from 1967 to 1970 when her husband 
was university chaplain, said remain­
ing apart from problems in the region 
was common for A.U.B. " It 's been 
almost a sanctuary and that's partly 
because almost all the Moslem and 
Christian leaders were educated 
there and respect it " 

The Byers' lived on campus during 
their stay and were sometimes ad­
vised to remain on campus. " Even 
then there were very strong Moslem 
factions who were anti-American ," 
she said 

Mrs. Byers, now Associate Dean of 
Student Life at Waynesburg College, 
noted several years after she left 
Lebanon the Dean of Students at 
A U.B. was assassinated in much the 
same way Kerr was on Wednesday 

Kerr was prounounced dead at 
American University Hospital where 
Mrs. Byers had served as a volunteer 
nurse's aide in the surgical clime She 
ootcd the ho pita I is the best equipped 
medical facility in the area and there­
fore essential to Lebanon. In the in­
terview, Kerr mentionned the hosp1· 
ta! as one way the university was 
assisting the Lebanese people during 
the recent strife •· we have treated 
thousands of casualties from all con­
flicting ~ides." he said 

Kerr also noted there are over 
20,000 alumm of A U B throughout 
the world " We want them lo spread 
the word that we are alive, that we 
arc good, and that we are strong. We 
want them to encourage other people 
to come to the university either to 
study or to work " 

The interview with Kerr was done 
when he attended a re<'ent Board of 
Trustees meeting in New York The 
American University of Beirut was 
founded in 1866 by Presbyterian mls­
s1onanea and ls heen~ed by the State 
of New York 

Throughout the interview Kerr's 

" Despite the discouraging situ­
ation in Lebanon , A.U.B. has 
survived. 11...will play an even more 
important role when Lebanon 
bounces back to normalcy. We exist 
to help our fellow man, and we want 
to present a good example of de­
termination and perseverance," he 
said, 

Court Cases 
Generate 
$280,671 

WAYNESBURG - The office of 
Clerk of Courts Al Darney has gener­
ated $280,671 ill revenues for Greene 
County during the past four years. 

According to a statistical report 
prepared by Darney and members of 
his staff, the greatest caseload in­
crease has come in the area of 
domestic relations, where the number 
of cases has jumped from 156 in 1980 
to 260 in 1983. 

Criminal cases, where a large per­
centage of the revenues are gener­
ated through fines and costs , have 
remained fairly constant, with 315 
being processed in 1980, 326 in 1981, 
289 In 1982 and 349 in 1983. 

The report shows that the office 
turned over to the county $56.7546 in 
1980, $79,069 in 1981, $70,254 in 1982 and 
$74,591 in 1983 

" We have never operated In the 
red ," Darney said "Each year we 
have generated enough revenues to 
more than offset the cost of operating 
the office " 

The number of juvenile cases han­
dled is another area where there has 
been a marked Increase, jumping 
from 46 in 1980 to 73 in 1983 

Marriage license business has 
been stabile , with 3411 being Issued in 
1980, 358 in 1981, 356 in 1082 and 341 In 
1983. 

Orphans court casea, which in 
volve the settling or small estates and 
related matters, did not fluctuate by 
more than 10 cases during the four 
years, totaling 76 In 1983. The same 
holds true or the handling of first and 
final accounts of estates . which 
numbered 64 last year 

Also during the past year, 
Oamey 's office handled 27 adoptions, 
16 case, involving lhl' appointment of 
guardians for Incompetents , 5 road 
clo!ings and openings, and 117 other 
miscellaneous matters, auch as ap­
pointments, processing or court or­
ders, etc, 
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'Brave Little Tailor' Arriving 
WAYNESBUHG Mlch11el Flinn , 

administrator of Greene County Me­
morial Hospita l, has announced the 
next performance in the series for 
child development will be "The Brave 
Little Tailor." to be presented at 7 
p.m Tuesday , Feb. 7 in the Waynes­
burg Central H111h School auditorium. 

It marks the third producation 
sponsored by the hospital this season. 
The shows are being presented by the 
Pittsburgh Playhouse Jr. under the 

direction of Point Park College. 
The play centers on a stage-struck 

girl who dreams she has been cast as 
a maid In her favorite fairytale . She 
wakes to find her prince charming­
the tailor- ready, willing and able to 
defend her against giants who have 
been terrorizing the kingdom and Its 
two flighty queens. 

The tailor's brilliant plans move 
him through contests of bravery, 
wrestling matches, high-speed chases 

• co0101un1ty events 
· ATIENDS COURSE 

Or. James T. Miller of Waynes­
burg recently attended a course on 
dental implants using the Core-Vent 
Implant System which consists of 
placing a titanium, threaded implant 
in the jaw bone. 

The system is an alternative for 
those who have had difficulty with 
conventional removable partial and 
complete dentures. It is a procedure 
that can be performed in a short time 
with local anesthesia in the dental 
office. 

JEFFERSON PTO 
The J efferson -Morgan Parent­

reachers Organization voted al a re­
cent meeting to purchase fire extin­
guishers for each of the seven com­
puters being used in the elementary 
school. 

Members also voted to begin col­
lecting recipes to be included in a 
cookbook. There was no featured 
speaker and the time was spent dis­
cussing future activities . Reports 
were given on the spring fair, sixth­
grade banquet and newsletter. 

The next meeting will be held 
Tuesday , Feb. 7. 

ENDS TRAINING 
Navy Seaman Samuel B. Stahl, 

son of Mr. and Mrs. Samuel Stahl of 

Sycamore, has completed recruit 
training at the Naval Recruit Train­
ing Command in Great Lakes , Ill. 

Included In the studies were 
seamanship, close order drill , Naval 
history and first aid . 

DAUGHTER BORN 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Suhey of Bala 

C,Ynwyd, near Philadelphia, are an­
nounced the birth of their first child, a 
daughter, on Sunday, January 22, 
1984, in Philadelphia College of Os­
teopathic Medicine Hospital. The 
baby has been named Kara Ann. 

Mrs . Suhey is the former Carolyn 
Biddle, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Arthur Biddle of Carmichaels. Mr. 
Suhey is a son of Virginia Suhey of 
State College and Steve Suhey, is 
deceased. 

WIND RIDGE ITEMS 
The ladies auxiliary of the Wind 

Ridge Volunteer Fire Company will 
sponsor a Valentine's Day Dance next 
month in the firehall. It also was 
decided to hold the 25th anniversary 
on Oct. 25. Hostesses for the past 
meeting were Mary Jane Kent and 
Carole Helphenstine. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Staggers, son 
Dallas and twin daughters, Abigail 
and Julie of•Winona Lake, Ind., were 
overnight guests of his grandmother, 
Mrs. LeMoyne Staggers. 

Debbie Grooms and Lew Crouse with grand champion ram. 

Lew Crouse with reserve champion ewe. 

Area Sheep Bring 
In Several Prizes 

GRA YSVJLLE: - Lew Crouse of 
Stony Valley Farm near Graysville 
exib1ted several prize-winmng Mer­
ino sheep, including the grand cham­
pion and reserve champion, at the 
68th Pennsylvania State Farm Show 
held in Harrisburg last week. 

His February Merino ram lamb 
was named grand champion and a 
February ewe lamb was named re­
serve champion in one of the la rgest 
shows ever held a t the slate event. 

Crouse stock also took first and 

third in ram lambs, first for pair of 
ram lambs, first and second for year­
ling ewes, second and sixth for ewe 
lambs, thi rd for pair of ewe lambs, 
second for breeder 's young flock. first 
for pen of lambs, first for get--0f-sire, 
fi rst for Mer ino flock and also 10th for 
yearling Suffol k ewe in a very large 
class. 

In wool competition , Dale ~nd Lew 
Crouse combined and showed the 
first-place purebred ewe fleece and 
the third-place purebred ram fleece. 

and overall riotous actions. 
Tickets are on sale at the hospital 

administration office or they may be 
reserved at the door on the evening of 
the performance by calling 627-3101, 
extension 300. 

Cost of the tickets Is $3 for adults 
and $2 for each child. 

Any questions regarding the per­
formances may be addressed to Mrs. 
Linda Mosier, Greene County Memo­
rial Hospital, Bonar Avenue and 7th 
Street, Waynesburg, Pa. 15370. 

Burglar Takes 
Instruments, Dog 

A dog and surgical instruments 
were taken in a burglary early Tues­
day morning of the Waynesburg 
Animal Hospital. 

State police said the hospital build­
ing, owned and operated by Dr. 
Elmer Marx, was entered sometime 
between 12:30 and 8:30 a .m. Tuesday. 
Taken were a black and brown 
Dachshund owned by Nancy 
Guesman, of Crucible, and surgical 
instruments. 

CentralAnd West Greene 
Districts Cancel Classes 

WAYNESBURG - Classes were 
canceled Tuesday in two of Greene 
County's three school districts as 
freezing rain during the night created 
extremely hazardous conditions dur­
ing the morning hours. 

Officials in the Central Greene and 
West Greene school districts said they 
did not want to run the risk of school 
bus accidents on ice-glazed secondary 
roads. 

The Southeastern Greene School 
District went with a two-hour delay 
for the same reason. Only in the 
Carmichaels Area and Jefferson-

Morgan school districts, where there 
is less pupil transportation involved, 
were classes held on their normal 
schedules. 

Although there were no reports of 
any serious accidents, a Department 
of Highways official said that rural 
roads, both state and township, were 
extremely slick. 

"We had put enough salt on the 
main highways during the past week 
or so that they weren 't too bad, but 
the back roads, where anti-skid mate­
rials are used, were pretty bad," he 
said . 

public records-------
WAYNESBURG -

The following deeds 
were recorded during 
the past week in the of­
fice of Greene County 
Register and Recorder 
Thomas Headlee: 

Center Township 
Donald W. Jacobs, ex­

ecutor estate of Nellie 
Church Jacobs, York, to 
Paul E. and Martha J . Horr, 
Holbrook R.D. l, house and 
lot, Rogersville, $16,000. 

Cumberland Township 
Frederick F. and Donna 

K. Waine, Nemacolin , and 
others. to Frederick F. and 
Donna K. Waine, lot, Nema­
colin, $1. 

Greensboro 
Eugene M. Davis, Green­

sboro, to William E . and 
Laura J . Douglas, Washing­
ton, house and lot , Walnut 
Street, no consideration. 

Jackson Township 
Daniel R . Kablack , 

McKees Rocks, to William 

Lenhart, Avalon, 1.3 acres, 
$100. 

Jefferson Township 
Gary W. Burg, Medina, 

Ohio, and others, to Edward 
A. Burg Jr., Milwaukee, 
Wisc. , one-half interest in 
57.7 acres, $18,767. 

Perry Township 
Don William Peters , 

Maidsville, W.Va., to Doris 
Jean Peters Gooden , 
Waynesburg R.D.3. house 
and lot, no consideration. 

Snow Much Fun 
Along with the rest of southwestern Pennsylvania, a winter 
storm dumped an average of five inches of snow on Greene 
County Wednesday. Beverly Hamilton, of Rogersville, checks 
the depth of snow on the roof of her car in Waynesburg. And 
in one of the Waynesburg Common Parks , 5-year-old Allison 
Behm finds the sled riding just fine while her 2-year-old 
brother, David, looks on. They are the children of Chuck and 
Kim Behm, of Waynesburg. 

West Greene Obeying Curriculum Rules 
By Christie Molzon , Staff Writer 

ROGERSVILLE - The West Greene School 
District is complying with new state curriculum 
requirements, it was reported at a short meeting of 
the board Thursday night. The meeting was re­
cessed until Thursday, Jan. 26, at 7:30 p.m. 

Superintendent Paul Polink informed the board 
that at a Dec. 14 meeting of the state Board of 
Education new curriculum regulations (Chapter 5) 
were approved . They will become effective in 
September 1985 and will be phased into the educa­
tional program over a four-year period. Therefore, 
the 1989 graduating class will be the first class 
affected by the changes which , among other re­
quirements, call for an increase in math and 
science subjects. 

Polink said the district is currently rewriting 
graduation requirements for its students and will 
make them public at a later date. 

For the second time, the board failed to approve 
adding a former teacher in the district to its 
substitute teachers ' list. 

By a 5-4 vote, the board failed to add Karen Lees 
to the list. Mrs. Lees , who had been a full-time 
substitute English teacher in the high school , had 
later applied for the position but was not hired . 

The vote brought a few harsh words from a 
couple of board members who urged that the 
woman's competence as a teacher be considered 
above all else. However , board President Rick 
Barnhart said , " She came to the board meeting one 
night and I don 't think she conducted herself 
properly ." 

"There's not enough good teachers available, so 
eliminating them for reasons not having to do with 
their teaching ability is a shame," Anne Bower 
said. 

Approved to the list were John Coss of Waynes­
burg, certified in Industrial arts ; Walter Atalski of 
Carmichaels, chemistry and math ; and Barbara 
Sligar of Cameron Star Route, elementary educa­
tion . 

By a narrow vote the board approved a three-day 
unpaid leave of absence for Merriam Ankrom to 
take a trip. The board approved the leave on 
Polink's recommendation that the trip had educa­
tional merit and was the first the woman had 
requested in 10 years of teaching. 

The board failed to approve a colorguard spon­
sor and It was suggested that Band Director Ron 
Jesso make a recommendation on the matter. 

In response to a question from Arden Melzer, 
elementary school Principal Bill Throckmorton 
noted It is left to the individual bus driver to decide 
which bus route should taken when the roads are 
snow covered. Any problems, he noted , should be 
reported to the superintendent who would then 
inform the bus contractors. It was noted that a car 
collided with a school bus last Friday, but Polink 
said there was little damage . 

Mllinovlch and Co. were retained to examine 
cash transactions of the Central Tax Bureau for the 
past year with the district 's share to be $642-

Field trips approved were : 
., To allow 12 students to attend the Pennsylva­

nia Junior Academy of Science at California Uni-
versity Jan. 28 ; . 

., For 101 students , in grades k•3 to vis it the 
Pittsburgh Zoo In May ; 
~ For grades four and five to go to Oglebay Park 

In Wheeling in May ; 
~ For the varsity cheerleaders to attend com­

petition at the Century III Mall on Jan. 21. 

January ... 
An Ideal 

Time To Open A 
FIRST FEDERAL 
CHECKING ACCOUNT! 

CHECK THESE ADVANTAGES: 
No minimum balance required 
for our savings customers. 

Regular checking with interest 
on all your funds. 

No limit on the number of 
checks you write. 

Free CASHSTREAM ATM Banking 
with your "GREENE KEY" card. 

Friendly assistance in closing 
your present checking account. 

"COUNT ON US!" 

• HOME OFFICE WAYNESBURG _fi _,,~ 
• FAYfTTEOFflCE UNIONTOWN Jilf s tea 
::~~:~~:::~:::::~." (!J)st(jfijjeral 

I FS,UC: I 
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,<;a1·ings and loan a.c,soc1atwn 

of GREENE COUNTY 
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Waynesburg Finds Spark To Dump LaRoche 
WAYNESBURG- Intensity Is one 

Intangible coaches Just can't teach. It 
wins games and loses them but its 
sometimes magical powers aren't 
easy lo harness. 

half And led by eight points. Juniors 
Don Matthews <6·5) and Don Gruber 
( 6-6) outrebounded the Jackets and 
scored 21 points combined In the first 
half. 

It was never more evident than at 
the Waynesburg College gym 
Wednesday night. The Yellow Jack­
t>ts, ancr plodding through a sluggish 
first half, needed every bit of in­
tensity they could muster to defeat 
LaRoche, 80-67, In a District 18 game. 

But not before the Red Devils, a 
vastly Improved team from last sea­
son, could frighten Waynesburg with 

, a hustling defense and an efficient 
passing offense for a 33-28 hainime 
lead. 

LaRochc, surprisingly strong in 
the district so far this season, 
outplayed Waynesburg In the first 

But In the second half, Waynes­
burg's senior point guard, Ray Nalill, 
grabbed the offensive reins and broke 
out the Yellow Jackets' explosive fast 
break . Waynesburg outscored 
LaRoche, 12-4, to open the half and 
raced the rest of the way. 

Natili provided the intensity . 
"It's all right up here," said 

Waynesburg head coach Rudy 
Marisa, pointing to his head . "Why do 
you think guys like Lombardi and 
Noll say 80 percent of the game is 
above the shoulders. It was a matter 
of us playing in the second half when 
we decided at halftime that we may 

~ 
Observer-Reporter/Stan Diamond 

Mark Doppelheuer of Waynesburg (42) and LaRoche's Don 
Matthews (51) go up for a rebound. 

Early Showdown 
In District 18 
By Tom Rose, 0-R Sports Editor 

All right, just who is the athletic 
director al Waynesburg College? 
He's the masochist who sentenced 
the Yellow Jacket basketball team 
to play six NAIA District 18 games 
on the road in the second half of the 
season. 

And by the way, who's the ath­
letic director at Point Park College? 
He's the guy who hasn't provided a 
home game for the Pioneers since 
Dec. 17 That's eight . count 'em. 
eight straight on the road. 

Hey, wait a minute. Isn 't the 
athletic director at Waynesburg also 
the school 's head basketball coach 
Rudy Marisa? And doesn' t Jerry 
Conboy carry the dual role of basket­
ball coach and ath letic director at 
Point Park? 

Then what are these guys doing 
to themselves? They'll find out to­
night (8 p.m ) when Point Park 
concludes its eight-game journey at 
Waynesburg in a battle between the 
District 18 co-leaders 

"It's been tough but then again 
how many coaches would complain 
about being 5-1 in district games that 
have been on I.he road ," Conboy 
said, laking time out during a Super 
Bowl party to talk about his team in 
a telephone interview Sunday night 
"This is a big chance for us I against 
Waynesburg) . We 'd be in a great 
position if we cou ld win and be in 
first place. Everyone comes to our 
place in the second semester and 
after the Waynesburg game we only 
have to play at Geneva . 

" If Waynesburg wins we would 
have two losses and they 'd be in first 
place but they have some tough 
places to play yet this year " 

Waynesburg 18-4 , 5-U has a lot of 
tough places left to play m the sec­
ond half of the season, t)lanks m part 
to a late schedule switch with Point 
Park. The Yellow Jackets , after to­
night's meeting with Point Park and 
Wednesday's game against St. Vin­
cent, will have just two district home 
games left. And those opponents 
f Alliance and Pitt-Bradford) won ' t 
appear at College Gym until the 
Jackets finish a grueling six-game 
district road stretch. 

"We've got a tough road ahead ," 
Marisa said . " After this week we'll 
be going to places like Pitt-Brad­
ford , St. Vincent and LaRoche. all of 
them teams that could win the dis­
trict. But I tried to impress upon the 
team to try and abide by one of the 

RUDY MARISA 
ancient rules of sports and take 
things one at a lime." 

Point Park (9·6 overall) ap­
peared to be on the verge of falling 
out of district contention with the 
academic ineligibility of center 
Perry Dickens. The Pioneers were 
beaten soundly at Pitt-Bradford and 
lost at West Liberty but rebounded 
with a brilliant effort in a 77-65 
victory at Westminster . 

"That was one of the most satis­
fying wins we've had," Conboy said. 
" If we would play all of our district 
games like that we'd be hard to beat, 
the players Just did a super job. And 
1t came at a big time for us, we had 
lost to Pitt-Bradford and West Lib­
erty and we were going through an 
adiustment period with the loss of 
Dickens. This win was a boost for 
our morale and our players found 
out they can still play well ." 

Jackets 96, Eagles 79 
CAMBRIDGE SPR INGS -

Waynesburg College Jumped to a 
llHl advantage early in the first half 
and continued its recent fine play 
here Saturday with a 96-79 victory 
over Alliance man NAIA District 18 
basketball game 

The Jackets were led by senior 
center Roosevelt Kirby, who scored 
22 points , while freshman Harold 
Hamlin had 19, Paul Stanley 14, Ray 
Natlli 13 and reserve Chris Bills lb 

Waynesburg held a 53-34 halftime 
lead. 

be In trouble. We went out and did it. 
"The actions weren 't that different 

but the concentration was there and 
we got the momentum rolling. The 
defense picked up and the rebounding 
improved." 

Natili not only ran the fast break, 
dishing off assists, but managed to 
pump in a game-high 28 points, while 
shooting 18 of 21 from the foul line. 

"It's like a lightswitch for them. 

Bowling 
Wade's Auto Body took four points 

from American Supply in the only 
shutout win registered in the Thurs­
day Night Classic Bowling League at 
Arbor Terrace Center. 

For the winners, Shirlene Snyder 
rolled a 184 single game and Glenda 
Engle tossed a 487 series. American 
Supply was paced by Kay Mooney 
who had a 513 series and 196 single as 
did Brenda Cole. 

Patterson Realty took three points 
from 77 Market behind the 192 single 
and 537 series of Karen Tanner . The 
losers were led by Shirley Majernik 
who rolled a 174 high game and Barb 
Berry who tossed a 497 series. 

Barna 's Furniture took three 
points from Waynesburg Milling be­
hind the 201 single of Mary Hare and 
the 558 series by Betty Seamon. For 
the losing millers, Ruth Ann Blair 
tossed a 196 single and 492 series. 

BOWLING RESULTS 
The Cougars was the only team 

to gain a shutout in Afternoon Tea 
League play this week at Arbor 
Terrace Center. 

When they start running It's hard to 
stop," said LaRoche head coach John 
Pasqulnelll. "They came out running 
In the second half and no one can 
come in here and run them off the 
floor. 

"I'm tired of watching them run so 
well and I'm tired of seeing Natlli for 
four years ... once they got rolling, we 
lost our poise and that was it." 

While Natili ran the show for 
Waynesburg, now 7-4 overall and 5-1 
in the district, in the second half, it 
was 6-5 1h Junior Paul Stanley who 
kept the Jackets close in the first half. 
Stanley scored 13 of his 17 points in 
the first against the Red Devils . 

Matthews, who finished with 21 
points and Gruber, 17, had five re­
bounds apiece in the first half and 
kept Waynesburg from more than one 
shot many times. 

"We had a good first half but didn't 
respond to some situations in the 
second," Pasquinelli said. "We tried 
to keep pushing the ball inside; 
maybe too much, because we did hit 
some outside shots. I thought we 
should have shot more outside. 

"We outrebounded them in the 
first half and were successful down 
low with the ball . I'm not disap­
pointed with the loss because I think 
Waynesburg is playing the best ball in 
the district, but I'm worried about the 
mistakes ." 

One mistake for LaRoche, now 6-7 
overall and 3-3 in the district, was not 
getting back on defense. During 
Waynesburg's comeback Natili drib­
bled the length of the court for a layup 
and senior forward Roosevelt Kirby 
( 12 points) broke free for a tremen­
dous slam dunk, giving the Jackets a 
40-37 lead. 

Observer-Reporter/Stan Dlamood 

Gertrude Krieger rolled a 178 
single and Jean M. Barnhart, a 472 
series for the winners while Joyce 
Wilson paced the Dusters with a 
185 single and 523 series. 

The Challengers took three 
points from the Horizons behind 
the 191 single of Winifred Jento 
and 465 series of Rhonda Stohon. 
Audrey Greenlee led the losers 
with a 196 single and 460 series. 

Wrestling 
Roundup 

Paul Stanley of Waynesburg drives past a LaRoche defender 
to an easy layup. 

Louise Hewitt led her Pacers 
team to a three-point win over the 
Chargers with a 170 single and 446 
series. Edith Haines topped the 
losers with a 171 single and 483 
series. 

The Citations and Firebirds 
split four points with Kim Mazur 
rolling a 165 single and 4 I 4 series 
for the Firebirds. Mary Evosirch 
led the Citations with a 244 single 
and 509 series. 

BOWLING SCORES 
Three out of four games in the 

Monday Night Women 's Bowling 
League at Arbor Terrace Center 
ended in shutout wins this week. 

Dorothy Nelson rolled a 202 sin­
gle and 555 series to pace her 
Piper's Construction team to a 
shutout of Mankey Engineering. 
Leading the losers was Connie 
Vernon who rolled a 202 single and 
a 503 series . 

Trempus Insurance took four 
points from Fairmont Supply be­
hind the 193 single of Karen Tan­
ner and the 542 series of Jan Rob­
inson. Sue Musgrave paced the 
losers with a 170 single and 468 
series. 

Mariner-Milliken Funeral 
Home took four points from 
Hopkins & Son behind the efforts of 
Donna Knisely who tossed a 201 
single and 559 series . For the 
losers, Mary Hopkins rolled a 173 
single and Nancy Simmons, a 399 
series. 

Baily Insurance took three 
points from the Cokettes with 
Betty Seamon leading the way 
with a 213 single and 546 series. Big 
gun for the Coke team was June 
Stewart with a 199 smgle and 513 
series. 

Boys 
Basketball 

Coug~rs 34, Maples 29 
MAPLETOWN - Charleroi High 

School's wrestling team held off a 
furious rally by Mapletown Friday 
night to come away with a 34-29 win in 
Section 8-AA. 

Mapletown won early and late, 
taking the first two of three and last 
four . Mickey Yanak (98 ), Ron Dils 
(112), George Chory (155), Tom 
Pekar (167), Chris Homistek (185) 
and heavyweight Brian Smith added 
victories for the Maples . 

Charleroi , 44 in the section and 2-3 
overall, got wins from Gordie 
Watkins (105), Dave Stablein (119), 
Bill Umbel (126), Skip Campbell 
(132 ), Jesse Hewitt (138) and Eric 
Schultz (145). 

Rockets 57, Mikes 3 
JEFFERSON - Winning all but 

one bout , Jeff-Morgan High School's 
wrestling team grabbed a 57-3 win 
over Carmichaels Friday in Section 8-
AA action. 

Joe Yanick (98), John Jento (105!, 
Ed Janko (112), Alan Yanak (126), 
Lee Nelson ( 132), Dave Gamble ( 138 !, 
Allen Hager (145), Jeff Hill (155) , Rod 
Perkins (167), Tim Starostanko ( 185 ) 
and heavyweight John Giubileo 
helped the Rockets, 4--0 in the section 
and 7-1 overall , solidify its No 3 rank­
ing in the O-R's Class AA wrestling 
poll . 

Melvin Boone ( 119) captured Car­
michaels' only bout. 

Pioneers 49, Runners 15 
YORK RUN - West Greene High 

School's wrestling team ran its Sec­
tion 8-AA record to 2-3 with a 49-15 win 
over Fair-Georges Friday. 

Picking up wins for the Pioneers . 
3-3 overall, were Kevin Huff (98), 
Doug Riffle ( 105) , Scott Durbin (112), 
Bob Simms (126 l, Kurt Jones (138 l, 
Alvie Bedillion ( 155), Rikk Walters 
(167), Dan Usher (185) and heavy­
weight Roger Stalnaker. 

College Wrestling 
Waynnbu~ Yountst~2J. 
111-Mancln/ (YSU ) pinned Hooue S: 2& 
1l6--Braln (Wbg) pinned Watera 1: 11 
134----Thomas (Y SU ) tilnne-d Bucklso 3:24 
141-Eddy (Wbg) won bv forfeit 
ISG-Romeo (WbgJ wen by torteU 
15'--Burchlanll (Wbo ) pinned Schlvt~ 

1:'7 
167-Kunl2 fWbg) won by tom!II 
in-Moreles CYSUI decisioned Mundell 

19-l (superior) 
190-Ros.s (Wbul won b y forlelt 
Hvy-8n,nol (YSU) Pinned Wrlgl'I! 2:54 

Waynesbu,...._..s Lalfela~12 
l l~ogu. (Wblll Pinned Paroffl 5:58 
126-Bnln (wt,g) won b y forfeit 
134--Bucklso (Wbg) won by forfeit 
1'2-Eddy ( wt,g ) Pinned Redman L24 
150--Cennon (Ll pinned Romea 5:41 
ISl--8urchlanfl (Wt,g) won by forfeit 
167-Ross (WbOI pinned Schwelchert 2;09 
In-Mundell (WbO) dKISIOMd Pewlowskl ,., 
190--Grube ( L) pln™!d Stevens 6·02 
Hvv-WrlgM IWbel pinned Tonkon@f1 4:34 

Wrestling 
waynubu,...._.., Mapletow~21 
98-B leir (Wbg ) olnnecl Yanak 1 ·21 

lll.S--McWUllams (Wbg ) p,nned Heltenhell 
; ]7 

112-Dils CM) doclsloned Cole 4•2 
119-Lappfng (Wbg) pinned Hellen 2;27 
126-Gltford (Wbg) won by forfeit 
ll2-Rettlnger CWt,g) olnr,ed Gullan J ·oa 
138-Shrlver (Wbgl p inned Rumble "5 
1"5---Herrod {Wbg) pinned Scolt ] ;36 
15~hory (Ml Pinned M. Brewer l : 41 
167-J . Higgins (Wbol dee: . Pekar 10-0 

(maJorJ 
18>-Homlstek IM) won by defauU over D 

Higgins Isl oeriod 
Hvv-Brlan Smith IM} won by forlell 

Raferee : Nicole lla 

Chulerol-J4 Mapletow~Jt 
98-Yenek (Ml olnned Malandra I 09 

lOS-Walklnt (Cl pinned Heltershell 1 ;GI 
112-0115 IM) pinned Ault 1 : 19 
119-Slableln (Cl OtnMd Hellen 1 10 
126-Umbel (C l pinned Julian J 27 
IJ2-Cemobell (Cl dee ltloned Rennln4er 

16-1 Cluoerlor1 
1lt-Hewltf IC) Pinned Rumble I 11 
14.S-Schultz (C l olnnecl Scott .52 
lil-ChOf'v (M) dee Amodei 9-2 
167-Pekar (M) Cle<. Calcek U -9 
18.S-Homlslek (MJ won bY forfeit 
Hvy-Smllh (M) Plnne-d HurleY 1 .36 

R.eferff : Contlantlne 

Jeff-MorH~J CarmlchHI~ 
99-J Yanlck UM) won bv forfeit 

lOS-John Jento UM) won bY lorte11 
117-Janko UM) Pinned Pratt 5 15 
I If-Boone (C) decisioned Jeff Jen10 IJMI .., 
1:1~ Yanlck JM ) Plnnecl Barno l : 57 
Ill-Nelson IJM) dee . Bruce Guesman 5-0 
lJI-Gamble (JMl dee. Barry Guesman ,, 
14.5-Hager (JM ) dee. Smllh ~ 
Ill-HIii (JM) plnM'd Lucu 1 . .0 
167-Perkln, (JMl won by forfeit 
IU--Starstanko tJMJ pinned l lglear O '8 
Hvt-Glublleo UM ) Pinned Swlfl 1 :JI 

R♦ ferH: Pelronka 

Girls 
Basketball 

Wrestling 
West GrHn ....... , F♦ lr-0eor1)tS-15 

98-Huff (WG) olnMd Thoroe l : 11 
105--R.lffle (WG) decisioned Greene 1.S-5 

(malor) 
112-Ourbfn IWG) dee . Mccourt 9-6 
119-E. Hicks (FG) dee. Scr itchfield 7.5 
126-Slmms (WGJ Pinned Dice , S5 
132-Kiulnger (FG) olnne<1 Levine 1.21 
136-Jones (WG) pinned J . Hid,1 _. :_.2 
1'.S-Mlgyaruto CFG) Pinned Bateman 1: lO 
155--Bedlllon (WG ) pinned Moldovan I :03 
167-Walters (WG J Dinned Whelan 2:24 
1~U1her CWGl p inned Metro 2:,2 
Hvv-Stalnaker tWG ) plnn«l Moran 0:32 

College Basketball 
LIR.~7 

SalCIPltk 14-2; Matthews 7-7·21 ; Gruber 
7..J..17 ; Knas.., 6-J.IS ; Martin ,-o-e; Brown 
1-2◄ ; Rivera 0-0-0: McGreth 0-0-0; Wlln 
0--0-4. Totals : 26-17(19)-67. 

WayrMSbu,.._., 
Nallll S.l&-28; ()oppelheuef- 3-2-1; Sla,,.ly 

6-S.17 ; Kirby S.2-12; Hamlin 3-1 -7; Hogue 
1).().4 ; Crawford 0-0-0 ; Folam l ().2-2; BIiis 
0-0-0; Knight l>-2-2; Starllng 0--0-0; MIiis 
0-1-1 ; Green I>-~. Totals ; 22.J6('5)-t0 

HalNlme: URoucM ll, W•YMSburtl 21 
• OfflCII II: Luvara & Tippett 

Bulldogs Pin 
Mapletown 

MAPLETOWN - Eight 
Beth-Center High School 
wrestlers delivered falls 
Thursday night as the Bull­
dogs dumped Mapletown, 55-9, 
in a Section 6-AA match to win 
their fourth section match m 
as many outings. 

qave Kriebel (98). Scott 
Rhodes (105) , Marc 
Bartolomucci (119). Rich Hart 
(126), Don Johnston (132), 
Sam Zets (138). Scott 
McGrady ( 145) and heavy­
weight Dennis Angelo all re­
corded pins for Beth Center, 
now IH overall. 

Dave Nelson ( 112) and Pete 
Keruskin (167) registered de­
cisions for the Bulldogs. 

The Maples received a de­
cision from George Chory at 
155 pounds and a fall from 
Chri,5 Homistck at 185. 

Wrestling 
Roundup 

Mikes 65, Ultlans 58 
McCLELLANDTOWN - A 19-point, second-quar­

ter burst lifted Carmichaels High School's boys 
basketball team to a 65-58 Section 19-A victory over 
German Township Friday night. 

Rockets 43, Trojans 42 
CALIFORNIA- Angie Kelly scored a game-high 

20 points to lead Jefferson-Morgan High School to a 
43-42 win over California Thursday night In a 
WPIAL Section 19-A game. 

W ayneshurg Grabs Two 

The Mikes now 11-2 overall and 5-1 in the section, 
was led by J.L. Lechner, who poured in a game-high 
34 points. He was aided by teammate Mike Melter's 
10-point effort. 

Mark Lewis paced the Uhlans' attack with 24 
points. Jim Williams pumped in 18 points for 
German Township, which falls to 4-9 overall and 3-3 
in the section. 

Maples 56, Pioneers 53 
ROGERSVILLE - Bruce Clites' 24 points paced 

Mapletown High School's boys basketball team to a 
5&-53 win over West Greene Friday in a Section 19-A 
game. 

Along with Clites, Steve Johnston chipped m 11 
points as MapletoWTI goes to 2-4 in the section and 
4-10 overall . 

George Crowley had 16 points, Joe ,Jacobs 15 and 
John Jones 10 to pace West Greene, which fall s to 0-6 
in the section and 2-11 overall . 

Trojans 69 , Rockets 35 
CALIFORNIA - Willie Tyler and Brian Konick 

tossed in 16 points apiece to helpCaliforn1a High 
School 's boys basketball team to a 69-35 win ·over 
Jeff-Morgan in a Section 19-A contest Friday niRht 

Brian Zanardelli also chipped m with 13 points as 
California raised its record in the section to 3-4 

Bob Coles threw m 15 and Bob Coles 14 as the 
Roc~ets fall to l~ in the section. 

The Rockets are now 5-7 overall and 3-4 in section 
play. California (4-9) drops to 2-5 in the section 

Leigh Hayes scored 15 points to lead the Trojans 
Jefferson-Morgan led, 25-20, at halftime and 

owned a 35-31 lead after three quarters. 

Rangers 53, Maples 39 
McDONALD - Gina Meute scored 12 points and 

pulled down II rebounds to pace Fort Cherry High 
School to an easy 53-39 win ovPr Mapletown in 
exhibit10n girls basketball action Monday night 

Amy Gardiner scored a game-high 23 pomts as 
the Rangers improve their overall record to 6-8 with 
the victory 

Carol Zehng pumped in 12 points and teammate 
Pam Sowden. 10, for the Maples. who fall to 9-5 
overall 

Sweet Wheats 47, Falcons 36 
WAYNESBURG- LeAnn Neubauer and Tammy 

McIntire teamed up for Waynesburg High School's 
girls basketball team Monday night to help defeat 
Brownsville, 47-36, ln a Section 11-AAA-AA game. 

Neubauer scored a game-high 21 points while 
McIntire added 19 for the Sweet Wheats, now 6-8 
overall and 5-3 In the section . 

Pam Brown paced Brownsvllle, now 5-9 overall 
and~~ in the section, with 16 points. 

LAKELAND, Ohio - Waynesburg College's 
wrestling team raised its record to 5-3-1 on the 
season with wins over Lakeland Communlly College 
and Youngstown State Wednesday night. 

The Yellow Jackets downed YSU, 36-23, and 
Lakeland, 45-12 

Notching double wins for Waynesburg were Todd 
Brain, at 126 pounds, Todd Eddy (142,, Steve 
Burchianti (158 >, John Kuntz ( 167) and Brian Ross 
(190). 

Grabbing single wins for Waynesburg were Mark 
Hogue (118), Rick Romeo ( 150), Mike Buckiso ( 134). 
Bill Mundell (177), and heavyweight Rusty Wright. 

Raiders Roll To Victory 
WAYNESBURG - Waynesburg Central High 

School's wrestling team rode six falls to an easy 
46-21 exhibition win over Mapletown Saturday. 

Recording the Red Raiders' pins were Scott Bl.air 
at 98 pounds, Dave McWllhams ( 105> , Jeff Lappmg 
( 119), Chuck Rettinger ( 132). Chuck Shriver (138) 
and Jack Herrod ( 145 l. 

Other winners for Waynesburg, which Is now 6-2 
on the season, were Artie Gifford ( 126) and Jeff 
Higgins ( 167) 

Maplctown's only winners were Ron Dils ( 112) , 
George Chory ( 155J. Chris Homlstek (185) and 
heavyweight Brian Smith. 
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Waynesburg Proves Point In Double OT Win 
~ Grove, O·R Spo11S St•" 

WAYNESBURG - Conch Rudy 
Marisa was playing with speed hem 
Monday night, and popular opinion ln 
the Waynesburg College locker room 
was holding that his game went a long 
way toward pushing the Yellow Jack­
ets Into the pole position in the NAIA 
District 18 race. Across the track , In 
the Point Park pits, they were dis­
agreeing. 

However, there was one thing ev­
erybody agreed on : the race was 
exciting. 

Point Park's Rich Contlo missed a 
short Jumper with five seconds left to 
play in the second overtime, and by 
the time Waynesburg 's Theron Hogue 
went speeding down the right side of 
College Gym with the rebound , the 
Yellow ,Jackets were in sole 
possession of first place, 6!Hi7 . 

"Anytime you're given the op­
portunity to run somebody out and 
you can 't do it," Marisa said , "you go 
the other way with it, slow it down. 
You never know if it's working. Even 
if they stay in a zone, you don' t know 
what it's doing to them mentally. I 
think there's a lot of psychological 
advantages to holding the ball ." 

So Waynesburg (9-4 overall and 6-1 
in district play ), a team that loves to 
run Rnd does it well, held the ball for 
periods of Monday night's game. Ray 
Natili , Waynesburg's senior point 
guard, said it worked . 

" It works, usually, against this 
team," said Natili, who scored 12 
points. " I've been here for four years 
and we've been doing it for four 
years. We run with the ball for five 
minutes or so and th~n slow it down 
for a few minutes. W~ keep changing 
the tempo back and forth and it gets 
them frustrated . They get upset when 
somebody holds the ball on them." 

Added senior center Roosevelt 
Kirby, " Sometimes you can get to 
people's heads by running like that 

Observer-Reporter/Christle Motion 

Point Park's Jim Crowley goes behind Waynesburg' s Mark 
Doppelheuer (42) for the rebound. 

and then slowing it down. I think they 
got a little rattled. " 

Pioneers' coach Jerry Conboy was 

in favor of the idea, too. 
"I didn't mind them slowing it 

down," he said. " I'm glad. Every-

Obffrver-ReporUr/Cbristte Molzon 

Harold Hamlin of Waynesburg connects on a layup in front of 
Point Park's Kelly Randolph. 

body does what they have to do, and 
Rudy had it in his mind that they had 
to pull it out to win." 

Aside from what he thought his 
game would do to the Pioneers ' psy­
che, Marisa had one very good reason 

for the slow down : Point Park can 
leap, and you can' t run without the 
ball . The Pioneers (~7 overall , l>-2 in 
district play) outrebounded Waynes­
burg, 59-48. 

"They are great, great jumpers," 
he said. "There's no question about ii . 
And they're very quick. (Junior cen­
ter Fred) Myrick may be the best 
player in the district." 

Myrick led Point Park with 19 
points and spearheaded its rebound­
ing game, which kept them in the 
running. Waynesburg, on the other 
hand, lost senior forward Mark Dop­
pelheuer when he was shaken up with 
16 :32 to play m the first half, and the 
Yellow Jackets had their hands full 
grabbing rebounds the rest of the 
way. 

Only four Waynesburg players 
scored , junior guard Paul Stanley 
leading the way with 22 points , includ­
ing the l ,OOOth of his career. Kirby 
added 18 and freshmar, forward 
Harold Hamlin 15, including nine in 
the second ha! f. 

Waynesburg trailed , 37-32, at 
haltime but ran off 12 unanswered 
points early in the second half to take 
a 46-39 lead with 14: 36 to play. The 
Yellow Jackets then slowed the tempo 
again, and the Pioneers slowly pulled 
back into the game. Senior forward 
Joe McMillan hit three crucial jump­
ers down the stretch to help Point 
Park gain a 63-63 tie at the end of 
regulation. 

Both teams managed just one field 
goal in the first five-minute overtime, 
and a field goal by Stanley and two 
free throws by Natili gave Waynes­
burg a 6~ lead with 1:22 to play in 
the second overtime. 

" I think they had to win ; we 
didn't," said Conboy. " If we win, 
we're 6-1 and everybody's chasing us 
because we're at home the rest of the 
way. Sure, now they' re 6-1 , but they 
still have to go to some pretty tough 
places yet to play." 

Stanley Settles Jackets' Score 
By Tom Rose , O·R Sports Ednor 

WAYNESBURG - He had a 
chance for a Walt Disney ending, the 
star of the night sinking a free throw 
to clinch an important victory for his 
team. 

And they all lived happily after, 
etc., etc . 

But fate wasn 't entirely kind to 
Waynesburg College junior Paul 
Stanley. For the most part it was 
indeed a game for him to remember 
as Waynesburg edged NAIA District 
18 rival Point Park 69-67 in double 
over time here Wednesday night. 

And he eclisped the 1,000-point 
mark for his career, so that relieved a 
bit of pressure and brought a slight 
smile of satisfaction. 

But there's that missed free throw, 
with 14 seconds left in the second 
overtime, that continued to stick with 
him after the team's celebration 
which began when Point Park 's Rich 
Condo missed a lf>-foot jumper with 

five seconds left. 
It could have prevented the 

Pioneers ' bid for a third extra period 
but Condo's erratic shot suddenly 
made Stanley 's shortcoming quite in­
sigruficant. 

To everyone but Stanley . 
" I think I pulled up a little short, I 

didn 't follow through with my hand," 
Stanley said , trying to explain his 
attempt while teammates passed by 
to glad-hand their teammate. "That 
bothers me because I hadn 't missed 
one all night, I was six-for-six." 

Stanley had an earlier opportunity 
to provide a storybook ending , as his 
jumper from deep in the right corner 
rolled in and out of the basket at the 
end of the firs t overtime period. 

" We went to Paul in the overtime, 
he can end it all if anyone out there on 
the floor can," Waynesburg head 
coach Rudy Marisa said. "Yes, we 
were working to get him the ball, he's 
a streak shooter but unfortunately it 
didn 't go in ." 

Stanley is no stranger though to 
pressure or the hero's role. In one of 
the most memorable finishes in dis­
trict small college history, he scored 
four points in four seconds against 
Pitt-Bradford in last year's NAIA 
playoffs to save Waynesburg's bacon 
and send the game into overtime. 
From there, the Jackets rolled to 
victory. 

"Other than last year's Pitt-Brad­
ford game, this is the most exciting 
one I've ever played in ," Stanley said. 
"Every time I think about that game I 
have to think someone other than us 
had a hand in helping us win. We must 
have had a little help upstairs." 

In that hectic finish Stanley picked 
up a loose ball and tossed ii in the 
basket from 22 feet and then , when 
Pitt-Bradford's Lorenzo Newsome in­
explicably inbounded the basketball , 
Stanley charged after it and was 
fouled while rolling on the floor. The 
scoreboard clock showed O: 00. 

" When I went to the foul line 1 saw 

Scoring Leaders 
By John Barker, O·R Sports Staff 

The banner hangs on the wall 
over the gymnasium .. . a reminder 
of the good times just three years 
ago. 

The banner reads: Immacula te 
Conception, 1979-80 WPIAL Section 
S-AA Champs. It was a year when 
the high school 's boys basketball 
team grabbed rebounds, headlines 
and a section championship along 
with the imagination of the Washing­
ton community . 

Things have definitely changed 
for the Comets since then. The team 
suffered the cruel fate of following 
the school 's greatest success, which 
saw IC win 22 games before bowing 
to Clairton, 69-47, in the WPIAL 
quarterfinals. 

But one thing is still the same. 
!C's gym houses one of the highest 
scorers in the WPIAL, just as it did 
in that magic season. 

In 1979-80, it was point guard Ray 
Natili who sparked a ta ll and tal­
ented IC team with a 26.5 average 
This year 's version of the Comets, 
while no longer a section power , has 
another prolific scorer in Ed Tutay. 

Tutay, a 6-0 senior , has scored 397 
points this season for a 24.8 average, 
which is second in the Washington­
Greene county scoring race. 

Carmichaels' J .L, Lechner 1s still 
No. 1 with a 29.8 average while Bur­
gettstown 's Glenn Brady (21.4) has 
moved from sixth to third in one 
week. 

"There really isn't much com­
parison between them. '.('hey are 
different types of players because of 
the cast they played with," IC head 
coach Tom Drakeley, a former 
player at the school, said of Natili 
and Tutay. 

"Natili played on a great team 
that could let h,m score eight or 10 
points one game and still win. He 
didn't have au the pressure. Other 
teams think if they shut Ed and John 
Fincham down, they can get any 
easy win. That makes Ed try and do 
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too much." 
And that 's Tutay's biggest prob­

lem, according to Drakeley 
" He gets very frustrated when he 

doesn' t score. He doesn't realize that 
he can still have a good game by 
passing and doing all the other 
thmgs well The hardest thing to 
teach him is to forget a mistalft and 
get back m the game. He's Just 
having a hard time realizing 1t," 
Drakeley said 

Some of Tutay's frustra tion may 
come from playing on a young team 
where center John Fincham is the 
only other starting senior . IC is 6-11 
overall and 0-7 in Section 18-AA-A. 

"The talent has dropped here, to 
a degree," Drakeley said . "The in­
terest is what has really dropped. 
Kids don 't play basketball all year 
round and that 's when you improve 
the most, in the summer. Ed played 
summer league a t the YMCA and up 
here when we opened up the gym on 
nights . That helped him a lot be­
cause he needed bigger and better 
competition . I'm not sure how much 
he got, though. 

" He plays every position for us. 
He's a ballhandler, plays guard , for­
ward and rebounds. He has lo do a 
lot." 

Tutay has adjusted fairly well 
though, playing varsity ball only two 
years. He transfer red from Trinity 
to IC his sophomore season and 
didn ' t play until he was a jumor, 
averaging 23 points . This year, he 
has been harassed on offense be­
cause most teams play box-and-one 
and double-team defenses on him. 

" I try to put the pressure out of 
my mind," Tutay said at !C's prac­
tice Monday. "I've been a scorer so I 
expect the defenses now. I just try to 
get open and drive to the basket. 
Most teams know I drive a lot so now 
they stand back and try to draw the 
charge. I try to hi t the jumper when 
I can. 

"We don't get much publicity 
here because we have a bad record, 
but we have a young team. My jump 
shot has been off the last couple 
ga mes and the younger guys have 
been coming through to help " 

With hJs high scoring, Tutay re­
sembles Nalih , who 1s now the start­
ing point guard at Waynesburg Col­
lege as a senior. Tu tay has watched 
Natlli since he was m seventh grade. 

" I used to watch him when they 
played Wash High," Tutay said " He 
was my favorite player because I 

everybody staring at me," he said. '' I 
got the feeling that if I missed one, 
they would strangle me after the 
game. 

" That's why I felt so confident 
tonight after what I went through last 
year . Then I go out and miss it. " 

But his teammates were more 
than willing to forget about his miss. 
They owe him one anyway for last 
year's miracle, and with nearly a 
season and a half left in his college 
career, Stanley is likely to provide 
plenty of points and thrills for the 
Jackets. 

" I'm feeling confident now with 
my shooting because the team is play­
ing well. I becoming more confident 
along with them," Stanley said. " It 's 
hard to feel good about yourself if the 
team doesn' t feel good about itself. " 

After Wednesday night's pulsating 
victory over Point Park, the Yellow 
Jackets feel quite well , thank you. 

And they 've already forgotten 
about Paul Stanley's missed free 
throw. 

liked the way he drove to the basket 
and played good defense." 

But the similarities end there. 
Orakeley isn' t sure Tutay is good 
enough for college basketball while 
Tutay says he's interested in basket­
ball or baseball. 

" I wasn't a big scorer when I 
used to play for North Franklin . Tim 
O'Connor ( now a starting forwa rd 
for Trinity ) was But I s tarted to 
score early in high school and now I 
would like to play in college." 
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Paul Stanley drives for two points en route to reaching the 
1,000-point plateau. 

Scholastic Roundup 
Falcons 78 , Ra.id ers 6 5 

WAYNESBURG - Falling behind 
by 13 points in the firs t quarter can 
pose a ser ious problem in a basketba ll 
game. 

That'~ what happened to Waynes­
burg High School here Tuesday night 
and it cost the Raiders dearly m a 
78-65 loss to Brownsville. 

The Raiders, now 7-10 overall and 
3-5 m the section, cut the deficit to 
seven points m the third quarter but 
could pull no closer 

Ron Mills led Waynesburg with 19 
points whi le Roger Fox added 11 
Doug Jackson led Brownsville. now 
7-3 in the league and 8-8 overall , with 
24 points while S::il Wallace addf.'ci 21 

WG Conquers Charleroi 
CHARLEROI - Holding Charleroi 

to Just three wins, West Greene High 
School's wrestling team managed a 
50-18 win over the Cougars in a Sec­
tion 8-AA match 

Gaming v1ctoriPs for West Greene , 
3-3 in the section and 4.3 overa ll , were 
Kevin Huff 1981. J im Scritchfie ld 
(112J. Bob s,ms ( 126 J, Kurt ,Jones 
( t32J , Roger Bateman 11451 , Alvie 
Bedlllion I 155). Rlkk Wailers (1671 . 
Dan Usher ( t 85 J amd heavyweight 
Roger Stalmaker 

College Basketball 

Gators 72, Mikes 60 
CONNELLSVILLE - A 3f>-27 edge 

in the second half powered Geibel 
High School's boys basketball team to 
a 72-60 win over Carmicheals Tuesday 
in a Section IS-A game. 

John Sofon c had a team-high 19 
pomls while Chip Kissinger added 18, 
Doug Omatick 13, Greg Loni11ro 12 
and Greg Krofcheck 10 for Geibel. 6-1 
,n the section and 12-4 overall 

J .L. Lechner , the Washi ngton­
Greene County scoring leader, had 26 
points while Jam ie Yarish tossed m 14 
to pace the Mikes 15~2, t t-31 

Uhlam 56 , Pioneers 4 0 
ROGERSVILLE - Mark Lewis 

and John Williams combined for 46 of 
GermRn Township's 56 points to pace 
the Uhlans to a 56-40 win over West 
Green~ ,n a Section IS-A contest Tues· 
day 

Lewis tossed ,n a game-high 24 
while Williams added 22 as the Uhlans 
raised their section mark to 4-3 and 
OVl' ra ll record to f>-9 . 

Nick Pablonls had 14 for West 
Greene 10-7, 2-13J. 

Maples 78 , R<wg prs 68 
MAPLETOWN - Five Maplctown 

High School players fm1shed in double 
figures here Tuesday night as the 
Maples defeated Fort Cherry 78-68 in 
an exhibition boys basketball ga me 

Terry Miller led Mupletown, now 
5 12 overall , with 18 points while 
Bruce Clites and Steve Johnston had 
tJ each, Doug MIiier 12 and Jrn, 
Malinsky 11 

.Joe Phill is ,cored 23 points to lead 
Fort Cherry, now 3 IO overa ll , while 
Paul Clemons added 20 
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Greene County Obituaries 
Ednu Morodol·k Long 

Edna Moredock Long, of Carmi• 
chaela, died Saturduy, January 21 , 
1984, In Greene County Memorial Hos• 
pita! 

She was born January 17, 1896, at 
Jefferson , a daughter of George end 
!do Dowlin Moredock. Her husband, 
Reed M. Long, died in 1937. 

Mrs. Long was a member of the 
Jefferson Baptist Church and was 
affiliated for 60 years with the Greene 
Valley Presbyterian Church, Carmi­
chaels, where she was a member of 
the Ladles Circle. She was also a 
member of the Carmichaels Area 
Womens Civic Club, charter member 
of the Ladles Auxiliary to the Carmi­
chaels VFW Post, and Ideal Chapter 
123, Order of the Eastern Star, Ma• 
sontown. 

Robert Roberts 
Word has been received by Mr. 

and Mrs. John Grim of Greensburg, 
formerly of Sycamore, of the unex­
pected death of their son-In-law, Rob­
ert R. Roberts of 2304 Park Street, 
Jacksonville, Fla. on Sunday, Jan. 15, 
1984, In St. Vincent Medical Center. 

A life-long resident of Jackson­
ville, he was a member of St. John's 
Cathedral, Temple Masonic Lodge 
and Morocco Temple of the Shrine. 

He Is survived by his wife Dortha 
Grim Roberts, two daughters, a son, a 
brother and a sister. 

Funeral services were held in 
Jacksonville with burial in Green­
lawn Cemetery. Mr. and Mrs. Wil­
liam Beaker of Greensburg, brother­
in-law ad sister of Mrs. Roberts, at­
tended the funeral services. 

Joseph Fordyce Jr. Mrs. Long was a past Greene 
County Auditor and served as a life 
insurance agent during World War II. 

Surviving are one daughter, Mrs . 
Joseph (Elma) Kantorik, of 
Brookpark, Ohio ; four sons, Paul M. 
Long, Wayne M. Long, and Robert E. 
Long, i!ll of Carmichaels. and Louis 
R. Long, of Rices Landing ; 11 grand• 
children and six great-grandchildren ; 
and one sister, Mabel Sharpnack, of 
Carmichaels. 

_ Joseph J . Fordyce Jr., 69, of 20 
West Lincoln Street, Waynesburg, 
died al 2 p.m. Thursday, January 19, 
1984, in Greene County Memorial Hos­
pital of an apparent heart attack. 

Deceased In addition to her hus­
band are one sister , Elma Moredock 
and one brother. William Moredock. 

W odea K. Lewis 
Wodea K. Lewis, 73 , of Waynes­

burg R.D.4 , died Thursday, January 
19, 1984, in the Oakland Vetera_ns 
Hospital , Pittsburgh, following an ill­
ness of two months. 

She was born August 23, 1910, al 
Hornell, N.Y., a daughter of James 
and Lotife Alberts Lewis. Miss Lewis 
had never married. 

She was a retired U.S. Army nurse 
and served in both the European and 
Pacific areas during World War II. 

Miss Lewis had resided at W aynes­
burg since 1965. She was a member of 
the Syrian Orthodox Church, al 
Bridgeville ; a life member of 
Waynesburg VFW Post 4793 ; and 
Daughters of America . 

Surviving are one sister. Elizabeth 
Bowling, of New Briton. Conn.; and 
several nieces and nephews. 

Deceased are two brothers, Albert 
G. apd Dr. L.J . Lewis. 

Three Men Rob 
Service Station 

WAYNESBURG - Police 
throughout the area were alerted at 10 
p.m. Friday to be on the lookout for 
three men who robbed the Greenwood 
service station in Jefferson. 

They were described as three 
young black males , possibly armed 
with a .38-caliber revolver. Police 
said they drove west on Route 188 in a 
green car , with a red door on the 
passenger side, believed to be an 
older type Oldsmobile Cutlass or 
Chevrolet Mailbou. 

Coats Taken 
WAYNESBURG - Two leather 

coats, one of them containing a calcu­
lator and checkbook, were taken from 
The Jury Box restaurant on South 
Washington Street, Waynesburg, at 1 
a .m. Thursday. 

Value of the stolen items was 
placed at $400. 

Dog Is Stolen 
DILLINER - A six-month-old 

Doberman pinscher was reported sto­
len from its owner Tuesday between 
3:30 and 4 p.m. in Dunkard Township. 

State police said Edna Frances 
Prescock of Dilliner R.D.l reported 
the black dog with brown hair on its 
chest was coaxed into a vehicle which 
then drove away. 

The theft occured adjacent to 
township road 317 and the dog is 
valued at $250. 

He was born January 2, 1915, in 
Mt. Morris to Joseph M. and Rebecca 
Rice Fordyce. 

He spent his entire life in the 
Waynesburg area and was affiliated 
with the United Methodist Church. He 
was a social member of James Far­
rell Post 330, American Legion. A 
laborer, he was employed by the late 
Roy E. Furman in the construction 
trade for many years . 

Surviving are his wife Freda Criss 
Fordyce ; a daughter Arnetta of 
Uniontown; a son, Jerry of Carmi­
chaels ; several grandchildren ; five 
sisters , Mrs. Flora Herrod and Mrs. 
Mary Pyles of Waynesburg; Mrs . 
Margaret Callahan in Ohio ; Mrs. Ol­
ive Fox of Clarksville and Mrs. 
Josephine Kerns of Warren, Ohio and 
four brothers, Minor and George of 
Waynesburg, Hartford of Munhall 
and Miller of Clarksville R.D. l. 

Deceased are a sister Edith and 
two brothers, James and Richard. 
J. Uoyd Kerr 

J . Lloyd Kerr, 81 , of 56 Montgom­
ery Avenue, Waynesburg died at 6:30 
a .m. Thursday, January 19, 1984, in 
Greene County Memorial Hospital 
following an extensive illness. 

He was born October 4, 1902, in 
Aleppo Township near New Freeport 
to George and Hulda Burge Kerr . 

Most of his life was spent in the 
Waynesburg area. During his early 
life he was a rig builder in the oil 
fields of New Mexico, Oklahoma and 
Illinois. 

He was affiliated with the Oak 
View United Methodist Church and 
was active in church affairs. A vet­
eran of World War II, he served with 
the SeaBees in the South Pacific. He 
was a member of the Waynesburg 
Sportsman's Club and the Loyal Or­
der of Moose, Lodge 461 in Waynes­
burg. 

Following his separation from the 
service and until his retirement, he 
was also employed at several high­
way construction projects. 

Surviving are his wife, Josephine 
Guesman Kerr, whom in married 
June 16, 1964 ; a sister, Mrs. Ray 
(Louie) Campbell of Waynesburg 
R.D. 4 and a brother, Dorwin Kerr of 
Waynesburg R.D. 4. 

Deceased are a sister, Delcie 
Kerns and a brother, Samuel Kerr. 
Raymond Arthur Rich 

Raymond Arthur Rich, 86, of 2761 
North Cypress Road , Pompano 
Beach, Fla ., formerly of Greene 
County, died Thursday, January 19, 
1984. 

Mr. Rich was the son of Milton L. 
and Carrie Locke Rich , who were 
residents of Rices Landing. 

Surviving are his wife, Elizabeth 
McCarthy Rich , daughter of Mrs . G. 
R. McCarthy, of Havertown ; three 
grandchildren and four great-grand­
children ; and one brother , Bennett M. 
Rich , of Waynesburg. 

Services were held Monday, Janu­
ary 23, 1984, at Havertown. 

Assess Plants 
Before Pruning 

February is usually the time 
homeowners think about pruning 
their ornamentals. 

Pruning ··when the knife is sharp" 
can cause more harm than good. 
Before pruning, consider the plant to 
be pruned and what you want lo 
accomplish . 

The purpose of pruning is to re­
move unwanted growth. Develop a 
system to accomplish four or five 
major objectives. 

First, remove all dead wood or 
parts of plants severely damaged by 
disease or insects. Second, remove 
parts of plants injured by weather 
conditions. The severe sterms of last 
summer resulted in damaged or bro­
ken limbs. Third, rejuvenate older 
plants by removing older stems and 
branches to encourage vigorous new 
growth to take their place. This is 
often overlooked when nialntaining 
hedges. 

Fourth , prune to produce more or 
better flowers or fruit. Fifth , prune to 
maintain or develop a desired size or 
form . 

Site selection is most important. 

Dehorning stately elms and maples to 
contain their size is unattractive and 
will drastically reduce their life. 
Select the proper shrubbery for the 
allotted space. 

Late January and February is an 
excellent time to make corrective 
pruning in shade trees. Wounds over 
two inches in diameter can be painted 
with the appropriate tree wounds 
dressing , if desired . 

Prune spring-flowering shrubbery 
after they bloom this spring. For 
example, forsythia should be pruned 
in late April or early May. Shrubs 
planted for their fruit should be 
pruned before growth starts in the 
spring. 

Evergreens can be pruned any 
time, but major pruning should be 
done In the winter. Pruning ever­
greens to maintain shape is best in 
late June or early July 

Delay pruning fruit trees until 
mid-March, particularly young trees. 
Stone fruits such as peadi should 
remain unpruned until they bloom. 

Contact the extension office for 
additional information on pruning 
trees and shrubs . 

Victor Miorauza 
Victor Mloranza, 65, of Beaver, 

formerly of Carmichaels, died at 
10 :50 p.m. Sunday, January 22, 1984, 
In Beaver County Medical Center fol­
lowing a long illness. 

Born July 6, 1918, in Masontown, 
he was a son of Angelo and Caroline 
Mioranza. 

For many years he was employed 
by Michael Baker & Associates as a 
construction superintendent and later 
with the Beaver County Area School 
District. He lived In Carmichaels for 
many years and in Beaver for the 
past 14 years. 

He was a member of Park United 
Presbyterian Church, Beaver, and 
served as a deacon and former 
trustee. A member of F&AM Valley 
Lodge 459 In Masontown. He was 
active in the Tall Cedars of Lebanon, 
Coudersport Consistory. 

Surviving are his wife, Wilma Rex 
Mloranza, whom he married October 
4, 1947; a daughter, Mrs. Thomas 
(Marcia) Lynch of Bethel Park; a 
granddaughter, Kelly Shannon Lynch 
of Bethel Park, and four sisters, Mrs. 
Louis (Emma) Valli of Waynesburg, 
Mrs. Mary Speggen of Masontown 
and Mrs. Eva Bushick and Mrs. 
Joseph Frascarelli, both of Carmi­
chaels. 

Two sisters, Stella Shlosky and 
Nora Frasconi, and a brother, 
Joseph, are deceased. 

Harriet Headlee 
Harriet Pearl Headlee, 82, of Mt. 

Morris, died at 1 a.m. Saturday, Janu­
ary 21, 1984, in Monongalia General 
Hospital, Morgantown, W.Va. 

She was born February 16, 1901, in 
Brock, a daughter of Kelsey and Ida 
Kiger Connor. Her husband, Edward 
F. Headlee, is deceased. 

Mrs. Headlee resided all her life in 
the Mt. Morris area and was a former 
Perry Township tax collector. She 
was a member of Shannon Run 
United Methodist Church. 

Surviving are a sister-in-law, Mrs. 
Zelma Connor, and several nieces and 
nephews. 

Two brothers, Robert and 
Clarence Connor, and a sister, Grace 
Patterson, are deceased. 

Services were held Monday with 
interment in Cedar Grove Cemetery, 
Mt. Morris. 

William McKerrihan 
William M. McKerrihan, 87, of 324 

South Washington Street, Waynes­
burg , formerly of Graysville, died at 
10:15 p.m. Wednesday, January 18, 
1984, following a long illness. 

He was born July 7, 1896, in Rich­
hill Township, a son of Joseph C. and 
Lucy Archer McKerrihan. On Sep­
tember 5, 1917, he married Mae 
Nelson , who died June 18, 1976. 

Mr. McKerrihan was a retired em­
ployee of Columbia Gas Transmission 
Co. and a member of its Quarter 
Century Club. He also was a member 
and past deacon of Harmony Presby­
terian Church. 

Surviving are one daughter , 
Lucille Kubicar of Fredericktown ; 
one brother, Charles W. McKerrihan 
of New Philadelphia, Ohio ; and sev­
eral nieces and ne,Phews. 

Thomas L. Cole 
Thomas L. (Shader ) Cole , 86, of 

283 West Lincoln Street, Waynesburg 
died at 3:45 a .m. Friday, January 20, 
1984, following a long illness . 

He was born June 7, 1897, in 
Kuhntown to Henry and Mary Ellen 
Main Cole. 

Most of his life was spent in 
Waynesburg. He was a member of the 
Mt. Zion Methodist Church and for 34 
years was employed by Columbia Gas 
Company having retired in 1961. He 
was a member of the Quarter Century 
Club of Columbia Gas . 

Surviving are his wife, Mabel Cole, 
whom he married August 24 , 1923 ; a 
sister, Eva Cole of Waynesburg and 
also several nieces and nephews. 

Deceased are four sisters, Alice 
Phillips, Della Lapping, Etta Hen­
derspn and Bertha Henderson. 

Matilda Newel Cosgray 
Matilda Newel Cosgray, 88, of 

Waynesburg, died at 5:30 p.m. Satur­
day , January 21 , 1984, in her home 
following a long illness . 

She was born December 13, 1895, 
at Fenton, Iowa, a daughter of Frank 
C. and Mary Dreyer Newel. On June 
1, 1924, she married Paul Ross Cos­
gray, who died July 5, 1958. 

She had lived most of her life at 
Waynesburg where she was a mem­
ber of the First United Methodist 
Church. She was also a member of 
Emerald Chapter 135, Order of the 
Eastern Star, the Mothers Study 
Club, and Lady Greene Garden Club. 

Mrs . Cosgray was a graduate of 
Highland Park College, Des Moine, 
Iowa, and had taught school in both 
North Dakota , and Montana. She had 
also been employed for over 15 years 
with the Ure~ne County Board of 
Assistance. 

Surviving are one son, Robert H. 
Cosgray, of Utica , Mich ; three 
granddaughters, Cheryl Bowman, of 
Chatsworth, Calif. , Myra Deane 
Sonsara, Utica, Mich., and Mary 
Margaret Cosgray, al home ; four 
great-grandchildren ; two sisters , Syl­
via Barns, of Fedhaven, Fla ., and 
Lewella Newel , of Chicago, JII.; and 
two nieces. 

Deceased in addition to her hus­
band are one s ister , Florence 
Ditsworth, and one brother, Emil J . 
Newel. 

Ol>le"or-Roponer 
Eugene Thompson, left, presents a certificate of appreciation to Paul Loar, third from left. 
Also pictured are his wife, Kathleen, and Clyde Robison. 

ASCS Director To Retire 
WAYNESBURG- Paul E. Loar of 

Waynesburg R.D.2 will retire Friday, 
Jan. 20, after more than 24 years 
service as executive director of the 
Greene County office Agricultural 
Stabilization and Conservation Ser­
vice. 

A surprise dinner held in his honor 
Tuesday evening at Rohanna's Res­
taurant was attended by members of 
the county and local ASC committees, 
as well as by regional and state of­
ficials of the agency, which is a part 
of the U.S. Department of Agricul-
ture. · 

Eugene Thompson, ASCS state ex­
ecutive director, presented him with 
a certificate of appreciation and John 
J . Johnston, president of the Pennsyl­
vania Association of County Office 
Employees, presented him with an 
honorary membership in the national 
ACOE. 

During his many years as ex-

Assembly 
Candidate 

WAYNESBURG-G. Ronald Hall 
of Waynesburg R.D.2 has announced 
he is a Republican candidate for gen­
eral assembly in District 50, which 
emcompasses Greene County and 
parts of Washington and Fayette 
County. 

A long-time resident of Greene 
County, he is the owner of the 
Waynesburg Auto Center at 110 Bill 
George Drive. 

He is married to the former J ac­
quelene O'Rourke, daughter of Fran­
cis and Freida O'Rourke. They are 
the parents ofa daughter, Francine, a 
junior at Waynesburg Central High 
School. 

The son and grandson of retired 
coal miners, Hall says he understands 
the problems facing today's mining 
families as well as the tough business 
situations encountered by the produc­
ers . 

In making his announcement, Mr. 
Hall said, " I intend to be a full-lime 
legislator and hope to be able to help 
locate much-needed new businesses 
in Greene County which are so neces­
sary for our community 's growth and 
prosperity. I would like to see some 
high technology businesses open here 
as well as additional small businesses 
of all kinds as we really need diver­
sification in our district. 

"As a taxpayer, I feel it is impor­
tant for me to try to do something 
about the current tax situation. I 
became very disturbed after being 
informed that the state Unemploy­
ment Compensation Fund was in seri­
ous financial condition and that the 
legislature has chosen to raise both 
employer and employee contribu­
tions, then shortly thereafter found 
funds available to increase their own 
salaries. It was not a small increase , 
but an increase that was more than 
some families in this area make per 
year. 

"The economy seems to be on the 
upswing across the country and un­
employment is down, except locally . 
We still have many unemployed and 
we are losing more businesses than 
are starting. I am very concerned 
over the economy in this district and 
would like to see more done to provide 
our district with better representa­
tion . 

" I don't intend to make promises 
or statements that cannot be kept, but 
I am going to listen to people and 
together find where the basic prob­
lems lie and what we can do both as 
individuals and myself as a public 
servent to correct them. " ' 

G. RONALD HALL 

ecutive director of the federal pro­
gram, Loar has seen many changes in 
the programs it offers to county farm­
ers, both in the area of programs 
designed to stabilize agricultural 
prices and those designed to en­
courage conservation practices on 
farms. 

effect this year are indicative of 
changes which will occur in the years 
ahead. 

"At one time cost sharing on the 
development of farm springs and the 
construction of farm ponds were our 
most popular programs," he said. " I 
would estimate that 11,000 farm 
springs were developed and many 
farm ponds were built with the help of 
ASCS funding. 

Loar, a son of the late William and 
Ella Whipkey Loar, was born near 
Wind Ridge but moved to Whiteley 
Township with his family while a boy. 
He gaduated from Waynesburg High 
School and joined the Democrat Mes­
senger as circulation manager in 
1939, returning to that position in 1945 
after four years of service in the 
Army during World War II, including 
service in Europe. He remained with 
the newspaper until he became the 
ASCS executive director in 1959. 

" Last year one farmer took advan­
tage of the spring development pro­
gram. And the cost of building a farm 
pond has risen to the point where few 
farmers can afford them. They used 
to be able to build a pond for $500. The 
last one we built cost $12 ,000." 

Loar also said that the large 
growth of the county deer herd has 
virtually eliminated the tree planting 
program since the animal destroy the 
seedlings, and that the number of 
persons in the wool incentive pro­
gram has also declined sharply from 
some 700 participants to about 200. 
"Fewer farmers are raising sheep,'' 
he said. 

He was married April 15, 1941, to 
Kathleen Waters. They have one son, 
Jerry Loar, who is also with the 
ASCS, serving as chief of the informa­
tion resources branch in Washington , 
D.C. , and two daughters, Judy, direc­
tor of education for the Associations 
of Builders and Contractors at An­
napolis, Md., and Jenny, who is em­
ployed by the First National Bank of 
Carmichaels. They have one grand­
daughter, Traci, a sophomore at 
Waynesburg Central High School. 

On the other hand, he feels that 
new programs such as the dairy in­
centive program which is going into 

Loar is a member of the Washing­
ton Street United Methodist Church, 
where he has served as treasurer of 
the Sunday School for many years . He 
is also a member of the East Franklin 
Grange and James Farrell Post 330, 
American Legion. 

GCID Contribution OK'd 
WAYNESBURG - Franklin 

Township Supervisors approved Mon­
day a $2,500 contribution to Greene 
County Industrial Development, Inc. 

Bowbly Public Library also was ap­
proved as was the $2,500 donation to 
the township's recreation board. 

- an increase of $1,000 over last year. 
Milinovich & Co. was named to 

audit Franklin Township's share of 
tax collections received by Central 
Tax Bureau. The township will pay 
$552 for the audit. 

During a brief discussion of the 
budgeted item, the supervisors cited 
the amount of revenue realized from 
businesses located in the township 
through the efforts of GCID. The mo­
tion to increase the annual contribu­
tion was passed unanimously. 

The annual $500 donation to 

At the suggestion of the township 
auditor, the board voted to formally 
adopt a budget revision calling for 
interest from the capital reserve fund 
to be used for general purposes. 

Cumberland Residents 
Want To Know 

CARMICHAELS -
The Cumberland Town­
ship Supervisors meet­
ing Thursday night was 
taken up mostly with 
questions from township 
residents concerning 
township services and 
the township employees 
pension plan. 

Mary Torok, of Nema­
colin , questioned the 
propriety of the town­
ship's employee pension 
plan saying basically the 
township should not use 
general fund money to 
purchase annuities for 
the three township su­
pervisors. She said she 
had called the Depart­
ment of Community Af. 
fairs, State Ethics Com• 
mission and other state 
agencies and had re• 
ceived this opinion. 

According to Super­
visor W1lllam Groves, 
who serves as board sec­
retary, said that the re­
tirement program has 
been in effect since 1967 
as a matching plan with 
Baltimore Life Insur­
ance Co. Groves stated 
he had checked the pen­
sion plan with the De­
partment of Community 
Affairs, the Auditor Gen­
erals office, the Associa­
tion of Township Super­
visors and all had ai>­
proved the plan. 

Township Solicitor 
William Hook told Mrs . 

· Torok the pension plan is 
proper and applies to all 
township employees. It 
also has been approved 
by the township 
auditors . He said the 
plan does apply to the 
township supervisors 
since In Cumberland 
Township they are also 
employed as township 

road managers. 
In questioning on 

other matters , Clyde 
Jeffries asked that a 
stop sign be installed on 
Township Route 662, 
known locally as the 
Rices Landing Hill road. 
He said he feels the sign 
is needed as a safely 
measure. He said that 
trucks entering the road 
from a strip mine opera­
tion may be causing a 
hazard to other motor­
ists . The supervisors 
said that they cannot 
erect signs on private 
property but agreed to 
talk to the contractor, 
Boyle Land and Fuel 
Co., about placing the 
signs . 

James Walters, repre­
senting the Crucible Vol­
unteer Fire Co., asked 
the supervisors for as­
sistance in construction 
of a playground to be 
located behind the 
Crucible fire hall. The 
supervisors agreed to 
help with grading and 
other site preparation 

Pultllc llltlc:a 

ADMINISTRATRIX NOTICE 
ESTATE OF Bellv L. Rol>-

1rt1 of W1voe1burg Borovvh 
Greene Countv. P1nnsvlvenl o11 , 
dee.eased 

Letters of 1dmlnl1tratlon 
having been granted by the 
R.egl1t1r of WIiis In end for 
GrNne County, Penn1ylv1nl1, 
on the ttflfl of the tbOYI 
named decedent, to the under• 
signed, no11ct 11 hereby given 
totll s,enon1 having cl1 lm1 or 
otm1nd1 au1ln1t the 11tat1 of 
aald dec~nt, to make known 
the .. me; and all peraona In 
dtbtld to the ,aid ff<:edent 
ere rec1unted to make PIY• 
ment wntlOut delav to 

'Vlcklt L. Barchllll 
R.0 .#4 ' 
w1vne1buro, Pa 15370 
Admlnl1tratrhc 

H. Terry Grimes 
69 s. W11hlnelon SI .. 
W1vne1buro, PA. 15310-1191 
Attorney 

1· 13,20,27 

provided that plans and 
surveys of the area are 
completed by the fire 
company. 

The supervisors reai>­
poinled three members 
to the township Parks 
and Recreation Author­
ity for five year terms. 
They are Connie Morris. 
Joan Clites and Zigmond 
Bogut. 

Public NotlCII 

LIST OF FINAL AC · 
COUNTS TO BE PRE · 
SENTED TO THE COURT BY 
AL DARNEY, CLERK OF 
THE COMMON PLEAS 
COURT, ORPHAN'S COURT 
DIVISION ON MONDAY, 
FEBRUARY 6, 191,1. 

The F i rst and Flntl Account 
ot Terry L. Blosnlch, Executor 
of the Estate of WIiiiam W. 
King, tete of Jefferson Town­
ship, GrNne Counfy, Pennsyl­
venla . 

The F irst Partlel Account of 
Josephine Denny, Joseph 0 , 
Hughes, end Farley Tooth­
man, Executors of the Last 
will end Test11ment of Helen 
Denny Howard, late of 
Waynesburg, Greene County, 
Pennsylvanla. 

The First end Flnel Account 
of Rulh F. Rendolph Admlnl1• 
tretrlx, of the Estate of Paul 
F. Randolph, late of Weynes­
buro Borovoh, Grffne County, 
Pennsvlvanle. 

The First end Flnel Account 
of Jesse L. Rlneh11rt Guardian 
of the Estate of Grace M . 
Wood, GrNne Countv Penn­
nlvenle. 
Al Oernev 
Clerk of Courts 

1-20,27 ; 2-3 
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